
BID Responsiveness and SBE Recap Form

Bid # / Name: 22-175 Annual Lawn Maintenance for County Parks Final

BOD:

Purchasing Agent: Mandy Mullins Via: John Morris/Jason Maurer

Local Adjusted Signed Sub Drug AC Public

Vendor Bid Award Bid SBE SUB GFE Bid Cont Free GMW Record

(Y/N) Price ** $ (Y/N) % Opt # % $ Form #1 Form Form Y/N Exp

Corey's Lawn Service Y $3,520.00 $3,520.00 N 0% 2 0% $0.00 Y N N/A N/A Y Y Y
DFW Submitted but not signed.  Not Submitted Responsible Agent Form, 

Bidders Questionnaire,

DMC Landscaping & Mowing Y $1,950.00 $1,950.00 N 0% 2 0% $0.00 Y Y N/A N/A Y Y Y Documents Submitted in word/CONVERTED TO PDF BY PUR

Gainesville lawnscaping/Jackrel Enterprises, LLC Y $12,945.00 $12,945.00 N 0% N/A 0% $0.00 Y Y N/A N/A Y Y Y EXHIBIT D NOT COMPLETE (DO ALL THE WORK)

Green Maintenance & Cleaning, Inc. N $4,315.38 $4,315.38 N 0% 2 0% $0.00 Y Y N/A N/A Y Y Y

SLC Ocala LLC N $3,988.75 $3,988.75 N 0% 2 0% $0.00 Y N/A N/A Y Y Y

Southern Lawn Care Mid FL N $3,450.00 $3,450.00 N 0% 2 0% $0.00 Y Y N/A N/A N Y Y Drug Free Form not submitted

TCC Enterprise Inc N $16,401.00 $16,401.00 N 0% 2 0% $0.00 Y Y N/A N/A Y Y Y

LBS Services na $0.00 $0.00 N/A N/A N/A 0% $0.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
BLANK BID DOCUMENTS Submitted in DEMANDSTAR (NON 

RESPONSIVIE)

$0.00 $0.00 0% $0.00

$0.00 $0.00 0% $0.00

$0.00 $0.00 0% $0.00

Wednesday, June 23, 2021

SBE Participation

Vendor Name CommentsPrice Preference

Addendum

Acknowledge

\\prod-netapp-gm-as-fsas.tops.gdi\insite_data_prod\files\ALAC\Attachments\75c5f931-9316-4e0c-8075-cf6541ec103e



22-175 Annual Lawn Maintenance for County Parks 

Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor

 Corey's Lawn 

Service 

DMC 

Landscaping & 

Mowing

Gainesville 

lawnscaping/Jack

rel Enterprises, 

LLC

Green 

Maintenance & 

Cleaning, Inc.

SLC Ocala LLC

High Springs Boat Ramp 0.25 55.00$               NO BID $45.00 $5.43 $25.00

Cellon Oak 4 70.00$               NO BID $280.00 $86.96 $60.00

Monteocha 5 70.00$               NO BID $350.00 $108.70 $75.00

Poe Springs 30 350.00$             NO BID $2,100.00 $652.20 $750.00

Subtotal Subtotal 545.00$             $0.00 2,775.00$             853.29$             $910.00

COST PER ACRE (SECTION 3 CHANGES) 20.00$               NO BID $70.00 $21.74 $23.18

Quadrant #2

Lake Alto 13 80.00$               $175.00 $910.00 $282.62 $111.75

Santa Fe Lake 7 85.00$               $175.00 $490.00 $152.18 $111.75

Melrose Boat Ramp 0.25 50.00$               $50.00 $35.00 $5.43 $111.75

Owens-Illinois 12 140.00$             $275.00 $960.00 $260.88 $111.75

Copeland 5 140.00$             $275.00 $350.00 $108.70 $111.75

495.00$             950.00$             $2,745.00 $809.81 $558.75

COST PER ACRE (SECTION 3 CHANGES) 20.00$               $20.00 $70.00 $21.74 $15.00

Quadrant #3

Holden 1.5 50.00$               $75.00 $105.00 $32.61 $35.00

Approxi

mate 

Mowing 

Acreage

Quadrant #1

Subtotal



Lochloosa 1.5 80.00$               $175.00 $120.00 $32.61 $35.00

Kate Barns Boat Ramp formerly M.K. 

Rawlings
9 80.00$               $175.00 $540.00 $195.66 $130.00

Grove Park 3 50.00$               $125.00 $210.00 $65.22 $35.00

Earl P. Powers 7 80.00$               $175.00 $420.00 $152.18 $130.00

Cynthia Moore Chestnut 11 140.00$             $275.00 $660.00 $239.14 $130.00

480.00$             1,000.00$          $2,055.00 $717.42 $495.00

COST PER ACRE (SECTION 3 CHANGES) 20.00$               $20.00 $70.00 $21.74 $15.00

Quadrant #4

Squirrel Ridge 14 200.00$             NO BID $840.00 $304.36 $150.00

Veterans Memorial Park at Kanapaha 24 700.00$             NO BID $1,440.00 $521.76 $600.00

Watermelon Pond 3 50.00$               NO BID $210.00 $65.22 $75.00

Jonesville Park 48 1,050.00$          NO BID $2,880.00 $1,043.52 $1,200.00

2,000.00$          $0.00 $5,370.00 $1,934.86 $2,025.00

COST PER ACRE (SECTION 3 CHANGES) 20.00$               NO BID $70.00 $21.74 $22.75

GRAND TOTAL 3,520.00$     1,950.00$     12,945.00$     4,315.38$     3,988.75$     

Award Key:

Award to the Low Most Responsive

Subtotal

Subtotal



Vendor Vendor

Southern Lawn 

Care Mid FL

TCC Enterprise 

Inc

$30.00 $75.00

$95.00 $350.00

$115.00 $437.50

$350.00 $2,625.00

$590.00 $3,487.50

NO BID $87.50

$105.00 $1,137.50

$105.00 $612.50

$25.00 $75.00

$130.00 $1,044.00

$80.00 $437.50

$445.00 $3,306.50

NO BID $87.50

$50.00 $131.25



$80.00 $131.25

$115.00 $787.50

$65.00 $262.50

$115.00 $612.50

$165.00 $962.50

$590.00 $2,887.50

NO BID $87.50

$155.00 $1,057.00

$650.00 $1,812.00

$65.00 $226.50

$955.00 $3,624.00

$1,825.00 $6,719.50

NO $75.50

3,450.00$     16,401.00$     


