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October 10, 2022 

M E M O R A N D U M 

TO: Larry M. Sapp, CPPB, Procurement Manager 

VIA: Darryl R. Kight, CPPB, Procurement Supervisor 

FROM: Theodore White, Procurement Agent II 

SUBJECT: INTENT TO AWARD 
 ITB 23-15-TW Annual Purchase of Sign Material 

Solicitation Opening Date:   2:00 PM, Wednesday, August 31, 2022 
Solicitation Notifications View Count: 232 Vendors 
Solicitations Downloaded by:     14 Vendors 
Solicitations Submissions :      3 Vendors 

Firms:  

Lightle Enterprises of Ohio, LLC 
Frankfort, OH 45628 

Traffic Supplies & Distribution 
Fort Pierce, FL 34946 

Vulcan Signs, Inc. 
Foley, AL 36535 

 

RECOMMENDATION: 
The above solicitation be awarded to the lowest, responsive, and responsible bidders meeting 
specifications for each line item; Lightle Enterprise of Ohio, LLC, Traffic Supplies & Distribution and 
Vulcan Signs Inc., as primary and as secondary vendors, based on price and availability. 

The actual bid award is subject to the appropriate signature authority identified in the Procurement Code. 

 

__________________________ _______________ ______________________________ 
Approved     Date   Disapproved 
Larry M. Sapp, CPM, CPPB     Larry M. Sapp, CPM, CPPB 
Procurement Manager      Procurement Manager 
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1.1 Vendor Complaints or Grievances; Right to Protest 
Unless otherwise governed by state or Federal law, this Part shall govern the protest and appeal of 
Procurement decisions by the County. The term “Bidder” includes any Person that responds to any type 
of Solicitation issued by the County (e.g., ITB, RFP, ITN), and is not limited solely to a Person that 
submits a bid in response to an Invitation to Bid (ITB). 

1.1.1 Notice of Solicitations and Awards 
The County Shall provide notice of all Solicitations and Awards by Electronic posting in 
accordance with the Procedures, unless a different method is required by the Florida Statutes, in 
which case the County Shall provide notice in accordance with the requirement of the Florida 
Statues. 

1.1.2 Solicitation Protest 
Any prospective Bidder may file a Solicitation Protest concerning a Solicitation. 

1.1.2.1 Basis of the Solicitation Protest: The alleged basis for a Solicitation Protest shall be 
limited to the following: 

1.1.2.1.1 The Solicitation is inconsistent with this Code or the requirements of applicable 
Florida Statutes;  

1.1.2.1.2 The terms, conditions or Specifications of the Solicitation are in violation of, or 
are inconsistent with, applicable laws, Regulations, Procedures, policies or other 
legal authorities governing the Solicitation, including but not limited to the 
method of evaluating, ranking or awarding of the Solicitation, reserving rights 
of further negotiations, or modifying or amending any resulting Contract; and 

1.1.2.1.3 The Solicitation instructions are unclear or contradictory. 

1.1.3 Timing and Content of the Solicitation Protest 
The Solicitation protest must be in writing and provide all content in accordance with the Alachua 
County Code, Chapter 22 “Procurement”, Article 9 “Legal and Contractual Remedies” and must 
be received by the Procurement Manager by no later than 3:00 PM on the fourth business day after 
the solicitation was posted by the County. Failure to timely file a solicitation protest shall constitute 
a total and complete waiver of the bidder’s right to protest or appeal any solicitation defects, and 
shall bar the bidder from subsequently raising such solicitation defects in any subsequent Award 
protest, if any, or any other administrative or legal proceeding. 

1.1.4 Award Protest 
Any Bidder who is not the intended awardee and who claims to be the rightful awardee may file 
an Award Protest. However, an Award Protest is not valid and shall be rejected for lack of 
standing if it does not demonstrate that the protesting party would be awarded the Solicitation if 
its protest is upheld. 

1.1.5 Basis of the Award Protest 
The alleged basis for an Award Protest shall be limited to the following: 

1.1.5.1 The protesting party was incorrectly deemed non-responsive due to an incorrect 
assessment of fact or law; 

1.1.5.2 The County failed to substantively follow the Procedures or requirements specified in the 
Solicitation documents, except for minor irregularities that were waived by the County in 
accordance with this Code, which resulted in a competitive disadvantage to the protesting 
party; and 
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1.1.5.3 The County made an identifiable mathematical or other errors in evaluating the responses 
to the Solicitation, resulting in an incorrect score and not protesting party not being 
selected for award. 

1.1.6 Timing and Content of the Award Protest 
The Award Protest must be in writing and provide all content in accordance with the Alachua 
County Code, Chapter 22 “Procurement”, Article 9 “Legal and Contractual Remedies” and must 
be received by the Procurement Manager at lsapp@alachuacounty.us  no later than 3:00 PM on 
the fourth Business day after this Proposed Award Decision was posted by the County. Failure to 
timely file an Award Protest shall constitute a total and complete waiver of the Bidder’s right to 
protest or appeal the County’s proposed Award decision in any administrative or legal 
proceeding. 

1.1.7 Burden of Proof 
Unless otherwise provided by Florida law, the burden of proof shall rest with the protesting party. 

1.1.8 Stay of Procurement during Protests 
In the event of a timely protest, the County shall not proceed further with the Solicitation or with 
the award of the Contract until the County Manager, after consultation with the head of the Using 
Agency, makes a written determination that the award of the Solicitation without delay is: 

1.1.8.1 necessary to avoid an immediate and serious danger to the public health, safety, or 
welfare; 

1.1.8.2 necessary to avoid or substantial reduce significant damage to County property; 

1.1.8.3 necessary to avoid or substantially reduce interruption of essential County Services; or; 

1.1.8.4 otherwise in the best interest of the public. 

mailto:lsapp@alachuacounty.us


 

Alachua County, Florida 

Procurement 
Larry M. Sapp, Procurement Manager 

County Administration Building, Gainesville, FL 32601 
 

 

 

EVALUATION TABULATION 
ITB No. ITB 23-15-TW 

Annual Purchase of Sign Material 
RESPONSE DEADLINE: August 31, 2022 at 2:00 pm 

Report Generated:  Monday, October 10, 2022 
 
TRAFFIC SIGN FACES: 3M BRAND, DIAMOND GRADE REFLECTIVE (DG3) 4000 SERIES, PS, ‘NO SUB’    
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

1 ALL WAY, 18 X 6 R1-3P 5 ea $2.84 $6.25 $2.44 

2 ADVISORY SPEED PLATE (NO SPEED), 18 X 18, W13-1 20 ea $8.52 $18.75 $7.33 

3 ADVISORY SPEED PLATE 15 MPH, 18 X 18, W13-1 35 ea $8.52 $18.75 $7.33 

4 ADVISORY SPEED PLATE 20 MPH, 18 X 18, W13-1 15 ea $8.52 $18.75 $7.33 

5 ADVISORY SPEED PLATE 25 MPH, 18 X 18, W13-1 20 ea $8.52 $18.75 $7.33 

6 ADVISORY SPEED PLATE 30 MPH, 18 X 18, W13-1 20 ea $8.52 $18.75 $7.33 

7 ADVISORY SPEED PLATE 35 MPH, 18 X 18, W13-1 35 ea $8.52 $18.75 $7.33 

8 ADVISORY SPEED PLATE 40 MPH, 18 X 18, W13-1 20 ea $8.52 $18.75 $7.33 

9 ADVISORY SPEED PLATE 45 MPH, 18 X 18, W13-1 35 ea $8.52 $18.75 $7.33 



EVALUATION TABULATION 
ITB No. ITB 23-15-TW 
Annual Purchase of Sign Material 
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 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

10 AIRPORT SYMBOL, 24 X 24, I-5 5 ea $15.15 $18.75 $26.20 

11 ALACHUA COUNTY ROUTE MARKER, 24, M1-6 75 ea $18.00 $33.33 $26.20 

12 ALACHUA COUNTY ROUTE MARKER, 36, M1-6 75 ea $39.00 $74.97 $58.95 

13 BEGIN RIGHT TURN LANE YIELD TO BIKES, 36 X 30, R4-4 5 ea $28.41 $62.47 $24.45 

14 BICYCLE LANE DESIGNATION , 30 x 24, R3-17 5 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

15 CATTLE CROSSING SYMBOL, 30 x 30 , W11-4 5 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

16 CROSS ROAD SYMBOL, 30 x 30, W2-1 25 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

17 DEAD END, 24 x 24. W14-1 20 ea $15.15 $33.32 $13.04 

18 DEAD END, 36 X 8, W14-1AR 35 ea $7.58 $16.66 $6.52 

19 DEAD END, 36 X 8, W14-1AL 35 ea $7.58 $16.66 $6.52 

20 DIRECTION GUIDANCE MARKER, CHEVRON, 18 X 24M, W1-8 50 ea $11.36 $24.99 $9.78 

21 DIVIDED HIGHWAY SYMBOL, 24 X 18, R6-3 10 ea $11.36 $24.99 $9.78 

22 DO NOT BLOCK INTERSECTION, 24 X 30, R10-7 5 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

23 DO NOT ENTER, 30 X 30, R5-1 15 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

24 DOWNWARD POINTING ARROW (AT CROSSING), 24 X 12, W16-7P 25 ea $7.58 $16.66 $6.52 



EVALUATION TABULATION 
ITB No. ITB 23-15-TW 
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 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

25 DUCK CROSSING SYMBOL, 30 X 30, W11-12 5 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

26 END SCHOOL ZONE, 24 X 30, S5-2 20 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

27 EQUESTRIAN (SYMBOL), 30 X 30, W11-7 10 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

28 FIRE STATION, 30 X 30, W11-8 20 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

29 FLORIDA ROUTE MARKER, 24 X 24, FTP-28 20 ea $15.15 $33.32 $13.04 

30 FLORIDA ROUTE MARKER, 30 X 24, FTP-28 25 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

31 FUTURE THRU STREET (black on white), 24 X 30, 20 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

32 GOLF CART CROSSING (SYMBOL), 36 X 36, FTP-39 5 ea $34.09 $74.97 $29.34 

33 INTERSTATE SHIELD 75, 24, M1-1 5 ea $17.00 $33.32 $26.20 

34 JCT, 21 X 15, M2-1 25 ea $8.29 $18.74 $7.10 

35 KEEP RIGHT SYMBOL, 24 X 30, R4-7 5 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

36 KEEP RIGHT, WITH NO ARROW, 24 X 30, R4-7A 5 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

37 LARGE ARROW, 48 X 24, W1-6 5 ea $30.30 $66.64 $26.08 

38 LARGE DOUBLE ARROW, 48 X 24, W1-7 10 ea $30.30 $66.64 $26.08 

39 LEFT CURVE, 30 X 30, W1-2L 25 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 
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 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

40 LEFT LANE MUST TURN LEFT, 30 X 30, R3-7L 5 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

41 LEFT REVERSE CURVE, 30 X 30, W1-4L 10 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

42 LEFT REVERSE TURN, 30 X 30, W1-3L 10 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

43 LEFT SIDE BRIDGE END MARKER, 12 X 36, OM-3L 35 ea $11.36 $24.99 $9.78 

44 LEFT TURN, 30 X 30, W1-1L 20 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

45 LEFT WINDING ROAD, 30 X 30, W1-5L 10 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

46 LENS, BLACK, WHITE, BLACK BORDER, 30 X 30, R5-5B 20 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

47 LENS, BLACK, WHITE, BLACK BORDER X, 24 X 30, R11-11 25 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

48 LENS, BLUE / YELLOW, 21 X 15, M6-1 25 ea $8.29 $18.74 $7.10 

49 LENS, WHITE, BLACK BORDER, 24 X 24, R5-5B 10 ea $15.15 $33.32 $13.04 

50 LENS, YELLOW, BLACK BORDER, 24 X 24, W41-1 15 ea $15.15 $33.32 $13.04 

51 LENS, YELLOW, BLACK BORDER, 30 X 30 , W41-1 50 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

52 LIMITED SIGHT DISTANCE, 30 X 30, W14-4 15 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

53 LOW VEHICLE MAY DRAG ON RR TRACKS (SYMBOL), 36 X 36 , FTP-40 5 ea $34.09 $74.97 $29.34 

54 NARROW BRIDGE SYMBOL, 30 X 30, W5-2A 20 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 



EVALUATION TABULATION 
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 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

55 NO "U" TURN SYMBOL, 30 X 30, R3-4 5 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.81 

56 NO DUMPING, 18 X 24, R10-11 20 ea $11.36 $24.99 $9.78 

57 NO LEFT TURN SYMBOL, 24 X 24 , R3-2 5 ea $15.15 $33.32 $13.32 

58 NO OUTLET, 24 X 24, W14-2 35 ea $15.15 $33.32 $13.04 

59 NO OUTLET, 36 X 8, W14-2AR 35 ea $7.58 $16.66 $6.52 

60 NO OUTLET, 36 X 8, W14-2AL 35 ea $7.58 $16.66 $6.52 

61 NO PARKING ANYTIME, 18 X 24 , R7-1 35 ea $11.36 $24.99 $9.78 

62 NO PARKING HERE TO CORNER, 18 X 24, R7-11 25 ea $11.36 $24.99 $9.78 

63 NO RIGHT TURN SYMBOL, 24 X 24, R3-16 5 ea $15.15 $33.32 $13.32 

64 NO TRUCKS SYMBOL, 24 X 24, R5-2 10 ea $15.15 $33.32 $13.32 

65 ONE WAY LEFT, 18 X 24, R6-2L 10 ea $11.36 $24.99 $9.78 

66 ONE WAY LEFT, 36 X 12, R6-1L 5 ea $11.36 $24.99 $9.78 

67 ONE WAY RIGHT, 36 X 12, R6-1R 5 ea $11.36 $24.99 $9.78 

68 ONE WAY RIGHT, 18 X 24, R6-1R 5 ea $11.36 $24.99 $9.78 

69 PARKING BY DISABLED PERMIT ONLY, 12 X 18, R7-8-FL 25 ea $5.68 $12.49 $4.99 



EVALUATION TABULATION 
ITB No. ITB 23-15-TW 
Annual Purchase of Sign Material 
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 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

70 PAVEMENT ENDS SYMBOL, 30 X 30, W8-3A 5 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

71 PLAYGROUND SYMBOL, 36 X 36, W15-1 5 ea $34.09 $74.97 $29.34 

72 PREFERENTIAL BIKE LANE (ENDS), 30 X 12, R3-17b 10 ea $9.47 $20.82 $8.15 

73 RAILROAD ADVANCED WARNING, 30, W10-1 10 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

74 RAILROAD ADVANCED WARNING (CROSSROAD), 30 X 30, W10-2 10 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

75 RAILROAD ADVANCED WARNING (SIDEROAD), 30 X 30 , W10-3 10 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

76 SPEED REDUCTION AHEAD (NO NUMBERS IN TEXT), 36 X 36, W3-5 50 ea $44.00 $74.97 $29.97 

77 RESERVED PARKING HANDICAP, 12 X 18, R7-8-FL 25 ea $5.68 $12.49 $4.99 

78 RIGHT CURVE, 30 X 30, W1-2R 35 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

79 RIGHT LANE MUST TURN RIGHT, 30 X 30, R3-7R 5 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

80 RIGHT REVERSE CURVE, 30 X 30, W1-4R 5 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

81 RIGHT REVERSE TURN, 30 X 30, W1-3R 5 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

82 RIGHT SIDE BRIDGE END MARKER, 12 X 36, OM-3R 50 ea $11.36 $24.99 $9.78 

83 RIGHT TURN, 30 X 30, W1-1R 10 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

84 RIGHT WINDING ROAD, 30 X 30, W1-5R 10 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 
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 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

85 ROAD CLOSED , 48 X 30 , R11-2 10 ea $37.88 $83.30 $32.60 

86 ROAD NARROWS, 30 X 30, W5-1 10 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

87 SCHOOL SPEED LIMIT (NO NUMBERS IN TEXT WHEN FLASHING), 24 X 
48, S5-1 

5 ea $30.30 $66.64 $52.40 

88 SIDE ROAD SYMBOL, 30 X 30, W2-2 50 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

89 SIGNAL AHEAD SYMBOL, 30 X 30, W2-3 15 ea $23.67 $52.06 $25.31 

90 SLIPPERY WHEN WET, 30 X 30, W8-5 10 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

91 SPEED LIMIT 20 MPH, 24 X 30, R2-1 10 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

92 SPEED LIMIT 25 MPH, 24 X 30, R2-1 35 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

93 SPEED LIMIT 30 MPH, 24 X 30, R2-1 75 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

94 SPEED LIMIT 35 MPH, 24 X 30, R2-1 25 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

95 SPEED LIMIT 40 MPH, 24 X 30, R2-1 35 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

96 SPEED LIMIT 45 MPH, 24 X 30, R2-1 35 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

97 SPEED LIMIT 50 MPH, 24 X 30, R2-1 5 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

99 SPEED LIMIT 55 MPH, 24 X 30, R2-1 50 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 
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 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

100 SPEED LIMIT BLANK (NO SPEED), 24 X 30, R2-1 25 ea $18.90 $41.65 $16.30 

101 STOP, 18 X 18, R1-1 10 ea $8.00 $18.74 $7.33 

102 STOP, 24 X 24, R1-1 75 ea $15.00 $33.32 $13.04 

103 STOP, 30 X 30, R1-1 100 ea $23.00 $52.06 $20.37 

104 STOP. 36 X 36, R1-1 20 ea $34.00 $74.97 $29.34 

105 STOP AHEAD SYMBOL, 30 X 30, W3-1A 50 ea $23.60 $52.06 $25.31 

106 STOP HERE ON RED, 24 X 36 , R10-6 5 ea $22.70 $49.98 $19.56 

107 US ROUTE MARKER (NO NUMBERS), 24 X 24, M1-4 10 ea $22.00 $33.32 $13.04 

108 WEIGHT LIMIT (NO NUMBERS IN TEXT) TONS PER AXLE, TONS GROSS, 
36 X 24, R12-4 

5 ea $22.73 $49.98 $19.56 

109 WEIGHT LIMIT TON, 24 X 30, R12-1 10 ea $18.94 $41.65 $16.30 

110 YIELD, 36 X 36 X 36 , R1-2 35 ea $17.00 $66.64 $13.08 

 

TRAFFIC SIGN FACES: 3M BRAND, DIAMOND GRADE FLUORESCENT (DG3) YELLOW-GREEN, 4083, PS   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 
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 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

1 BICYCLE SYMBOL , 30 X 30, W11-1 10 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

2 BUS STOP SYMBOL VIP, 36 X 36 , S3-1 10 ea $34.00 $74.97 $29.97 

3 DOWNWARD POINTING ARROW, 24 X 12, W16-7P 10 ea $7.58 $16.66 $6.52 

4 IN STREET PEDESTRIAN CROSSING (YIELD) / STOP , 12 X 36, R1—6/a 10 ea $14.00 $24.99 $28.05 

5 LENS WITH BLACK BORDER, 30 X 30, W41-1 25 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

6 PEDESTRIAN SYMBOL, 30 X 30, W11-2 10 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

7 SCHOOL ( AHEAD ), 24 X 12, W16-9p 20 ea $8.00 $16.66 $6.52 

8 SCHOOL ADVANCED , 30 X 30, S1-1 15 ea $23.67 $52.06 $20.37 

9 SCHOOL ADVANCED , 36 X 36, S1-1 10 ea $34.09 $74.97 $29.34 

 

ELECTRO FILM (EC FILM): 3M BRAND, TRANSPARENT, ACRYLIC, PS, NO PUNCHINGS   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 
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 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

1 BLUE, 36 X 50 , 1175 2 ea $536.00 $693.00 $472.50 

2 BLUE, 48 x 50, 1175 1 ea $716.00 $918.00 $630.00 

3 BROWN, 36 X 50 , 1179 2 ea $536.00 $693.00 $472.50 

4 BROWN, 48 X 50, 1179 1 ea $716.00 $918.00 $630.00 

5 GREEN, 36 X 50, 1177 10 ea $536.00 $693.00 $472.50 

6 GREEN, 48 X 50, 1177 2 ea $716.00 $918.00 $630.00 

7 RED, 36 X 50, 1172 2 ea $536.00 $693.00 $472.50 

8 RED, 48 X 50, 1172 2 ea $716.00 $918.00 $630.00 

 

EPOXY RESIN, PAINT SUPPLIES, PAINT, FLUORESCENT TRAFFIC CONES WITH REFLECTIVE 4”/6” COLLARS   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

1 EPOXY RESIN ADHESIVE, PARTS A & B (SETS), 1 GAL CAN 10 ea $0.00 $94.00 No Bid 
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 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

2 DROP ON TYPE, SPHERICAL REFLECTIVE, GLASS BEADS, 50 LB BAGS 25 ea $0.00 $30.00 No Bid 

3 PAINT, TRAFFIC ACRYLIC WATER BASE, FAST DRY, WHITE, FL DOT 
APPROVED. NO LEAD 12470-4, 5 GAL 

20 ea $0.00 $93.00 No Bid 

4 PAINT, TRAFFIC ACRYLIC WATER BASE, FAST DRY, YELLOW, FL DOT 
APPROVED. NO LEAD 13109-2, 5 GAL 

5 ea $0.00 $93.00 No Bid 

5 TRAFFIC CONES, 100 % (PVC) ORANGE FLUORESCENT, FDOT, WIDE 
BASE, , , 12 LBS. WITH A 4 INCH AND A 6 INCH DIAMOND GRADE 

REFLECTIVE COLLARS (AFFIXED), 36 IN HEIGHT 

200 ea $0.00 $26.50 No Bid 

 

3M BRAND PRESPACING TRANSFER TAPE: SCPS-2, ‘NO SUB’   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

1 PRESPACING TRANSFER TAPE, 4 X 100, SCPS-2 20 ea $45.00 $34.50 $34.58 

2 PRESPACING TRANSFER TAPE, 6 X 100, SCPS-2 25 ea $60.00 $51.00 $35.87 

3 PRESPACING TRANSFER TAPE, 8 X 100, SCPS-2 30 ea $75.00 $67.50 $61.68 
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 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

4 PRESPACING TRANSFER TAPE, 12 X 100, SCPS-2 10 ea $115.00 $102.00 $69.58 

5 PRESPACING TRANSFER TAPE, 18 X 100, SCPS-2 5 ea $150.00 $153.00 $199.15 

 

ROLL GOODS SHEETING: 3M BRAND, ‘NO SUB’, ELECTROCUT FILM 7725-12, PS, NO HOLE PUNCHINGS   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

1 BLACK, 36 X 50, 7725-12 6 ea $816.00 $693.00 $382.50 

2 BLACK, 48 X 50 , 7725-12 6 ea $1,024.00 $918.00 $510.00 

 

ROLL GOODS: 3M BRAND, "NO SUB", CONSPICUITY TAPE, DIAMOND GRADE, REFLECTIVE, PS    
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 
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 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

1 RED / WHITE, 2 W X 150, 32ES 5 ea $133.00 $83.66 $99.10 

2 WHITE, 8 X 50, 4090 10 ea $294.00 $403.92 $249.00 

3 WHITE , 24 X 50, 4090 5 ea $870.00 $1,218.00 $747.00 

4 WHITE , 30 X 50 , 4090 8 ea $1,089.00 $1,522.00 $933.75 

5 WHITE, 36 X 50, 4090 3 ea $1,307.00 $1,827.00 $1,120.50 

6 YELLOW, 18 X 50, 4092 1 ea $653.00 $913.50 $560.25 

7 YELLOW. 24 X 50, 4092 3 ea $870.00 $1,218.00 $747.00 

8 YELLOW, 30 X 50, 4092 3 ea $1,089.00 $1,522.00 $933.75 

9 YELLOW, 36 X 50, 4092 2 ea $1,307.00 $1,827.00 $1,120.50 

10 RED, 18 X 50, 4092 2 ea $653.00 $913.50 $560.25 

11 FLUORESCENT ORANGE, 48 X 50, 4084 1 ea $2,489.00 $2,436.00 $1,554.00 

12 FLUORESCENT YELLOW-GREEN, 24 X 50, 4083 1 ea $870.00 $1,218.00 $747.00 

13 FLUORESCENT YELLOW-GREEN, 30 X 50, 4083 1 ea $1,089.00 $1,522.00 $933.75 

14 FLUORESCENT YELLOW-GREEN, 36 X 50, 4083 1 ea $1,300.00 $1,827.00 $1,120.50 
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ALUMINUM POP-RIVETS, FLEXSTAKE & SHURTITE BRAND DELINEATOR POSTS, GALVANIZED CHANNEL IRON POSTS, GALVANIZED 
SQUARE TUBING, GUARD RAIL REFLECTORS, PYRAMID CAPS, PANELS, BARRICADE SHEETING    
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

1 BLIND ALUMINUM POP RIVETS, 3/16" x 3/8" GRIP RANGE, #66, MALE 
SMALL HEAD, 3/16 X 1/2 (Grip Range) 

5000 ea $0.00 $0.09 No Bid 

2 DELINEATOR POST, GROUND MOUNT, WHITE, FLEXSTAKE BRAND, 
HD, NO SUB, 4 FT HIGH 

25 ea $0.00 $26.00 No Bid 

3 DELINEATOR POST, GROUND MOUNT, YELLOW, FLEXSTAKE BRAND, 
HD, NO SUB, 4 FT HIGH 

25 ea $0.00 $26.00 No Bid 

4 DELINEATOR POST, SURFACE MOUNT WITH BASE, WHITE, FLEXSTAKE 
BRAND, HD, NO SUB, 4 FT HIGH 

25 ea $0.00 $26.00 No Bid 

5 DELINEATOR POST, SURFACE MOUNT WITH BASE, YELLOW, 
FLEXSTAKE BRAND, HD, NO SUB, 4 FT HIGH 

25 ea $0.00 $26.00 No Bid 

6 DELINEATOR POST, GROUND MOUNT, WHITE, SHUR-TITE SHUR-FLEX 
BRAND, HD, NO SUB, 4 FT HIGH 

25 ea $0.00 $41.00 No Bid 

7 DELINEATOR POST, GROUND MOUNT, YELLOW, SHUR-TITE SHUR-
FLEX BRAND, HD, NO SUB, 4 FT HIGH 

25 ea $0.00 $41.00 No Bid 

8 DELINEATOR POST, SURFACE MOUNT WITH BASE, WHITE, SHUR-TITE 
SHUR-FLEX BRAND, HD, NO SUB. 4 FT HIGH 

25 ea $0.00 $40.00 No Bid 
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 LIGHTLE 
ENTERPRISES 
OF OHIO LLC 

Traffic 
Supplies & 

Distribution 

Vulcan Signs 

Line Item Description Est. Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

9 DELINEATOR POST, SURFACE MOUNT WITH BASE, YELLOW, SHUR-
TITE SHUR-FLEX BRAND, HD, NO SUB, 4 FT HIGH 

25 ea $0.00 $40.00 No Bid 

10 3” DIAMETER MOUNTED CRYSTAL GUARDRAIL 
REFLECTORS/WINGED-PLASTIC, CLEAR/WHITE, GR-1C 

500 ea $1.20 $2.89 No Bid 

 

VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE PASS/FAIL 

Question Title LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF 
OHIO LLC 

Network Craze Traffic Supplies & Distribution Vulcan Signs 

Submittal Confirmation Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Corporate Resolution Granting 
Signing 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Public Record Trade Secret or 
Proprietary Confidential 

Business Information 
Exemption Request 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Public Record Trade Secret or 
Proprietary Confidential 

Business Information 
Exemption Request 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Public Record Trade Secret or 
Proprietary Confidential 

Business Information 
Exemption Request 

No Response No Response No Response No Response 
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Question Title LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF 
OHIO LLC 

Network Craze Traffic Supplies & Distribution Vulcan Signs 

Option 1: Company is an 
Alachua County Certified Small 

Business Enterprise. 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Option 2: I certify that our 
Company will perform ALL 

work and that no 
subcontractors will be utilized 

for this bid. 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Option 3: SBE Participation. Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Option 4: SBE Good Faith 
Effort. 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Alachua County Government 
Minimum Wage (GMW) 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

DRUG FREE WORKPLACE Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Vendor Eligibility Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Responsible Agent Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Number of years in this type 
of service? 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Number of years licensed in 
Alachua County? 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

How many employees "ON 
THE JOB" each week? 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Number of employees "ON 
CALL" each week? 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Major Equipment Pass No Response Pass Pass 
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Question Title LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF 
OHIO LLC 

Network Craze Traffic Supplies & Distribution Vulcan Signs 

Do you currently hold any 
municipality contracts? 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

If you indicated yes to holding 
municipality contracts please 

list them below: 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

References Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Are your employees screened 
by: 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Cancelled or Termination Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Cancellation and Termination Pass No Response No Response No Response 

What constitutes your normal 
business days and working 

hours? 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Describe below, your firm's 
operational plan for providing 

the services under this 
agreement? 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Did you review and complete 
all the required documents 

and attachments? 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Do you acknowledge all 
Addendum(s) issued with this 

solicitation? 

Pass No Response Pass Pass 

Conflict of Interest Pass No Response Pass Pass 

 


	1.1 Vendor Complaints or Grievances; Right to Protest

