ALACHUA COUNTY- CDBG HOUSING GRANT #18-DB-OM-03-11-01-H03
HOME REHABILITATION BID PACKAGE #1 - BID TAB- REBID

Date: June 14,2021 Time: _2:15 P.M.
County Representative: Steve Weeks Project Coordinator: David Fox
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Certified
Roofing & $ 119,000.00 $ 6,300.00 $9,300.00 | $2,500.00 $6,200.00 | $40.00

Construction

FLA Homes

Unison
Development

FFE COST
ESTIMATE

$ 122,524.00

$ 111,200.00

$ 109,200.00

$6,215.00

$ 5,000.00

$ 6,000.00

$ 8,635.00

$ 7,500.00

$ 7,800.00

$ 5,500.00

$ 4,000.00

$ 3,500.00

$ 5,500.00

$ 5,800.00

$ 4,800.00

$17.00

$ 25.00

$24.00




ALACHUA COUNTY- CDBG HOUSING GRANT #18-DB-OM-03-11-01-H03
HOME REHABILITATION BID PACKAGE #1 - BID TAB- REBID

Date: June 14,2021 Time: _ 2:15 P.M.
County Representative: Steve Weeks Project Coordinator: David Fox
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Certified
Roofing &
Construction $ 119,000.00 $ 6,300.00 $9,300.00 $ 2,500.00 $ 6,200.00 $40.00
FLA Homes $ 122,727.00 $ 6,215.00 $ 8,635.00 $ 5,500.00 $5,500.00 | $17.00
Unison
Development $111.500.00 $-4.500.00 $-5,800-00 $-4,000-00 $5,000.00 $-25.00
Withdrew bid
FFE COST
ESTIMATE $ 109,800.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 7,800.00 $ 3,5600.00 $ 4,800.00 $24.00




ALACHUA COUNTY- CDBG HOUSING GRANT #18-DB-OM-03-11-01-H03
HOME REHABILITATION BID PACKAGE #1 - BID TAB- REBID

Date: June 14,2021 Time: _ 2:15 P.M.

County Representative: Steve Weeks Project Coordinator: David Fox
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Certified

Roofing &

Construction $ 119,000.00 $ 6,300.00 | $9,300.00 |$2,500.00 |$6,200.00 |$40.00

FLA Homes

Unison
Development

FFE COST
ESTIMATE

$ 120,721.00

No Bid

$ 109,800.00

$6,215.00

No Bid

$6,000.00

$ 8,635.00

No Bid

$7,800.00

$ 5,500.00

No Bid

$ 3,500.00

$ 5,500.00

No Bid

$ 4,800.00

$17.00

No Bid

$24.00




ALACHUA COUNTY- CDBG HOUSING GRANT #18-DB-OM-03-11-01-H03
HOME REHABILITATION BID PACKAGE #1 - BID TAB- REBID

Date: June 14,2021  Time: _ 2:15  P.M.
County Representative: Steve Weeks Project Coordinator: David Fox
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Certified
Roofing &
Construction $ 131,500.00 $ 6,300.00 $ 6,300.00 $ 2,500.00

FLA Homes

Unison
Development

FFE COST
ESTIMATE

$ 130,628.00

$ 121,700.00

$121,800.00

$6,215.00

$ 5,000.00

$ 6,000.00

$ 8,635.00

$ 6,500.00

$ 7,800.00

$ 5,500.00

$ 4,000.00

$ 3,600.00




ALACHUA COUNTY- CDBG HOUSING GRANT #18-DB-OM-03-11-01-H03
HOME REHABILITATION BID PACKAGE #1 - BID TAB- REBID

Date: June 14,2021 Time: 2:15 P.M.
County Representative: Steve Weeks Project Coordinator: David Fox
Company | - N © < -
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Certified
Roofing & $ 129,000.00 $6,300.00 | $9,300.00 | $2,500.00 |$6,200.00 |$40.00
Construction
FLA Homes $ 129,813.00 $6,215.00 | $8,635.00 | $5,500.00 | $5,500.00 | $17.00
Unison
Development $ 120,500.00 $ 5,000.00 | $6,500.00 | $4,000.00 | $5,800.00 | $25.00
FFE COST
ESTIMATE $ 115,800.00 $6,000.00 | $ 7,800.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $4,800.00 |$ 24.00




ALACHUA COUNTY- CDBG HOUSING GRANT #18-DB-OM-03-11-01-H03
HOME REHABILITATION BID PACKAGE #1 - BID TAB- REBID

Date: June 14,2021 Time: 2:15 P.M.

County Representative: Steve Weeks Project Coordinator: David Fox
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Certified

Roofing & $ 134,500.00 $ 6,300.00 | $9,300.00 |$2,500.00 |$6,200.00 |$40.00

Construction

FLA Homes $ 134.828.00 $6.215.00 | $8,635.00 | $5,500.00 | $5500.00 | $17.00
Unison

Development $-128.000-00 )

FFE COST $ 127,800.00 $6,000.00 | $7.800.00 |$3500.00 | $4,800.00 | $24.00

ESTIMATE




ALACHUA COUNTY- CDBG HOUSING GRANT #18-DB-OM-03-11-01-H03

HOME REHABILITATION BID PACKAGE #1 - BID TAB- REBID

Date: June 14,2021 Time: _ 2:15 P.M.

County Representative: Steve Weeks Project Coordinator: David Fox
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Certified

Roofing & $ 123,000.00 $6,300.00 | $9,300.00 | $2,500.00 |$6,200.00 |$40.00

Construction

FLA Homes

Unison
Development

FFE COST
ESTIMATE

$ 125,915.00

$140,700.00
Withdrew bid

$ 115,800.00

$6,215.00

$ 6,000.00

$ 8,635.00

$ 7,800.00

$ 5,500.00

$3,500.00

$ 5,500.00

$ 4,800.00

$17.00

$24.00




