

BID Responsiveness and SBE Recap Form

Bid # / Name:		20-11 Annual Purchase of Fire Rescue Uniforms													
BOD:		Wednesday, September 25, 2019													
Procurement Agent:		Mandy Mullins								Via:		Mark Shelton/Cheryl Ellis			
Vendor Name	Local Vendor (Y/N)	Adjusted		SBE Participation			Price Preference		Signed Bid Form	Addendum Acknowledge #1	Sub Cont Form	Drug Free Form	AC GMW Y/N	Public Record Exp	Comments
		Bid Award	Bid	SBE	SUB	GFE									
		Price **	\$	(Y/N)	%	Opt #	%	\$							
Dana Safety Supply	N	See Bid Form	See Bid Form	N		2	0%	#VALUE!	Y	Y	N/A	Y	N/A	Y	
Galls, LLC	N	See Bid Form	See Bid Form	N		2	0%	#VALUE!	Y	Y	N/A	Y	N/A	Y	
Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply Inc	N	See Bid Form	See Bid Form	N		2	0%	#VALUE!	Y	Y	N/A	Y	N/A	Y	
NAFECO	N	See Bid Form	See Bid Form	N		2	0%	#VALUE!	Y	Y	N/A	Y	N/A	Y	
<p>* Equal Opportunity Office, is a SBE or a 15% SBE participation goal was met for the County's SBE Program and is awarded a price preference.</p> <p>** Adjusted Bid Award Price EQUALS the Bid amount MINUS the Price Preference (SBE) amount for the base award consideration.</p> <p>Key: SBE = Small Business Enterprise; SUB = Subcontractor Form; GFE = Good Faith Effort</p>															

Did Not Bid on ALL Items
 Non-responsive Bid

SBE non-responsive; GFE not provided

BID 20-11 Annual Purchase of Fire Rescue Uniforms

FIRE RESCUE UNIFORM PRICE SHEET ACFR UNIFORM BID ITEMS						
Vendor >>>			Dana Safety	GALLS	Lawmen's Shooter	NAFECO
Item Description	Galls Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
SHIRTS						
Flying Cross Long Sleeve Poly Cotton Men's Shirt With Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left Sleeve (WHITE) Part B Specifications Section 14.24	SH018		No Bid	\$36.00	No Bid	\$42.29
Flying Cross Short Sleeve Poly Cotton Men's Shirt With Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left Sleeve (WHITE) Part B Specifications Section 14.24	SH020	85R54	No Bid	\$32.00	No Bid	\$37.53
Flying Cross Short Sleeve Poly Cotton Women's Shirt With Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left Sleeve (WHITE) Part B Specifications Section 14.24	SH047	176R54	No Bid	\$32.00	No Bid	\$37.53
Flying Cross Long Sleeve Poly Cotton Women's Shirt With Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left Sleeve (WHITE) Part B Specifications Section 14.24	SH048	126R54	No Bid	\$36.00	No Bid	\$42.49
Flying Cross Short Sleeve Polyester Men's Command Shirt With Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left Sleeve (WHITE) Part B Specifications Section 14.11	SH070	85R78	No Bid	\$40.00	No Bid	\$45.41
Flying Cross Long Sleeve Polyester Men's Command Shirt With Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left Sleeve (WHITE, NAVY) Part B Specifications Section 14.11	SH071	34W78Z	No Bid	\$44.00	No Bid	\$51.30
Flying Cross Short Sleeve Polyester Women's Command Shirt With Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left Sleeve (WHITE) Part B Specifications Section 14.11	SH119	176R78	No Bid	\$40.00	No Bid	\$45.41
Flying Cross Long Sleeve Polyester Women's Command Shirt With Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left Sleeve (WHITE, NAVY) Part B Specifications Section 14.11	SH121	126R78	No Bid	\$42.00	No Bid	\$51.30
8000 Gildan-DryBlend 50 Cotton/50 Poly T-Shirt, NAVY, ACFR Logo on back, Sizes: Sm,Med, Lg, Xl, 2xl, 3xl Part B Specifications Section 14.14		Gildan 8000	No Bid	\$5.00	No Bid	\$10.29
Propper Uniform 100% Cotton Polo Men's Shirt. Mic tabs on both shoulders and pen pocket on left sleeve. White. ACFR Logo on front. Job title on front, employee name on front- ACFR Lettering on back, Sizes: Sm,Med, Lg, Xl, 2xl, 3XL Part B Specifications Section 14.13	SH3313	F5806	No Bid	\$30.00	No Bid	\$47.69
Propper Uniform 100% Cotton Polo Women's Shirt. Mic tabs on both shoulders and pen pocket on left sleeve. White. ACFR Logo on front. Job title on front, employee name on front- ACFR Lettering on back, Sizes: Sm,Med, Lg, Xl, 2xl, 3XL Part B Specifications Section 14.13	SH3314	F5807	No Bid	\$30.00	No Bid	\$47.69
Propper Men's Ice Performance Polo, 94% polyester, 6% spandex - Short Sleeve. Hidden buttons under collar for professional look. Two-channel pen pockets on the left sleeve. Longer tail in back to keep shirt tucked in. Mic clips on both shoulders and sunglass clip under placket. ACFR Logo on front, employee name on front- ACFR Lettering on back, Sizes: Sm,Med, Lg, Xl, 2xl, 3XL Part B Specifications Section 14.12	ST136	F5341	No Bid	\$42.00	No Bid	\$56.05
Propper Women's Ice Performance Polo, 94% polyester, 6% spandex - Short Sleeve. Hidden buttons under collar for professional look. Two-channel pen pockets on the left sleeve. Longer tail in back to keep shirt tucked in. Mic clips on both shoulders and sunglass clip under placket. ACFR Logo on front, employee name on front- ACFR Lettering on back, Sizes: Sm,Med, Lg, Xl, 2xl, 3XL Part B Specifications Section 14.12	ST284	F5327	No Bid	\$37.00	No Bid	\$56.06
Sub Total for Shirts			\$0.00	\$458.00	\$0.00	\$560.75

Trousers						
Description	Galls Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
Flying Cross Men's VISA System 3 Polyester Trousers (NAVY) Part B Specifications Section 14.25	TR121	382	No Bid	\$41.00	\$41.00	\$48.74
Flying Cross Polyester Women's Pants (NAVY) Part B Specifications Section 14.25	TR083	3960	No Bid	\$37.00	\$37.00	\$44.68
Flying Cross Men's Polyester Cotton Trousers with Flex Waistband (NAVY) Part B Specifications Section 14.4	TJ262	F138200	No Bid	\$42.00	\$42.00	\$56.12
Flying Cross Women's Poly Cotton Pants (NAVY) Part B Specifications Section 14.4	TR651	47400W	No Bid	\$45.00	\$45.00	\$56.12
Flying Cross Men's Polyester Gabardine Pants (BLACK) Part B Specifications Section 14.25	TR082		No Bid	\$37.00	\$37.00	\$44.68
Flying Cross Polyester Women's Pants (BLACK) Part B Specifications Section 14.25	TR083	3960	No Bid	\$37.00	\$37.00	\$44.68
Sub Total for Trousers			\$0.00	\$239.00	\$239.00	\$295.02

Uniform Accessories						
Description	Galls Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
BELT, BLACK 1" Off Duty Belt Part B Specifications Section 14.7	ZU939	ZU939	No Bid	\$17.00	No Bid	\$20.00
PATCH- ACS519257 EMERGENCY MEDICAL TECHNICIAN FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.11.1	EC2190	04CN03C09	\$1.31	\$1.29	No Bid	\$2.00
PATCH- ACS519257 PARAMEDIC FLORIDA CIR ROY/LTGL Part B Specifications Section 14.11.1	EC2189	04CM09DD06	\$1.31	\$1.29	No Bid	\$2.00
PATCH- ACS519257 ALACHUA CO FIRE RESCUE ROY/LT Part B Specifications Section 14.11.1	EC2188	04CL05EE06	\$1.00	\$1.09	No Bid	\$3.75
PATCH- ACS519257 ALACHUA COUNTY FIRE RESCUE MEDICAL DIRECTOR Part B Specifications Section 14.11.1	EN16444	04DN11CC01	No Bid	\$2.50	No Bid	\$3.75
Tie- Galls Clip-On Tie (NAVY) Part B Specifications Section 14.10	UA494	UA494	No Bid	\$6.00	No Bid	\$6.95
Patch - 4" x 1.5" Crescent Rocker "Honor" Navy/Gold, downward curve Part B Specifications Section 14.10, Figure 1 Attachment 1			\$1.26	\$1.20	No Bid	\$3.75
Patch - 4" x 1.5" Crescent Rocker "Guard" Navy/Gold, upward curve Part B Specifications Section 14.10, Figure 1 Attachment 1			\$1.26	\$1.20	No Bid	\$3.75
Patch - 4" x 1.5" Crescent Rocker "Critical Care" Navy/Gold, upward curve Part B Specifications Section 14.10, Figure 1 Attachment 1			\$1.26	\$1.20	No Bid	\$3.75
Sub Total for Uniform Accessories			\$7.40	\$32.77	\$0.00	\$49.70

Collar Brass						
Description	Galls Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
Blackinton Single Bugle Pin (GOLD) Lieutenant Part B Specifications Section 14.23.10	CB056	A2909	\$11.42	\$6.75	\$14.41 ea \$7.03 pr	\$15.00
Blackinton Double Bugle Pin (GOLD) Captain Part B Specifications Section 14.23.10	CB257	A2909-2	\$11.42	\$6.75	\$14.41 ea \$7.03 pr	\$15.00
Blackinton 2 Crossed Bugles Pin (GOLD) District Chief Part B Specifications Section 14.23.10	CB058	A2908	\$11.42	\$5.25	\$14.80 ea \$7.03 pr	\$15.00
Blackinton 3 Crossed Bugles Pin (GOLD) Assistant Chief Part B Specifications Section 14.23.11	CB059	A2907	\$11.81	\$5.25	\$14.80 ea \$7.03 pr	\$15.00
Blackinton 4 Crossed Bugles Pin (GOLD) Deputy Chief Part B Specifications Section 14.23.11	CB060	A2906	\$11.81	\$5.25	\$14.80 ea \$7.03 pr	\$15.00
Blackinton 5 Crossed Bugles Pin (GOLD) Chief Part B Specifications Section 14.23.11	CB061	A2905	\$11.81	\$5.25	\$14.80 ea \$7.03 pr	\$15.00
Smith & Warren Custom Collar Pins 4 Letters 3/8" (Sold In Pairs) ACFR (GOLD) ATTACHMENT 2	CB120		\$19.82	\$17.00	9.16 ea	\$25.00
Sub Total for Collar Brass			\$89.51	\$51.50	\$0.00	\$115.00

Dress Coat Collar Brass							
Description	Galls Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost	
Blackinton (15/16") Single Bugle Dress Coat Pin (GOLD) Lieutenant Part B Specifications Section 14.23.10	A2046	2876 GF	A2876	\$7.21	\$12.00	\$10.30	\$12.00
Blackinton (15/16") Double Bugles Dress Coat Pin (GOLD) Captain Part B Specifications Section 14.23.10	A2450	2 GLOD	A2875	\$7.21	\$12.00	\$10.30	\$12.00
Blackinton (15/16") 2 Crossed Bugles Dress Coat Pin (GOLD) District Chief Part B Specifications Section 14.23.10	A2242	2874 GF	A2874	\$7.21	\$12.00	\$10.30	\$12.00
Blackinton (15/16") 3 Crossed Bugles Dress Coat Pin (GOLD) Assistant Chief Part B Specifications Section 14.23.11	A2047	2873 GF	A2873	\$7.21	\$12.00	\$10.30	\$12.00
Blackinton (15/16") 4 Crossed Bugles Dress Coat Pin (GOLD) Deputy Chief Part B Specifications Section 14.23.11	CB197	GP	A2872	\$7.21	\$12.00	\$10.30	\$12.00
Blackinton (15/16") 5 Crossed Bugles Dress Coat Pin (GOLD) Chief Part B Specifications Section 14.23.11	ZA3214	GLO	A2871	\$7.21	\$12.00	\$10.30	\$12.00
Sub Total for Dress Coat Collars Brass			\$43.26	\$72.00	\$61.80	\$72.00	

Oversized Dress Coat Badges						
Description	Galls Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
Badge Style # B96 Karat Klad- SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS- LINE 2 - DISTRICT CHIEF- LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE- LINE 4 - (White center 2) Part B Specifications Section 14.21	BC052 GP	996 Karat Klad	\$82.20	\$105.00	\$84.02	\$105.85
Badge Style # B96 Karat Klad- SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS- LINE 2 - ASSISTANT CHIEF- LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE- LINE 4 - (White center 3) Part B Specifications Section 14.21	BC052 GP	996 Karat Klad	\$82.20	\$105.00	\$84.02	\$105.85
Badge Style # B96 Karat Klad- SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS- LINE 2 - DEPUTY CHIEF- LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE- LINE 4 - (White center 4) Part B Specifications Section 14.21	BC052 GP	996 Karat Klad	\$82.20	\$105.00	\$84.02	\$105.85
Badge Style # B96 Karat Klad- SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS- LINE 2 - FIRE CHIEF- LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE- LINE 4 - (White center 5) Part B Specifications Section 14.21	BC052 GP	996 Karat Klad	\$82.20	\$105.00	\$84.02	\$105.85
Badge Style # B96-RHO GLO SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - RECRUITMENT OFFICER LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 -A-3028 (RHO GLO-RED) LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.21	BC052 GP	996-RHO GLO	\$56.40	\$74.00	\$57.36	\$70.90
Badge Style # B96 RHO GLO SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - CHAPLAIN LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - A 2437 WHITE CROSS, NAVY BLUE background (chaplain) LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.21	BC052 GP	996-RHO GLO	\$56.40	\$74.00	\$57.36	\$70.90
Badge Style # B96 Karat Klad SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - HONOR GUARD LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - A3028 BG RED LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.21	BC052 GP	996 Karat Klad	\$82.20	\$105.00	\$84.02	\$105.85
Sub Total for Oversized Dress Coat Badges			\$523.80	\$673.00	\$534.82	\$671.05

Badges						
Description	Galls Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
Badge Style # YHB-B575-RHO GLO-FITS ALL * BADGE SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - DRIVER LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - Blue Star of Life LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.22	BC198 RG	575-RHO GLO	\$49.54	\$74.00	\$50.78	\$62.29
YHB-B575-RHO GLO-FITS ALL * BADGE SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - RECRUITMENT OFFICER LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 -A-3028 (RHO GLO-RED) LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.22	BC198 RG	575 RHO GLO	\$49.54	\$74.00	\$50.78	\$62.29

Vendor >>>			Dana Safety	GALLS	Lawmen's Shooter	NAFECO
Item Description	Galls Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
Badge Style # B575 RHO GLO SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - CHAPLAIN LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - A 2437 WHITE CROSS, NAVY BLUE background (chaplain) LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.2.2	BC198 RG	575 RHO GLO	\$49.54	\$74.00	\$50.78	\$62.29
Badge Style # VHB-B575-RHO GLO-FITS ALL * BADGE SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - FIREFIGHTER LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - A-3028 LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.2.2	BC198 RG	575 RHO GLO	\$49.54	\$74.00	\$50.78	\$62.29
Badge Style # VHB-B575-RHO GLO-FITS ALL * BADGE SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - DRIVER OPERATOR LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - A-3028 LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.2.2	BC198 RG	575 RHO GLO	\$49.54	\$74.00	\$50.78	\$62.29
Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - WAREHOUSE MANAGER LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - STATE OF FLORIDA SEAL LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.2.2	BC198 KK	B575-KK	\$74.11	\$105.00	\$74.98	\$94.00
Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - PROGRAM MANAGER LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - STATE OF FLORIDA SEAL LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.2.0	BC198 KK	B575-KK	\$74.11	\$105.00	\$74.98	\$94.00
Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - EMS LIEUTENANT LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - Blue Star of Life (A4247 FC) LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.2.0	BC198 KK	B575-KK	\$74.11	\$105.00	\$74.98	\$94.00
Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - LIEUTENANT LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - RED Center (RAISED, ONE SINGLE BUGLE) LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.2.0	BC198 KK	B575-KK	\$74.11	\$105.00	\$74.98	\$94.00
Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - CAPTAIN LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - A-2997 White Center (RAISED, Two side by side BUGLES) LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.2.0	BC198 KK	B575-KK	\$74.11	\$105.00	\$74.98	\$94.00
VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - DISTRICT CHIEF LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - A-2994 White Center (RAISED, Two crossed BUGLES) LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.2.0	BC198 KK	B575-KK	\$74.11	\$105.00	\$74.98	\$94.00
Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - ASSISTANT CHIEF LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - White Center (RAISED, THREE GOLD crossed BUGLES) LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.2.0	BC198 KK	B575-KK	\$74.11	\$105.00	\$74.98	\$94.00
Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - DEPUTY CHIEF LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - White Center (RAISED, FOUR GOLD crossed BUGLES) LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.2.2	BC198 KK	B575-KK	\$74.11	\$105.00	\$74.98	\$94.00
Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - CHIEF LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - White Center (RAISED, FIVE GOLD crossed BUGLES) LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.2.0	BC198 KK	B575-KK	\$74.11	\$105.00	\$74.98	\$94.00
Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS LINE 2 - MEDICAL DIRECTOR LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE LINE 4 - A4256 FC (Physician Symbol-white on blue) LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part B Specifications Section 14.2.0	BC198 KK	B575-KK	\$74.11	\$105.00	\$74.98	\$94.00
Sub Total for Badges			\$988.80	\$1,420.00	\$1,003.70	\$1,251.45

NOMEX SHIRTS						
Description	Galls Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
Flying Cross Men's Nomex IIIA Short-Sleeve Shirt- (MENS) Part B Specifications Section 14.1.15	SR558	9800	NO	\$88.00	No Bid	\$157.14
Flying Cross Women's Nomex IIIA Short-Sleeve Shirt Part B Specifications Section 14.1.15	SR560	9810	NO	\$88.00	No Bid	\$157.14
Sub Total for NOMEX Shirts			\$0.00	\$176.00	\$0.00	\$314.28

NOMEX PANTS						
Description	Galls Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
Flying Cross Men's Nomex IIIA Trousers Part B Specifications Section 14.1.3	TR619	98200	NO	\$109.00	No Bid	\$198.84
Flying Cross Women's Nomex IIIA Pants Part B Specifications Section 14.1.3	TR620	98250	NO	\$109.00	No Bid	\$198.84
Sub Total for NOMEX Pants			\$0.00	\$218.00	\$0.00	\$397.68

NOMEX ACCESSORIES						
Description	Galls Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
1IN SINGLE NOMEX NAMESTRIP NON-APPLIED (NAVY w/ white or gold lettering) Part B Specifications Section 14.1.2	UA612N		NO	\$4.25	No Bid	\$17.00
1x1 inch nomex collar patches with gold bugle Part B Specifications Section 14.1.2	EG0712	AC5519257	NO	\$2.20	No Bid	\$17.00
1x1 inch nomex collar patches with white D/O Part B Specifications Section 14.1.2	EG0713	AC5519257	NO	\$3.00	No Bid	\$17.00
Sub Total for Nomex Accessories			\$0.00	\$9.45	\$0.00	\$51.00

RAINWEAR, SAFETY VEST AND FLOATION DEVICES						
Description	MTS Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
RAINCOAT-LIME PU/ANSI CL 3 RAINCOAT 49" 3M REFLECTIVE (ACFR IN LARGE GORILLA GRIP LETTERS ON BACK) Part B Specifications Section 14.19	A-493		\$48.46	\$60.00	No Bid	\$69.71
Safety Vest-AVLM99 (MTS1) -ANSI/LM-CHEV-VEST 2" BLAZE ORANGE REFLECTIVE MIC TABS BOTH SIDES- (ORANGE REFLECTIVE 3 X 6 PANEL ON BACK A.C.F.R. BLACK INK, MICROPHONE TAB ON EACH SIDE ON FRONT) Part B Specifications Section 14.16	J-AVLM99	J-AVLM99	\$23.59	NO BID	No Bid	\$42.00
Stearns I426 Search And Rescue Life Vest Part B Specifications Section 14.6	I426 STEARNS	1426	NO BID	NO BID	No Bid	\$64.48
Sub Total for Rainware, Safety Vest and Floation Devices			\$72.05	\$60.00	\$0.00	\$176.19

WINTER COAT						
Description	SAFETY SMART Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
Occunomix Class 3 Hi Vis Yellow 3-in-1 Black Bottom Bomber Jacket LUX-ETJIBR (3x3 ACFR IN LARGE GORILLA GRIP LETTERS ON BACK) Section 14.16	O-LUX-ETJIBR	O-LUX-ETJIBR	\$37.52	\$44.00	No Bid	\$55.00
Sub Total for Winter Coats			\$37.52	\$44.00	\$0.00	\$55.00

WILDLAND PANT AND JACKET						
Description	PLEXUS Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
Overpants, 6 oz Nomex, w/ brass fly zipper, 2" scotchlight trim @ Cargo Pockets, 2 hip pockets, waistband closure w/snap hook, take-up bag, 2" reinforced closure w/ heavy snap hook-TOPPS BRAND Part B Specifications Section 14.2	PA125648	PA12-5648	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$134.85
Jackets (shirt) 6 oz Nomex, 6.5 oz Style, yellow w/silver 2" trim, Radio pocket on left front w/ flap, belloved breast pocket w/ flap, 2 belloved lower pockets on hip, hook & loop closure on sleeve cuff, Large collar, throat piece, hook & loop closure, TOPPS BRAND Part B Specifications Section 14.3	JK125648	JK12-5648	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$204.43
Propper® Wildland Overpant, Waist Sizes: Small thru 3XL and Length Options of Regular and Long. Part B Specifications Section 14.5		F5299	No Bid	\$113.00	No Bid	\$134.05
Propper® Wildland Overshirt, Sizes: Small thru 3XL and Length Options of Regular and Long. Part B Specifications Section 14.6		F5307	No Bid	\$120.00	No Bid	\$138.14
Sub Total for Wildland and Pant and Jacket			\$0.00	\$233.00	\$0.00	\$675.47

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS						
Description	GALLS Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
DELUXE SCBA MASK BAG (BLACK) Part B Specifications Section 14.8	FE674	SHG135	No Bid	\$10.00	No Bid	\$18.25
Lightning X Premium Firefighter Fireman XL Step-In Turnout Fire Bunker Duty Gear Bag w/ Shoulder Strap & Front Operations Pockets - Red Part B Specifications Section 14.9		LXFB20-R	No Bid	\$56.00	No Bid	\$68.82
Sub Total for Miscellaneous Items			\$0.00	\$66.00	\$0.00	\$87.07

CLASS A NAME PLATE/NAME TAGS						
Description	GALLS Part #	MFG Part #	Cost	Cost	Cost	Cost
Nameplate, SILVER, Black Lettering, Line # 1 employee first initial and last name, Line # 2 Rank/Position, Clutch back attachment. Size: Length 2 3/8" x Height 1/2". Part B Specifications Section 14.26		035 SIL PLSH CB	\$7.95	\$6.15	\$11.02	\$12.00
Nameplate, Gold, Black Lettering, Line # 1 employee first initial and last name, Line # 2 Rank/Position, Clutch back attachment. Size: Length 2 3/8" x Height 1/2". Part B Specifications Section 14.26		035 GLD PLSH CB	\$7.95	\$6.15	\$11.02	\$12.00
Sub Total for Class "A" Name Plates/Name Tags			\$15.90	\$12.30	\$22.04	\$24.00
Awarded Sections Totals			\$523.80	\$673.00	\$534.82	\$671.05