








REMISED 5/14/2020Bid #21-13 Annual Medical Supplies REVISED
5/14/2020

Master - Bid Form/Price Sheet

INSTRUCTIONS FOR PRICE SHEET COMPLETION: Vendors
must type their bids into the Excel document and

Venor Name: Life-Assist, Inc.

Failure to provide the information requested

Single/Each Package/Unit (List Package Unit Count) 55 30 e s 7 e i 7 51

DESCRIPTION Eg:rﬁ(l\-lga%ﬁl_ Packing for Single/Each is "1" Packing/Unit must be completed and priced MFGNich?;rand MFG Product #
ADAPTER, VIAL ADAPTER, LATEX FREE CLAERLINK
SYSTEM LUER ACTIVATED UNIVERSAL, BAXTER #2N8395 300 LEA $ 4.14 200/Case $528.00 Baxter 2N8395
ALCOHOL PREP PADS MEDIUM 340 1/EA $ 0.0077 200/Box $1.54 Kendall 6818
ARTERIAL CATHERIZATION KITS- RA CATH KIT 20 GA X 1-
3/4" # NA-04020-1A NO SUB 20 1/EA $ 68.85 5/Case $344.25 Teleflex NA-04020-1A
gSEIRATOR MECONIUM, (SINGLE USE), NEOTECH #N0101, NO 33 1EA $ 487 1/Each $4.87 Neotech N0101
ATOMIZER SYRINGE, MAD MUSOSAL ATOMIZATION DEVICE,
WITH 3ML SYRINGE & VIAL ADAPTER 253 1/EA $ 9.56 1/Each $9.56 Teleflex MAD140

Great Plains

BAAM AIRWAY MONITOR AUDIBLE AIRWAY DETECTOR 37 1/EA $ 6.00 1/Each $6.00 Ballistics MD6-10
BACKBOARD, PLASTIC OR FIBERGLASS CONSTRUCTION,
SHOULD WEIGH LESS THAN 16 LBS. WITH 500 LB. CAPACITY, .
STANDARD LENGTH & WIDTH, FLAT SURFACE FOR AFFIXING 20 1/EA $ 84.65 1/Each $84.65 Allied Healthcare L818000A
A DISPOSABLE CID, WITHOUT PINS
BAG, MERRIT INTUBATION MODULE ICB RED MODEL #
MEPMS5101A-F NO SUB 6 1/EA $ 93.00 1/Each $93.00 Meret M8101A-F
BAG, Merrit Omni Pro ICB RED ParT # MEPM5101F NO SUB 6 1/EA $ 285.00 1/Each $285.00 Merrit M8101F
BAG, CARRY BAG, for LCSU 4 800ML SUCTION UNIT 3 1/EA $ 62.89 1/Each $62.89 Laerdal Medical 886110
BAG, CARRYING CASE, BACKPACK FOR AED CARDIAC
SCIENCE G3 PRO, ITEM # G8748521 4 1/EA $ 170.10 1/Each $170.10 AED G35007TK
BAG, CARRYING CASE- SOFT SIDED 02 CARRYING CASE,
JUMBO "D" SIZE, SIZE 28"L X 12"W X 10"H, EXTERIOR CAN BE
WASHED AND DISINFECTED, WITH REFLECTIVE STRIPPING, 6 1/EA $ 220.00 1/Each $220.00 Fleming Ind. 34016DP-RD
IRON DUCK BRAND, MODEL: IDX XTREME BLUE, RED or
ORANGE # 34016DP NO SuB
ES\EC; PEDIATRIC MEDICAL BAG, FIELDTEX # FT-911-80101 NO 4 1EA $ 5705 1/Each $57.05 Fieldtex FT-911-80101




DESCRIPTION

EST ANNUAL
QTY -Each

Packing for Single/Each is "1"

Packing/Unit must be completed and priced

MFG & Brand
Name

MFG Product #

BAG, RESPONSE KIT- SOFT SIDED ALS RESPONSE KIT WITH
MODULES, 22"L X 14"W X 12"H, EXTERIOR CAN BE WASHED *
DISINFECTED, ROYAL BLUE OR RED OR ORANGE WITH
REFLECTIVE STRIPING, IRON DUCK #32325R NO SUB

1EA

234.49

1/Each

$234.49

Fleming Ind.

32325R-RB

BAG, COLLAR, REFLECTIVE TRIM, 24 INCH L x 11 INCH T x5
INCHW

20

1/EA

24.00

1/Each

$24.00

HawkePaks

RS-15D

BAG FOR VOMIT OR URINE DISPOSAL, 1000 CC CAPACITY
WITH EXTRA WIDE, RIGID COLLAR WITH AUTOMATIC INNER
SEAL TO PREVENT LEAKING AND SPILLING, CLEAR PLASTIC,
WITH HAND GUARD, GI BARF #PG72 OR EQUAL,

2250

1/EA

1.10

1/Each

$1.10

Gkr Industries

8000

BANDAGE- ELASTIC BANDAGE WITH METAL CLIPS, 3" X 5
YARDS, DYNAREX OR EQUAL, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

186

1EA

0.53

1/Each

$0.53

Dukal

503

BANDAGE- ELASTIC BANDAGE WITH METAL CLIPS, 6" X 5
YARDS, DYNAREX OR EQUAL, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

129

1EA

0.95

1/Each

$0.95

Dukal

506

BANDAGE- TRIANGULAR BANDAGE, #€29319 DUKAL
CTB40 NO SuUB

186

1EA

0.34

1/Each

$0.34

Dukal

CTB40

BANDAIDS- SHEER BANDAIDS, 1" X 3" 50BOX

100

1EA

0.03

50/Box

$1.50

Curity

44119

BATTERY SET FOR IMPACT ULTALITE PORTABLE SUCTION
UNIT IMPACT #590601, NO SUB

12

1EA

38.00

1/Each

$38.00

Impact

BT Part #: 590601

BATTERY FOR CARDIAC SCIENCE POWERHEART AED G3 REF
# 9146-302

1EA

319.00

1/Each

$319.00

CPR1

9146-302

BATTERY FOR CARDIAC SCIENCE POWERHEART AED G3
PRO REF # 9145-301

1EA

319.00

1/Each

$319.00

CPR1

9145-302

BIO HAZARD BAG, 23 X 23, 1.5 MILS THICK,55GAL: 7-10 GAL.
CAPACITY, RED OPAQUE BAG WITH BIO-HAZARD EMBLEM
AND LETTERING PRINTED IN BLACK. MUST MEET FEDERAL
SPECIFICATIONS,

1074

1EA

0.13

1/Each

$0.13

Medegen Medical

116

BIO HAZARD BAG, 43X55, 1.5 MILS THICK, 730-GAL: 55 GAL.
CAPACITY, RED OPAQUE BAG WITH BIO-HAZARD EMBLEM
AND LETTERING PRINTED IN BLACK. MUST MEET FEDERAL
SPECIFICATIONS, MEDGEN MEDICAL # 520-2122

1/EA

0.67

200/Case

$134.00

Medegen Medical

2122

BLANKET- RESCUE BLANKET, 54" X 80", WATERPROOF
POLYETHYLENE OVER A SOFT ABSORBANT PAPER LINING,
DISPOSABLE, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

591

1EA

1.94

1/Each

$1.94

Dukal

7303

BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF- ADULT SIZE, NON DISPOSABLE
NYLON CUFF, TWO TUBE BLADDER, LATEX FREE BULBO-
300 mmHG GAUGE. KENOREX # 777701 OR EQUAL

33

1/EA

6.08

1/Each

$6.08

Dynarex

7107

BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, CHILD SIZE, NON DISPOSABLE,
NYLON CUFF, TWO TUBE BLADDER, LATEX FREE BULBO-
300 mmHG GAUGE. KENOREX # 777703 OR EQUAL

20

1EA

8.84

1/Each

$8.84

Dynarex

7106

BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, INFANT SIZE, NON DISPOSABLE ,
NYLON CUFF, TWO TUBE BLADDER, LATEX FREE BULBO-
300 mmHG GAUGE. KENOREX # 777704 OR EQUAL

1EA

8.06

1/Each

$8.06

Dynarex

7104

BLOOD PRESSURE THIGH CUFF, NON DISPOSABLE NYLON
CUFF, TWO TUBE BLADDER, LATEX FREE BULBO0-300
mmHG GAUGE. KENOREX # 777705 OR EQUAL

18

1EA

10.60

1/Each

$10.60

Dynarex

7108

BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF — DISPOSABLE, INFANT SIZE, SINGLE
TUBE CASMED MODEL 0814, ADAPTER: MQ NO SUB

1EA

5.09

20/Box

$101.80

Welch Allyn

SOFT-07-1MQ




DESCRIPTION ESQ-I:I_QI\_IEI:C':;L Packing for Single/Each is "1" Packing/Unit must be completed and priced MFGmeB;rand MFG Product #
BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF — DISPOSABLE, CHILD SIZE, SINGLE
TUBE CASMED MODEL 1320, ADAPTER. MO NO SUB 2 LEA $ 5.09 20/Box $101.80 Welch Allyn SOFT-09-1MQ
BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF — DISPOSABLE, ADULT REGULAR
SIZE, SINGLE TUBE CASMED MODEL 2635, ADAPTER: MQ NO 10 1EA $ 6.90 20/Box $138.00 Welch Allyn SOFT-11-1MQ
SUB
BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF — DISPOSABLE, ADULT LARGE SIZE,
SINGLE TUBE CASMED MODEL 3242, ADAPTER: MQ NO SUB 5 LEA 3 6.90 20/Box $138.00 Welch Allyn SOFT-12-1IMQ
BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF — DISPOSABLE, ADULT THIGH SIZE,
SINGLE TUBE CASMED MODEL 4250, ADAPTER: MQ NO SUB 2 LEA $ 948 20/Box $189.20 Welch Allyn SOFT-13-1IMQ
BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF — DISPOSABLE, INFANT SIZE,
DOUBLE TUBE CASMED MODEL 0814, ADAPTER: MQ NO SUB 39 LEA $ 525 1/Bach $5.25 Welch Allyn SOFT-07-2MQ
BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF — DISPOSABLE, CHILD SIZE, DOUBLE
TUBE CASMED MODEL 1320, ADAPTER: MQ NO SUB 43 1/EA $ 5.25 1/Each $5.25 Welch Allyn SOFT-09-2MQ
BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF — DISPOSABLE, ADULT REGULAR
SIZE, DOUBLE TUBE CASMED MODEL 2635, ADAPTER: MQ 2920 1EA $ 6.47 1/Each $6.47 Welch Allyn SOFT-10-2MQ
NO SUB
BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF — DISPOSABLE, ADULT LARGE SIZE,
DOUBLE TUBECASMED MODEL 3242, ADAPTER: MQ NO SUB 160 LEA 3 6.90 1/Each $6.90 Welch Allyn SOFT-11-2MQ
BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF — DISPOSABLE, ADULT THIGH SIZE,
DOUBLE TUBE CASMED MODEL 4250, ADAPTER: MQ NO SUB 40 LEA $ 948 1/Bach $9.46 Welch Allyn SOFT-13-2MQ
BLUNT CANNULA TIP ONLY SAFELINE # NF9210 200 1EA $ 0.29 400/Case $116.00 Safeline NF9210
BOX, CLEAR PLASTIC, 14.0 x 9.13 x 3.25 PLANO MODEL #
3TSO0LNG SUB 20 LEA $ 7.59 4/Case $30.36 Plano 2375002
BOUGIE- ET TUBE DISP INTRODUCER, BLUE COUDE TIP, 10 .
FRENCH x 70cm, PEDIATRIC 8 1/EA $ 6.85 1/Each $6.85 Sun Medical 9-0211-70
BOUGIE 15FR - ADULT, 5mm 1EA $ 6.85 1/Each $6.85 Sun Medical 9-0212-70
$§§:ELOW TAPE, PEDIATRIC EMERGENCY MEASURING , UEA s 251 Ueach 6381 pedia Tape 123457
BULB SYRINGE, 2 OZ VINYL, STERILE 50/CS 12 1EA $ 0.98 1/Each $0.98 Medegen Medical 4172
BUNTING- BABY BUNTING / SILVER SWADDLE, CONSERVERS
BODY HEAT IN NEWBORN INFANTS,EASY TO CARRY PACK 10 LEA $ 5.79 1/Each $5.79 Morrison Medical 0081
SIZE, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, STERILE GAM OR EQUAL
BURN SHEET 60X90 # 30061MS 50 LEA $ 2.50 1/Each $2.50 Dynarex 3520
BVM - BACTERIAL - VIRAL FILTER FOR BVM - #87-
FHE03003EA 250 1/EA $ 0.94 50/Case $47.00 Westmed 6216
BVM ADULT AMBU SPUR II [520211000] NO SUB 342 1EA $ 9.01 1/Each $9.01 Ambu 520 211 000




DESCRIPTION ESQ-I:I_QI\_IEI;':;L Packing for Single/Each is "1" Packing/Unit must be completed and priced MFGmeBerand MFG Product #
BVM CHILD AMBU SPUR Il [530213000] NO SUB 56 1EA $ 12.05 1/Each $12.05 Ambu 530 213 000
BVM INFANT AMBU SPUR 1 [540211000] NO SUB 40 1EA $ 12.05 1/Each $12.05 Ambu 540 211 000
CANISTER SUCTION, 800 ML CAPACITY- LATEX FREE, BEMIS, .
CANISTER FOR LCSU 3 KENTEX PART # 810800 OR EQUAL 168 LEA 3 270 1/Bach $2.70 Bemis Mfg. 8002 055
CARPUJECT HOLDER 50 1EA $ 0.03 1/Each $0.03 Pfizer 0409-2049-02
CATHETER, DUCANTO # 200-00002C NO SUB 100 LEA $ 1.90 1/Each $1.90 Sscor 200-00002C
CATHETER- SUCTION CATHETER, 10 FR WITH VALVE, ASinG
STERILE, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, LATEX FREE, 31 LEA $ 0.28 1/Each $0.28 oo AS363
CURAPLEX 36092
CATHETER- SUCTION CATHETER, 14 FR WITH VALVE, ASinG
STERILE, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, LATEX FREE, 31 1/EA $ 0.28 1/Each $0.28 oo AS365
CURAPLEX 36094
CATHETER- SUCTION CATHETER, 6.0 WITH VALVE, STERILE, Amsino
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, LATEX FREE, CURAPLEX 36090 29 1EA $ 0.28 1/Bach $0.28 International AS361
CENTER PUNCH, PINCH SPRING LOADED CENTER, DESIGNED American
TO SHATTER TEMPERED AUTO GLASS, FLM GENERAL #87 OR 13 1EA $ 6.04 1/Each $6.04 . ; 360

Diagnostic

EQUAL.
CID I-TEC, MULTI GRIP, ADULT SIZE, COMPLETE HEAD AND
CHIN STRAP, DISPOSABLE, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, I-TEC 1099 1EA $ 4.20 1/Each $4.20 ltec Mfg 104
MG100
CID I-TEC, MULTI GRIP, INFANT SIZE, COMPLETE HEAD AND
CHIN STRAP, DISPOSABLE, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, I-TEC 51 1EA $ 4.20 1/Each $4.20 ltec Mfg 103
MG300
CID I-TEC, MULTI GRIP, CHILD SIZE, COMPLETE HEAD AND
CHIN STRAP, DISPOSABLE, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, I-TECH 110 1EA $ 4.20 1/Each $4.20 ltec Mfg 102
MG200
CLIPBOARD- ALUMINUM WITH STORAGE COMPARTMENT,
8-1/2" X 14" X 1-1/2". SAUNDERS #SACM 8514 OR EQUAL 13 1/EA $ 23.56 1/Each $23.56 Saunders Mfg 11019
COBAN, 3-M MODEL 1582, SELF ADHERING WRAP, COLOR
BLUE OR CHOICE 568 1/EA $ 1.93 1/Each $1.93 3M Health Care 1582
COLLAR- EXTRACTION COLLAR, ADJUSTABLE TO ANY
ADULT SIZE NECK WITH 18 16 DIFFERENT SETTINGS, RANGES
FROM NECKLESS TO TALL SIZES, AMBU PERFIT ACE, AMBU 10 LEA $ 4.91 1/Bach $4.91 Ambu 000281 000
PART # 000281000 NO SUB
COLLAR-EXTRACTION COLLAR ADJUSTABLE TO INFANT.
PEDIATRIC- SMLADULT & GERIATRIC SETTINGS-AMBU-MINH 5 Arbu 000-281-106
PERFIT-ACENO-SUB
COLLAR- EXTRACTION COLLAR, ADJUSTABLE TO INFANT,
PEDIATRIC, SML ADULT & GERIATRIC SETTINGS. AMBU MINI 50 1EA $ 5.04 1/Each $5.04 Ambu 000 281 106
PERFIT ACE, NO SUB
EERS\G;AL COLLAR, LUBO ADJUST. ADULT #INV-02-000-R02 2332 VEA NG BID




DESCRIPTION ESQ-I:I_QI\_IEI;':;L Packing for Single/Each is "1" Packing/Unit must be completed and priced MFGmeBerand MFG Product #
CERVICAL COLLAR, LUBO ADJUST. PEDIATRIC # INV-03-0000- 273 1/EA NO BID
IT NO SUB
COMPRESS, INSTANT COLD COMPRESS MAINTAINS TEMP,
BETWEEN 0 AND 2.7 DEGREES C FOR 30 MIN. 6" X 8", DURO- 601 1/EA $ 0.57 1/Each $0.57 Halyard 59688
MED IND #612-0010-9824 OR EQUAL, 24/CASE
CONTAINER- SHARPS BIO HAZARD, PUNCTURE RESISTANT
POLY-PROPYLENE RED CONTAINER WITH LID, 4.7 QT 322 1/EA $ 5.71 1/Each $5.71 Medegen Medical 184R
CAPACITY, NON STACKABLE STYLE,. MFR # 184R NO SUB
CONTAINER- SHARPS BIO HAZARD, PUNCTURE RESISTANT .
WITH LID, CURAPLEX 32 QUART # 1860-08705 NO SUB 10 1/EA $ 12.00 10/Case $120.00 Medegen Medical 8705
CONTAINER- SHARPS BIO HAZARD, PUNCTURE RESISTANT -
WITH LID, KENDALL #31143657, NO SUB 222 1/EA $ 1.82 1/Each $1.82 Covidien 8900
CONTAINER-SHARPS 5 QUART TRANSPARENT RED SHARP
SAFETY SHARPS CONTAINER W/ MAILBOX STYLE LID 20/CS, 126 1/EA $ 4.46 1/Each $4.46 Covidien 85131
COVIDEN # 85131 NO SUB
CONTAINER-SHARPS-A-GATOR MULTI-PURPOSE SHARPS, -
1GAL, RED, WITH SLIDE LID, COVIDEN # 31143699 363 1/EA $ 2.97 1/Each $2.97 Covidien 31143699
CONTAINER- SHARPS SOLO, COMPACT SIZE, CURAPLEX #
64250 NO SUB 20 1/EA $ 1.92 1/Each $1.92 Medsource MS-64250
BITRAC ED FULL FACE MASK AND HEAD STRAP, ADULT
SMALL 10/CS, PULMODYNE # 313-7028 30 1/EA $ 21.28 1/Each $21.28 Pulmodyne 313-7028
BITRAC ED FULL FACE MASK AND HEAD STRAP, ADULT
LARGE 10/CS, PULMODYNE #313-7030EA 60 1/EA $ 21.28 1/Each $21.28 Pulmodyne 313-7030
02 MAX BiTrac ED Mask, w/ Neb, Adult MED, w/3-SET Valve
10ea/cs, PULMODYNE # 313-7556XN-1 104 1/EA $ 47.32 1/Each $47.32 Pulmodyne 313-7556XN-1
02 MAX BiTrac ED MASK, w/NEB, Adult LG, w/3-SET Valve
10ea/cs, PULMODYNE # 313-7555XN-1 196 1/EA $ 45.00 1/Each $45.00 Pulmodyne 313-7555XN-1
CYLINDER- 02 CYLINDER, "D" SIZE, ALUMINUM WITH
TOGGLE; EMPTY TANK, CATALINA CYLINDERS PART # MD 80 1/EA $ 44,50 1/Each $44.50 Cramer Decker MDCYLT
G/D YDO TOGGLE, NO suB
DETECTOR- CO2 DETECTOR END TIDAL,EASY-CAP, STERILE, .
NELLCOR #NE EC6, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, 6BOX NO SUB 45 1/EA $ 9.65 1/Each $9.65 Tyco Mallinckrodt EASYCAP 11 6
DETECTOR- CO2 DETECTOR END TIDAL, PEDI-CAP, STERILE, .
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, WESTMED #562135 6BOX NO SUB 36 1/EA $ 9.65 1/Each $9.65 Tyco Mallinckrodt PEDICAP 6
DRESSING- IV SITE DRESSING, 2-3/8" X 2-3/4", 3M TEGADERM
#1624W, 100BOX NO SUB 162 1/EA $ 0.30 100/Box $30.00 3M 1624W
DRESSING-MULTI TRAUMA, STERILE, 10" X 30",
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, DYNAREX 3531 108 1/EA $ 0.88 1/Each $0.88 Dukal 1030TD
2DISS OHIO MALE ADAPTER X, W/ICHECK VALVE # WE-MQ 201- 10 1/EA $ 16.00 1/Each $16.00 Western Medical MQ201-2
DISS, CHEMETRON QUICK CONNECT, OXYGEN DISS MALE
WITH CHECK VALVE # 3114 10 1/EA $ 21.00 1/Each $21.00 Chemetron MF3114




DESCRIPTION ESQ-I:I_QI\_IEI;':;L Packing for Single/Each is "1" Packing/Unit must be completed and priced MFGmeBerand MFG Product #
DISS, 02 DISS ADAPTER W/CHECK VALVE # EAW-293310 10 1/EA 7.80 1/Each $7.80 Precision Medical 0712
E(IJS'\SI;\IOE)C(;)G#E?S;%;JPLER’ OHMEDA X DISS MALE (QUICK 10 1EA 36.00 1/Each $36.00 Precision Medical 2155
DISS, OXYGEN HOSE 1 FT DISS FEMALE HAND TIGHT XDISS | 5 vEA sos| w2 | predsionedical | HA-UING00505
CE;):EAP'?SRTECC:)TCIZ%I\FIQIDFOAM EAR PLUGS WITH NRR OF 29 Db. OR 300 1/EA 0.08 1/Each $0.08 Gateway Safety 92202
EBECTRODE EKG , AMBU BLUE SENSOR SP [SP-00-S/50] NO 4520 1/EA 11.20 1/Each $11.20 Ambu SP-00-S/50
ELECTRODE PAD, CARDIAC SCIENCE ADULT REF # 9131 37 1/EA 40.00 1/Each $40.00 Cardiac Science 9131-001
57L3EOCTRODE PAD, CARDIAC SCIENCE CHILD/INFANT REF # 22 1/EA 88.14 1/Each $88.14 Cardiac Science 9730-002
ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE HOLDER, ADULT SIZE, DISPOSABLE,
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED. THOMAS SELECT NO SUB # 600- 169 1/EA 2.57 1/Each $2.57 Laerdal 600-10000
40000
DISPOSABLE, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED. NOSUB #60020000| & LEA 257 Esch 5257 Laeral 600-20000
\EVNRI?A?D-IEESL TUBE SIZE 6, DISPOSABLE, INDIVIDUALLY 51 1/EA 9.80 1/Each $9.80 Tyco Mallinckrodt 86349
SVNR?A%-;ESL TUBE SIZE7, DISPOSABLE, INDIVIDUALLY 44 1/EA 9.80 1/Each $9.80 Tyco Mallinckrodt 86351
ET TUBE UNCUFFED W/STYLET - 2.5MM, Item # 499-4854 90 1/EA 3.60 1/Each $3.60 Teleflex 506525
ET TUBE UNCUFFED W/STYLET - 3.0MM, ITEM # 499-4856 100 1/EA 3.60 1/Each $3.60 Teleflex 506530
ET TUBE UNCUFFED W/STYLET - 3.5MM, ITEM # 499-6132 110 1/EA 3.60 1/Each $3.60 Teleflex 506535
ET TUBE UNCUFFED W/STYLET - 4.0MM, ITEM # 499-8532 80 1/EA 3.60 1/Each $3.60 Teleflex 506540
ET TUBE UNCUFFED W/Stylet - 4.5mm Item # 499-6565 70 1/EA 3.60 1/Each $3.60 Teleflex 506545
ET TUBE UNCUFFED W/Stylet - 5.0mm Item # 499-5733 40 1/EA 3.60 1/Each $3.60 Teleflex 506550
ET TUBE CUFFED W/Stylet - 5.5mm Item # 499-9751 100 1/EA 3.92 1/Each $3.92 Teleflex 504555
ET TUBE CUFFED W/Stylet - 6.0mm Item # 499-4847 100 1/EA 3.92 1/Each $3.92 Teleflex 504560




DESCRIPTION ESQ-I:I_QI\_IEI;':;L Packing for Single/Each is "1" Packing/Unit must be completed and priced MFGmeBerand MFG Product #
ET TUBE CUFFED W/Stylet - 7.0mm  Item # 499-4850 130 1/EA $ 3.92 1/Each $3.92 Teleflex 504570
ET TUBE CUFFED W/Stylet - 7.5mm  ltem # 499-4851 160 1EA $ 3.92 1/Each $3.92 Teleflex 504575
ET TUBE CUFFED W/Stylet - 8.0mm  Item # 499-9427 80 1/EA $ 3.92 1/Each $3.92 Teleflex 504580
ET TUBE CUFFED W/Stylet - 8.5mm  Item # 499-9338 100 1/EA $ 3.92 1/Each $3.92 Teleflex 504585
ET TUBE CUFFED W/STYLET -9.0mm Item # 499-4853 80 1/EA $ 3.92 1/Each $3.92 Teleflex 504590
EXTRACTION AND IMMOBILIZATION DEVICE DESIGNED FOR
INFANTS AND CHILDREN UP TO APPRX. 60 LBS. PEDI- 4 1/EA $ 230.00 1/Each $230.00 Fleming 35840-YL
IMMOBILIZER BY QUADMED MODEL #35090. NO SUB
EXTRACTION DEVICE, K.E.D. FERNO WASH. #125 OR EQUAL 4 1/EA $ 124.68 1/Each $124.68 Ferno 0313676
EZ-10 CHILD, 9018-VC-005, PD STERILE 15MM NEEDLE SET .
WITH WRIST BANDS & EZ CONNECTS  (pink) 55 1/EA $ 65.83 1/Each $65.83 Sam Medical 10705-1P-EN
EZ-10 ADULT ,9001-VC-005, AD STERILE 25MM NEEDLE SET .
WITH WRIST BANDS & EZ CONNECTS (blue) 240 1/EA $ 65.83 1/Each $65.83 Sam Medical 10706-1P-EN
EZ-10 LARGE ADULT, 9079-VC-005, LD STERILE 45MM NEEDLE .
SET WITH WRIST BANDS & EZ CONNECTS (yellow) 55 1/EA $ 65.83 1/Each $65.83 Sam Medical 10707-1P-EN
EZ-10 G3 POWER DRIVER, 9058, 4 1/EA $ 134.52 1/Each $134.52 Sam Medical 10700-EN
EZ-10 (Case) POWER DRIVER VASCULAR ACCESS PACK # 9065 4 1/EA NO BID
FILTER STRAW, HENRY SCHEIN # 507-6773 10 1/EA $ 0.50 1/Each $0.50 B. Braun Medical 415021
FORCEPS- 9-2/3", MAGILL TYPE, FIRST SURGICAL #3172 OR 10 1/EA $ 386 1/Each $3.86 Maco International 7338
EQUAL
FORCEPS- MAGILL - PEDIATRIC SIZE 8" STAINLESS STEEL 10 1/EA $ 3.86 1/Each $3.86 Maco International 7337
GAUZE STERILE PETROLATUM 3" X 9", KENDALL #7837 OR .
EQUAL, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, 180 1/EA $ 0.88 1/Each $0.88 Derma Sciences DKC20056
GLOVE, POWDER-FREE NITRILE EXAM GLOVES, MICRO-FLEX .
ULTRA SENSE EC SMALL [#XS-USE-880S] NO SUB 202 1/EA $ 0.107 100/Box $10.70 Microflex USE-880-S
GLOVE, POWDER-FREE NITRILE EXAM GLOVES, MICRO-FLEX .
ULTRA SENSE EC MEDIUM [#XS-USE-880M] NO SUB 880 1/EA $ 0.107 100/Box $10.70 Microflex USE-880-M
GLOVE, POWDER-FREE NITRILE EXAM GLOVES, MICRO-FLEX .
ULTRA SENSE EC LARGE [#XS-USE-880L] NO SUB 1928 1/EA $ 0.107 100/Box $10.70 Microflex USE-880-L
GLOVE, POWDER-FREE NITRILE EXAM GLOVES, MICRO-FLEX .
ULTRA SENSE EC X-LARGE [#XS-USE-880XL] NO SUB 782 1/EA $ 0.107 100/Box $10.70 Microflex USE-880-XL




DESCRIPTION ESQ-I:I_QI\_IEI;':;L Packing for Single/Each is "1" Packing/Unit must be completed and priced MFGmeBerand MFG Product #
GLOVE, POWDER-FREE NITRILE EXAM GLOVES, MICRO-FLEX .
ULTRA SENSE EC XX-LARGE [#XS-USE-880XXL] NO SUB 52 1/EA $ 0.107 100/Box $10.70 Microflex USE-880-XXL
GLOVE, STERILE GLOVE SIZE 6.0, # 15006PR 10 1/EA NO BID
GLOVE, STERILE GLOVE SIZE 7.0, # 15007PR 10 1/EA NO BID
GLOVE, STERILE GLOVE SIZE 8.0, # 15009PR 10 1/EA NO BID
GLUCOMETER, -OPTIUMEZ -NO SUB 95 1/EA $ - 1/Each $0.00 Abbott Diabetes 71065
I-Gel #1 (10 per box) # 8201000 32 1/EA $ 13.80 1/Each $13.80 Intersurgical 8201000
I-Gel #1.5 (10 per box) # 8215000 32 1/EA $ 13.80 1/Each $13.80 Intersurgical 8215000
I-Gel #2 (10 per box) # 8202000 30 1/EA $ 13.80 1/Each $13.80 Intersurgical 8202000
I-Gel #2.5 (10 per box) # 8225000 30 1/EA $ 13.80 1/Each $13.80 Intersurgical 8225000
I-Gel #3 (6 per box) # 8203000 49 1/EA $ 13.80 1/Each $13.80 Intersurgical 8203000
1-Gel #4 (6 per box) # 8204000 71 1/EA $ 13.80 1/Each $13.80 Intersurgical 8204000
I-Gel #5 (6 per box) # 8205000 50 1/EA $ 13.80 1/Each $13.80 Intersurgical 8205000
KLING, 4” X 4.1 YARDS, CONFORMING STRETCHED GAUZE, 120 1/EA $ 0.28 1/Each $0.28 Dukal 704
K-Y JELLY PACKET, WATER SOLUBLE LUBRICATING JELLY 3
gm. INDIVIDUAL STERILE PACKETS 300 1/EA $ 0.04 1/Each $0.04 Dynarex 1250
ISOLATION KIT, INCL GWON, PR GLOVES, TOWELLETTE, 50 1/EA NO BID
BIOHAZARD BAG, MASK W/SHIELD, SHOE COVERS, CAP, DISP
IV INFUSION SET, 20 DROP, CHECK_ VALVE, 2 SMARTSITE 80 1EA NO BID
NEEDLE-FREE-VALVE PORTS, 116 inch, # 2420-0500
IV- 8" STANDARD BORE I.V. EXTENSION SET WITH AMSAFE
INJECTION SITE NON-DEHP, LATEX FREE, AMSAFE TM
NEEDLESS INJECTION SITE, MALE AND FEMALE LUER, 19000 1/EA $ 1.19 1/Each $1.19 Amsino AE3108
ROBERT CLAMP, APPROXIMATING PRIMING VOLUME 2ML,
PACKAGED IN POLY POUCH. AMISINO #AE3108 NO SUB
IV ADMINISTRATION SET WITH PRE-ATTACHED EXTENSION .
SET. BY AMSINO REF #108305, LATEX FREE. 10 DROP 8000 LEA $ 1o 1/Bach $1.97 Amsino 108305
IV ADMINISTRATION SET WITH PRE-ATTACHED EXTENSION .
SET. BY AMSINO REF #608305, LATEX FREE. 60 DROP 250 LEA ¥ 212 1/Bach $2.12 Amsino 608305
IV CATHETER, 14 GA X 1-75”, BECTON DICKINSON INSYTE, L
AUTOGUARD , NO SUB # 381467 200 1/EA $ 2.11 1/Each $2.11 Becton Dickinson 381467
IV CATHETER, 16 GA X 1-1/6”, BECTON DICKINSON INSYTE, .
AUTOGUARD , NO SUB # 381454 250 1/EA $ 2.11 1/Each $2.11 Becton Dickinson 381454




DESCRIPTION ESQ-I:I_QI\_IEI;':;L Packing for Single/Each is "1" Packing/Unit must be completed and priced MFGmeBerand MFG Product #
IV CATHETER, 18 GA X 1-16", BECTON DICKINSON INSYTE, L
AUTOGUARD. NO SUB # 381844 9600 1EA $ 2.00 1/Each $2.00 Becton Dickinson 381444
IV CATHETER, 20 GA X 1", BECTON DICKINSON INSYTE, L
AUTOGUARD, NO SUB # 381834 12000 1/EA $ 2.00 1/Each $2.00 Becton Dickinson 381434
IV CATHETER, 22 GA X 1", BECTON DICKINSON INSYTE, I
AUTOGUARD, NO SUB # 381823 2000 1/EA $ 2.00 1/Each $2.00 Becton Dickinson 381423
IV CATHETER, 24 GA X .75, BECTON DICKINSON INSYTE, I
AUTOGUARD, NO SUB # 381812 700 1/EA $ 2.00 1/Each $2.00 Becton Dickinson 381412
CATHETER, DECOMPRESSION NEEDLE, 14 GA X 1.25IN, BD L
ANGIOCATH # 352832 50 1EA $ 1.45 1/Each $1.45 Becton Dickinson 382268
CATHETER, DECOMPRESSION NEEDLE, 14 GA X 3.25IN, BD . .
ANGIOCATH # 601890 50 1/EA $ 6.88 1/Each $6.88 Smiths Medical 304806
LANCETS, Surgilance Needle Lancet, Orange, 2.2mm Depth, 21ga, .
Med Blood Flow 20-40 ul NO SUB 75 1/EA $ 0.095 100/Box $9.50 MediPurpose SLN240
LARYNGQSCOPE, INTUBRITE, HANDLE ADULT (PURPLE), 30 1VEA $ 6.34 1/Each $6.34 Salter Labs 2015.C
Henry Schein # 499-9298
LARYNGOSCOPE, INTUBRITE, HANDLE pediatric (PURPLE),
Henry Schein # 129-4605 10 LEA $ 6.34 1/Each $6.34 Salter Labs 2016.C
Intubrite - LARYNGOSCOPE PURPLE Mac 2 Blade Disposable (box 2 1VEA $ 5.89 1/Each $5.89 Salter Labs 1022.C
of 20) INT-1022
Intubrite - LARYNGOSCOPE PURPLE Mac 3 Blade Disposable (box
of 20) INT-1023 3 1/EA $ 5.89 1/Each $5.89 Salter Labs 1023.C
Intubrite - LARYNGOSCOPE PURPLE Mac 4 Blade Disposable (box 4 VEA $ 5.89 1/Each $5.89 Salter Labs 1024.C
of 20) INT-1024
Intubrite - LARYNGOSCOPE PURPLE MILLER 0 Blade Disposable
(box of 20) INT-1030 1 1EA $ 5.89 1/Each $5.89 Salter Labs 1030.C
Intubrite - LARYNGOSCOPE PURPLE MILLER 1 Blade Disposable
(box of 20) INT-1031 2 1/EA $ 5.89 1/Each $5.89 Salter Labs 1031.C
Intubrite - LARYNGOSCOPE PURPLE MILLER 2 Blade Disposable
(box of 20) INT-1032 1 1EA $ 5.89 1/Each $5.89 Salter Labs 1032.C
Intubrite - LARYNGOSCOPE PURPLE MILLER 3 Blade Disposable
(box of 20) INT-1033 2 1/EA $ 5.89 1/Each $5.89 Salter Labs 1033.C
Intubrite - LARYNGOSCOPE PURPLE MILLER 4 Blade Disposable
(box of 20) INT-1034 2 1EA $ 5.89 1/Each $5.89 Salter Labs 1034.C
LUER LOCK TO LUER LOCK, RAPIDFILL CONNECTOR,
BAXTER # H93813901 100 1/EA $ 1.96 50/Case $98.00 Baxter Healthcare H93813901
MASK- OXYGEN MASK, PEDIATRIC, MEDIUM
CONCENTRATION WITH 7' DELIVERY TUBE, LATEX FREE, 100 1/EA $ 0.92 1/Each $0.92 Medsource MS-25058
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, DISPOSABLE, CURAPLEX # 30053
MASK- OXYGEN MASK, Adult CONCENTRATION WITH 7'
DELIVERY TUBE, LATEX FREE, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, 1250 1/EA $ 0.74 1/Each $0.74 Medsource MS-25059
DISPOSABLE, NON-REBREATHER, VENTLAB 2101
MASK- OXYGEN MASK, INFANT, MEDIUM CONCENTRATION
WITH 7' DELIVERY TUBE, LATEX FREE, INDIVIDUALLY 50 1/EA $ 1.24 50/Case $62.00 Medsource MS-25055-U
WRAPPED, DISPOSABLE, CURAPLEX 30058
MASK, N-95 UNIVERSAL SIZE 4000 1/EA $ 1.01 20/Box $20.20 3M 1860
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EST ANNUAL
QTY -Each

Packing for Single/Each is "1"
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MFG & Brand
Name

MFG Product #

MASK-W/ SHIELD, ANTI FOG, OPTICALLY CLEAR, LATEX
FREE,13" IMPENETRABLE FOAM BARRIER,WIDE COVERAGE,
DISPOSABLE "MOORE MEDICAL" # 92685 OR EQUAL

1400

1EA $

1.58

1/Each

$1.58

Alpha Protech

5194-E

MASK, SURGICAL, FLUID RESTRAIN, 99% BACTERIAL
FILTRATION EFFICIENCY, STANDARD EARLOOP, ULINE # S-
10478

4000

1/EA $

0.28

40/Box

$11.29

Halyard Health

47107

NASAL CANNULA, ADULT,DISPOSABLE WITH FLARED
NASAL TIP, CLEAR, SOFT VINYL, OVER THEEAR FIT SECURES
POSITION ON PATIENT, WITH 7" DELIVERY TUBE,
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, HENRY SCHEIN # 900-7037

920

1/EA $

0.29

1/Each

$0.29

Medsource

MS-24004

NASAL CANNULA, PEDIATRIC WITH FLARED NASAL TIP,
CLEAR, SOFT VINYL, OVER THEEAR FIT SECURES POSITION
ON PATIENT, WITH 7" DELIVERY TUBE, INDIVIDUALLY
WRAPPED, LSP 33604, DISPOSABLE, HENRY SCHEIN # 900-
7034

150

1EA $

0.55

1/Each

$0.55

Medsource

MS-24101

NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY, 12 FR, RUSCH 1231.12 OR
EQUAL, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

60

1/EA $

2.44

1/Each

$2.44

Teleflex

123314

NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY, 16 FR, RUSCH 1231.16 OR
EQUAL, 10BOX, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

140

1EA $

2.44

1/Each

$2.44

Teleflex

123316

NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY, 20 FR, RUSCH 1231.20F OR
EQUAL, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

60

1/EA $

2.30

1/Each

$2.30

Teleflex

123120

NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY, 22 FR, RUSCH 1231.22F OR
EQUAL, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

100

1EA $

2.30

1/Each

$2.30

Teleflex

123122

NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY, 24 FR, RUSCH 1231.24F OR
EQUAL, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

90

1/EA $

2.30

1/Each

$2.30

Teleflex

123124

NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY, 28 FR, RUSCH 1231.28F OR
EQUAL, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

90

1EA $

2.30

1/Each

$2.30

Teleflex

123128

NASOPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY, 30 FR, RUSCH 1231.30F OR
EQUAL, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

80

1/EA $

2.30

1/Each

$2.30

Teleflex

123130

NEBULIZER WITH MEDICATION CHAMBER, CAP, T-PIECE
AND MOUTH PIECE, WITH 7' DELIVERY TUBE, LATEX FREE
DISPOSABLE UP-DRAFTE, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED,
CURAPLEX 301-200

500

1EA $

0.82

1/Each

$0.82

Medsource

MS-22883

NEBULIZIER w/MASK ADULT COMBINATION FOR
DELIVERY OF AEROSOLIZED MEDICATION THROUGH A
MASK. COMPLETE WITH MASK, MEDICATION CHAMBER AND
7' TUBING, LATEX FREE, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED,
DISPOSABLE, MEDSOURCE MS-22885

920

1/EA $

1.13

1/Each

$1.13

Medsource

MS-22885

NEEDLES- HYPODERMIC, 19 GA X 1", LUER-LOCK HUB,
SAFETY NEEDLE MEGELLAN 928946

200

1EA $

0.28

500/Case

$140.00

Cardinal Health

8881850910

NEEDLES- HYPODERMIC, 21 GA X 1", LUER-LOCK HUB,
SAFETY NEEDLE SMITHS MEDICAL 4287

100

1/EA $

0.33

1/Each

$0.33

Smiths Medical

4287

NEEDLES- HYPODERMIC, 23 GA X 1", LUER-LOCK HUB,
SAFETY NEEDLE SMITHS MEDICAL 4290

150

1EA $

0.33

1/Each

$0.33

Smiths Medical

4290

NEEDLES- HYPODERMIC, 25 GA X 1", LUER-LOCK HUB,
SAFETY SMITHS MEDICAL 4290

150

1/EA $

0.33

1/Each

$0.33

Smiths Medical

4292

OBSTETICAL KIT, OBS. DELIVERY KIT, COMPLETE IN SOFT
PACK, DYNAREX #4902 OR EQUAL, DISPOSABLE

45

1EA $

6.40

10/Case

$64.00

Dynarex

4902

OINTMENT- NEOSPORIN OINTMENT, FOUGERA OR EQUAL,
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED IN FOIL PK., 1/32 OZ.

300

1/EA $

0.08

144/Box

$11.52

Med Plus Services

NWI TAOP9

OROPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY, 40 MM BERMAN STYLE, DUAL
VENTILATED CHANNEL, WITH SUCTION CATHETER ACCESS
- INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

50

1EA $

0.18

1/Each

$0.18

Teleflex

121801




DESCRIPTION ESQ-I:I_QI\_IEI;':;L Packing for Single/Each is "1" Packing/Unit must be completed and priced MFGmeBerand MFG Product #

OROPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY, 50 MM BERMAN STYLE, DUAL

VENTILATED CHANNEL, WITH SUCTION CATHETER ACCESS 20 1/EA $ 0.18 1/Each $0.18 Teleflex 121850

INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

OROPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY, 70 MM BERMAN STYLE, DUAL

VENTILATED CHANNEL, WITH SUCTION CATHETER ACCESS 47 1/EA $ 0.18 1/Each $0.18 Teleflex 121870

INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

OROPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY, 90 MM BERMAN STYLE, DUAL

VENTILATED CHANNEL, WITH SUCTION CATHETER ACCESS 120 1/EA $ 0.18 1/Each $0.18 Teleflex 121804

INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

OROPHARYNGEAL AIRWAY, 100 MM BERMAN STYLE, DUAL

VENTILATED CHANNEL, WITH SUCTION CATHETER ACCESS LEA $ 0.18 1/Each $0.18 Teleflex 121805

INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED

PEEP, DISPOSABLE PEEP 20 VALVE, AMBU # 199002020 60 1/EA $ 3.05 1/Each $3.05 Ambu 199 002 020

PENLITE / PUPIL GAUGE, DISPOSABLE, BOUNDTREE American

#40000015P OR EQUAL. 54 1/EA $ 0.64 1/Each $0.64 Diagnostic 351PLA
The Pillow

PILLOW, DISPOSABLE INFLATEABLE # 115349 10 1/EA $ 2.87 1/Each $2.87 Factory 51107-652

PRESSURE INFUSER 1000ML, INFU-SURG DISPOSABLE Ethox

PRESSURE INFUSER BAG, w/BULB AND GAUGE, SINGLE 50 1/EA $ 17.50 1/Each $17.50 Int ti | 4010H

PATIENT USE, 1000 MI nternationa

E)R(E;?URE MONITORING SET 84", EDWARDS TRUWAVE # 10 1/EA $ 14.65 20/Case $293.00 ICU Medical 42585-05

PRESSURE TRANSDUCER, TRUWANVE #PX284 20

RAZORS FOR EKG SKIN PREP, DISPOSABLE SAFETY RAZOR,

DYNAREX GALLANT # 4251 NO SUB 1000 1/EA $ 0.39 50/Box $19.50 Dynarex 4251

REGULATOR- 02 PRESSURE REGULATOR FOR "M" CYLINDER, 12 1/EA $ 69.99 1/Each $69.99 Inovo IN2800-R-2

REGULATOR- 02 REGULATOR FOR "D" OR "E" 02 CYLINDER,

WITH AT LEAST 1 DISS PORT, LITER FLOW TO 25 LPM ALLIED 30 1/EA $ 92.32 1/Each $92.32 O-Two Medical 01R001023-B

#L.106-260-STL OR EQUAL

RESTRAINTS-SOFT RESTRAINTS WITH A CHINCH WRIST J.T. Posey

HOLDER, POSEY 2528.1 NO SUB 142 LEA $ 6.50 1/Each $6.50 Company 2530

RESTRAINT, CHILD RESTRAINT, QUANTUM ACR4 6 1/EA $ 706.82 1/Each $706.82 Quantum EMS ACR4

RESTRAINT, PEDIATRIC RESTRAINT SYSTEM QNTQ

QUANTUM EMS PART # Q-ACRA4 6 1/EA $ 706.82 1/Each $706.82 Quantum EMS ACR4

RING CUTTER- CHROME HANDLE WITH SAFETY LEVER, FLM Maco

' 10 1/EA 6.00 1/Each 6.00 . RINGCUTTER

#RC-1 OR EQUAL s s International

SUPER SAMI-CLOTH PDI PROFESSIONAL DISPOSABLE .

Q551752 (purple) 160 per pk (Non-bleach) 1/EA $ 4,75 1/Each $4.75 NicePak PDI Q55172

SCAPEL- #11 BLADE, STERILE WITH PLASTIC HANDLE,

DISPOSABLE, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, 40 1/EA $ 0.45 10/Box $4.50 Dynarex 4111

SEAL 2 IN 1 FOR O2 REGULATOR, E033-019-100 2000 1/EA $ 0.23 1/Each $0.23 Cramer Decker 3CL-3-1000




EST ANNUAL

MFG & Brand

DESCRIPTION QTY -Each Packing for Single/Each is "1" Packing/Unit must be completed and priced Name MFG Product #
SCISSORS- ALL PURPOSE UTILITY SCISSORS, 7-1/4" COLD American
FORGED STAINLESS STEEL BLADE WITH SAFETY TIP. 172 1EA 1.99 1/Each $1.99 oi i 320BK
CONTOURED POLYPROPYLENE HANDLES, lagnostic
SCOOPE STRETCHER STRAPS - ORANGE-- 2 PIECE, NYLON
WEBBING STRAPS, WITH PLASTIC PUSH BUTTON BUCKLE, 5 75 1EA 12.42 1/Each $12.42 Morrison Medical 1210-ORANGE
FT O.A.L., LOOP-LOK STYLE END. Item # B0124
2in 1 SEAL AND RETAINER FOR 870 POST VALVE
(EVERGREEN MIDWEST CO # E033-019-100 - red) NO SUB 1500 1EA NOBID
Slide Board (Long), PRO SLIDER BOARD, STATFORCE # MOBI- 6 VEA 97 28 UEach 59728 Schuerch 6000069
SLIDER BK Corporation
gsPl_GINT ANKLE HITCH FOR FERNOTRAC HARE SPLINT # 499- A VEA 16.00 UEach $16.00 Faretec 1124900
SPLINT - TRACTION SPLINT, ADULT , SAGER BILATERIAL .
MINTO RESEARCH AND DEVELOPMENT INC., 660202, NO SUB 4 1EA 332.70 1/Bach $332.70 Minto 5304
SPLINT- TRACTION SPLINT , ADULT, FERNOTRAC , HARE .
#FW444 OR EQUIVALANT 4 1/EA 381.15 1/Each $381.15 Ferno Washington 822182
SPLINT- TRACTION SPLINT , CHILD, FERNOTRAC , HARE .
#FWA443 OR EQUIVALANT 3 1/EA 381.15 1/Each $381.15 Ferno Washington 822181
SPLINT, SAM SPLINT, 18 in, FLATFOLD, WATERPROOF, .
RADIOLUCENT. RESUABLE. ORANGE/BLUE COLOR 338 1/EA 6.30 1/Each $6.30 Sam Medical SP502-OB-EN
SPONGES - STERILE SPONGES 4" X 4", DYNAREX #3342 OR - UEA 0.047 50/Box $2.35 Dynarex o
EQUAL
SPONGES- NON-STERILE SPONGES, 4" X 4", DYNAREX #3243,
12 PLY ONLY. 400 1EA 0.01 200/Bag $2.00 Dukal 2104
STETHOSCOPE- SPRAGUE TYPE ADULT AND PEDIATRIC American
DIAPHRAGM 16" TUBING, ADC AN 640 OR EQUAL COLORS: 60 1EA 8.40 1/Each $8.40 o t. 640BK
BLACK, BLUE, GREEN lagnostic
STRAPS- PATIENT LSB RESTRAINT STRAP, ORANGE IN Compliance
COLOR, 2" X 9' POLYPROPYLENE WEBBING WITH PLASTIC 3126 1/EA 16.31 1/Each $16.31 M %. | 602
SIDE RELEASE BUCKLE edica
STRAP STRETCHER, RESTRAINT, THIGH, IMPERVIOUS,
METAL BUCKLE, LOOP END, YELLOW (1300XYL) 2 PIECE LAP
STRAP WITH A METAL PUSH BUTTON BUCKLE. LOOP LOK 60 1/EA 11.00 1/Bach $11.00 C M C Rescue 201903
ENDS, COLOR YELLOW (1300XYL)
STRAP STRETCHER, MORRISON PATHO-SHIELD STRAP,
METAL BUCKLE, 2 PC STRAP WITH LOOP ENDS, COLOR 60 1EA 7.84 1/Each $7.84 Morrison Medical 1300-ORANGE
YELLOW (MORRISON MEDICAL 1301PYL-9)
STRETCHER HARNESS, RESTRAINT, SHOULDER,
IMPERVIOUS, METAL BUCKLE, LOOP END, YELLOW
(1385XYL-9) SHOULDER HARNESS SYSTEM INCORPORATES 2 Dick Medical ]
ADJUSTABLE SHOULDER STRAPS AND A DOUBLE ADJUST, 2 61 1EA 32.00 1/Bach 3 Supply 31160-YELLOW
PIECE 9 ft. LAP STRAP WITH A METAL PUSH BUTTON
BUCKLE. LOOP LOCK ENDS
STRETCHER- SCOOP STRETCHER WITH 3 PATIENT 2 1EA 919.74 1/Each $919.74 Ferno Washington 00065EXL

RESTRAINT STRAPS FERNO #FW65, NO SUB




DESCRIPTION ESQ-I:I_QI\_IEI;':;L Packing for Single/Each is "1" Packing/Unit must be completed and priced MFGmeBerand MFG Product #
SUNSCREEN (SUNX)TOWELETTE DISPENSER PACK (50),
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED TOWELETTES, UVA/UVB 200 1/EA $ 0.59 25/Box $14.75 Coretex Products 71430
PROTECTION. Item # 1410-12224
Syringe, 1cc, 25 ga x 5/8 inch, Removable Needle, HENRY SCHEIN # 400 1UEA $ 011 1/Each $0.11 Dynarex 6937
900-4459
SYRINGE 3CC WITH REMOVABLE NEEDLE 23 G X 1IN,
HENRY SCHEIN900-4460 3400 1/EA $ 0.08 1/Each $0.08 Dynarex 7001
SYRINGE ONLY LUER LOCK 10CC 820 1/EA $ 0.18 1/Each $0.18 Dynarex 6990
SYRINGE ONLY LUER LOCK 30CC 44 1/EA $ 0.27 1/Each $0.27 Dynarex 6992
SYRINGE ONLY LUER LOCK 50CC 16 1/EA $ 0.53 160/Case $85.00 Becton Dickinson 309653
TAPE, CLOTH 3 IN X 10 YR 4/BX 240 1/EA $ 2.56 4/Box $10.24 Dukal C310
LgPSEl'J;RANSPORE SURGICAL TAPE 1 X 10 YARDS, SM 151527 1032 1EA $ 1.24 1/Each $1.24 3M Health Care 1527-1
TEST STRIP FOR BLOOD GLUCOSE MEDISENSE, .
GLUCOMETER, # 57599-9838-4 NO SUB 311 1/EA $ 0.54 100/Box $54.00 Abbott Diabetes 80116-70
THERMOMETER DIGITAL, DISPOSABLE, BOUNDTREE 508-15- 1 1/EA $ 194 20/Box $38.80 Amenca_n 412-00
713-000 Diagnostic
THERMOMETER DIGITAL, SURE TEMP-PLUS 690 ELECTRONIC
THERMOMETER 8 1/EA $ 268.50 1/Each $268.50 Welch Allyn 01690-200
THERMOMETER COVERS, PROBE COVERS FOR SURETEMP
THERMOMETERS, DISPOSABLE, # 901010 160 1/EA $ 0.036 250/Box $9.00 Welch Allyn 05031-750
THERMOMETER, NON-CONTACT INFRARED # IR300 10 1/EA $ 99.54 1/Each $99.54 Medsource MS-131002
THERMOMETER, PROBE WITH ORAL WELL (REPLACEMENT
PART) FOR SURE TEMP MODEL 690, WELCH ALLYN # 02893- 20 1/EA $ 78.15 1/Each $78.15 Welch Allyn 02893-000
000
TOURNIQUET, 1in. x 18 in., BLUE, DISPOSABLE, LATEX FREE
250/pk, CURAPLEX # 1841-14000 32 1EA $ 0.17 250/Box $42.50 Dynarex 3139
TOURNIQUET,SOF TACTICAL TOURNIQUET . .
TACTICAL MEDICAL SOLUTION SOFTT-01 60 1/EA $ 24.27 1/Each $24.27 Tactical Medical SOFTT-R
TRANSFER SHEET, GRAHAM MEGAMOVER, WHITE .
W/HANDLES, Up to 1000 Ibs, 40inch x 80inch, # 51926 NO SUB %0 LEA 3 21.39 1/Each $21.39 Graham Medical 51926
LL(J)BSEGSIASO-GASTRIC TUBE, 8 FR, SALEM SUM # 8888268086, 50 UEA $ 280 1/Each $7.80 Cardinal Health C888268086
LgBSEljé\IASO_GASTRIC TUBE, 12FR, SALEM SUM # 2231-92912, 50 1/EA $ 2.15 1/Each $2.15 Cardinal Health 8888264929




DESCRIPTION ESQ-I:I_QI\_IEI;':;L Packing for Single/Each is "1" Packing/Unit must be completed and priced MFGmeBerand MFG Product #
TUBE- NASO-GASTRIC TUBE, 16 FR, STERILE, RUSCH #235216, .
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, NO SUB 50 1/EA $ 2.15 1/Each $2.15 Cardinal Health 8888264960
;ik?‘[?E TAG, METTAG TRIAGE TAGS, with 30inch ELASTIC 100 1/EA $ 0.89 1/Each $0.89 Mettag MT-137
TUBING- SUCTION CONNECTING TUBING 6' X 9/32" ID, SINGLE
USE, STERILE PACKAGE, LATEX FREE, SUPERIOR #43200 OR 200 1/EA $ 1.00 50/Case $50.00 Conmed 34300
KENOREX #889932 OR EQUAL,
TYVEK SLEEVES. 484-850 . 200 1/EA $ 1.04 100/Box $104.00 ORS Nasco 251-1C501BW-B
Tyvek sleeve, elastic ends, 18 in.
TYVEK PROTECTIVE JUMPSUIT 200 1/EA $ 6.80 25/Case $170.00 ORS Nasco 251-TY122S-L
VENTILATOR CIRCUIT, SINGLE-LIMB, PORTABLE, 6inch CareFusion
PATIENT TUBE, 1/8inch and 1/4inch ID 250 VEA $ 833 L/Each $8.33 Corporation 1795
WRENCH POLYCARBONATE, FOR MEDICAL D and E .
CYLINDER APPLICATIONS, # 13-WR-1 20 1/EA $ 0.92 1/Each $0.92 Allied Healthcare 66080
WRENCH- 02 CYLINDER WRENCH, LARGE SIZE HUDSON .
#A03716 OR EQUAL 10 1EA $ 6.31 1/Each $6.31 Allied Healthcare 66082
YANKAUER, HIGH STERILE, LATEX FREE, SUCTION WITH
VENT,KENDALL#40525, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, 200 1/EA $ 0.65 1/Each $0.65 Dynarex 4690
KENTRON 887710 OR EQUAL NO SUB
geoﬁlél' AIR HOSE, BLOOD PRESSURE, 9 FEET, E-SEIRES # 8000- 2 1/EA $ 67.40 1/Each $67.40 Zoll Medical 8000-0662
ZOLL, AIR HOSE, BLOOD PRESSURE TUBING (DUAL LUMEN) .
10 FEET, X SEIES # 8300-0002-01 10 1/EA $ 196.88 1/Each $196.88 Zoll Medical 8300-0002-01
ZOLL AUTOPULSE BATTERY Part # 8700-0752-01 NO SUB 10 1/EA $ 973.50 1/Each $973.50 Zoll Medical 8700-0752-01
ZOLL, AUTOPULSE LIFEBAND # 8700-0706-01 57 1/EA $ 457.50 1/Each $457.50 Zoll Medical 8700-0706-01
g:lOLL, AUTOPULSE SHOULDER STRAP-RESTRAINT # 8700-0709- 4 1/EA NO BID
ZOLL, BATTERY E-SERIES # 8019-0535-01 2 1/EA $ 459.20 1/Each $459.20 Zoll Medical 8019-0535-01
ZOLL, BATTERY X-SERIES # 8000-0580-01 10 1/EA $ 493.00 1/Each $493.00 Med Plus Services ZOL 8000-0580-01
ZOLL, BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF, ADULT DUAL TUBE- NON
DISPOSABLE, X-SERIES # 2614-63504 1 1/EA $ 21.66 1/Each $21.66 Welch Allyn SOFT-11-2MQ
ZOLL, CABLE, 4 LEAD (MAIN TRUNK 10 FT) # 8000-1008-01 20 1/EA $ 184.95 1/Each $184.95 Zoll Medica 8000-1008-01
ZOLL, CABLE, 12 LEAD # 8000-1008-01 2 1/EA $ 184.95 1/Each $184.95 Zoll Medica 8000-1008-01
ZOLL, CABLE, 12 LEAD X-SERIES # 8300-0802-01 21 1/EA $ 312.12 1/Each $312.12 Zoll Medica 8300-0802-01




DESCRIPTION ESQ-I:I_QI\_IEI;':;L Packing for Single/Each is "1" Packing/Unit must be completed and priced MFGmeBerand MFG Product #
ZOLL 1-STEP PATIENT CABLE FOR 12-LEAD ECG WITH LIMB-
LEAD AND V-LEAD CABLES(10 FT) OLL Part# 8000-1007-01 (V- 20 1/EA 377.06 1/Each $377.06 AED Superstore 8000-1007-01
Lead/Limb Lead & Bed Clip Combo)
ZOLL, CABLE, 12 LEAD EXTENSION CABLE 90 DEGREE
ELBOW # 8000-1598 19 1/EA NO BID
ZOLL CABLE, AUXILIARY POWER BREAKOUT CABLE, X-
SERIES, # 8000-00903-01 10 1EA NOBID
ZOLL, CABLE, IBP RIGHT ANGLE EDWARDS PROPAQ X-
SERIES #8300-087-01 4 1EA NO BID
g%lél_'dlc ABLE, IBP RIGHT ANGLE PROPAQ X-SERIES #8300- 4 1/EA 170.00 1/Each $170.00 AED Superstore 8300-0788-01
ZOLL, CABLE O2 SATURATION CABLES (LNC-04 RED END) 4 1/EA 151.04 1/Each $151.04 MaSImF) 2055
8000-0330 Corporation
ZOLL, CABLE 02 SATURATION CABLES X-SERIES (RED END) 24 1/EA 256,95 1/Each $256.25 MaSImF) 4481
8000-001392 Corporation
ZOLL, CABLE O2 SATURATION CABLES FINGER SENSOR # 4 1/EA 129.80 1/Each $129.80 MaSImF) 1863
8000-0294 Corporation
ZOLL, CABLE O2 SATURATION CABLES FINGER SENSOR X- Masimo
SERIES # 16529 24 1/EA 129.80 1/Each $129.80 Corporation 1863
ZOLL CABLE, MASIMO, RAINBOW RC-4 EMS PATIENT CABLE Masimo
 X-SERIES #4481 20 1/EA 256.25 1/Each $256.25 Corporation 4481
ZOLL, CABLE SLEEVE, X-SERIES # 8000-002005-01 12 1/EA 63.44 1/Each $63.44 Zoll Medical 8000-002005-01
ZOLL, CAPNOSTAT CO2 W/ MOUTHPIECE # 8000-0265-01 10 1/EA 115.00 1/Each $115.00 Zoll Medical 8000-0265-01
ZOLL CAPNOLINE, SMART O2 PLUS (ADULT) 8300-0524-01 600 1/EA 8.64 1/Each $8.64 Westmed 918
ZOLL, CASE, E-SERIES # 8000-0931-01 2 1/EA 369.15 1/Each $369.15 Zoll Medical 8000-0931-01
ZOLL CPR-STAT-PADZ ELECTRODE, 8900-0400 140 1/EA 60.41 1/Each $60.41 Zoll Medical 8900-0400
ZOLL CPR ADAPTER, MFC to CPR  # 8000-0370 10 1/EA 333.90 1/Each $333.90 AED Superstore 8000-0370
ZOLL, FILTERLINE SET (ADULT PEDIATRIC) X-SERIES # 8300- 620 1/EA 714 1/Each $7.14 Westmed 939
0520-01
ZOLL, PAPER E-SERIES, # 8000-0301 20 1/EA 3.47 1/Each $3.47 Cardinal Health 50000031
ZOLL, PAPER THERMAL ROLL, X-SERIES # 8000-000901-01 1580 1/EA 24.02 1/Each $24.02 Zoll Medical 8000-000901-01
gfLL PAPER THERMAL ROLL w/ Grid X SERIES # 8000-00910- 800 1EA 6.15 6/Box $36.90 Zoll Medical 8000-000910-01

Masimo

ZOLL, SENSOR, SAO2 INFANT # 8000-0322 1 1/EA 15.25 1/Each $15.25 2328

Corporation




EST ANNUAL

MFG & Brand

DESCRIPTION QTY -Each Packing for Single/Each is "1" Packing/Unit must be completed and priced Name MFG Product #
Masimo
ZOLL, SENSOR, SAO2 CHILD # 8000-0321 1 1/EA $ 13.42 1/Each $13.42 . 1860
Corporation
Masimo
ZOLL, SENSOR, SAO2 ADULT# 8000-0320 1 1/EA $ 12.81 1/Each $12.81 . 1859
Corporation
MASIMO®, M-LNCS INF-3, INFANT ADHESIVE SENSOR 20 PER Masimo
BOX ZOLL # 8000-000477 420 1/EA $ 15.60 20/Box $312.00 Corporation 2319
MASIMO®, M-LNCS PDTX-3, PEDIATRIC ADHESVIE SENSOR Masimo
(20 Per Box) ZOLL PART # 8000-00476 420 LEA $ 1320 20/Box $265.00 Corporation 2318
ZOLL, STAT-PADZ, ADULT COMBO # 8900-4003 320 1/EA $ 35.92 12/Case $431.04 Zoll Medical 8900-4003
ZOLL, STAT-PADZ, CHILD COMBO # 8900-2065 72 1/EA $ 41.17 6/Case $247.06 Zoll Medical 8900-2065
ZOLL, YSI REUSABLE ADULT SKIN TEMPATURE PROBE, X- .
SERIES # 8000-0670 1 1/EA $ 119.87 1/Each $119.87 Med Plus Services ZOL 8000-0670
ZOLL, YSI REUSABLE PEDIATRIC SKIN TEMPATURE PROBE, X .
SERIES # 8000-0671 1 1/EA $ 119.87 1/Each $119.87 Med Plus Services ZOL 8000-0671
TOTAL $ 14,299.23
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General Information

Life-Assist, Inc.

11277 Sunrise Park Drive

Rancho Cordova, CA 95742
800-824-6016 (p) / 800-290-9794 (f)
customerservice@life-assist.com

Life-Assist is one of the nation's largest distributors of emergency medical supplies and equipment for
the First Responder, Paramedic, EMT and EMS provider. Since 1977, we've specialized in customer
service, with customer satisfaction as our ultimate goal. You'll never talk to a computer when you call
Life-Assist during business hours - only trained, knowledgeable, and friendly customer service
representatives.

Our corporate warehouse is located in Rancho Cordova, CA, and our central distribution warehouse is
located in Lenexa, KS. We have local account managers throughout the US to service our customers
and provide solutions.

Life-Assist offers an Emergency Disaster Support program. This program provides customers with a 24-
hour hotline that is linked to several Managers, all of whom have access to our Warehouses as well as
direct contact with key manufacturers committed to providing disaster relief. We have several means
of shipping products through our warehouses or through manufacturers directly, 7 days a week. Life-
Assist has a proven record of helping in disasters such as: 9/11, Katrina, Joplin, Oklahoma City
Bombing, Harvey and several of the national and California wildfires. Contact us at
disastersupport@Ilife-assist.com to sign-up.

Visit our website at www.life-assist.com and view testimonials from our customers across the country.

life-assist.com 11277 Sunrise Park Dr, Rancho Cordova,


mailto:customerservice@life-assist.com
mailto:disastersupport@life-assist.com
http://www.life-assist.com/

ll'ﬂ'ﬂSSlSt‘ Customer Support -
Helping Heroes Save Lives

CUSTOMER SERVICE AND SUPPORT

Since 1977, we've specialized in customer service, with customer satisfaction as our ultimate goal. You'll
never talk to a computer when you call Life-Assist during business hours - only trained, knowledgeable,
and friendly customer service representatives.

ORDERING IS EASY:
e Internet: Customers can place order and verify pricing 24 hours a day, 7 days a week on our
website. www.life-assist.com
e Email: Orders may be emailed to customer service at customerservice @life-assist.com.
e Operative 1Q: Life-Assist is fully integrated with Operative IQ and orders can be submitted and
pricing verified in this platform.
e Phone: Our toll free number is 800-824-6016. Knowledgeable and friendly customer service
representatives are available to take your call - Monday-Friday, 7:00 am — 5:00 pm PST.
e Online Chat: Our new online chat features allows orders to be placed and questions to be
answered via our online chat.
e Fax: Our toll-free fax number is available 24 hours a day at 800-290-9794.
e Mail: Orders may be mailed to our office:
Life-Assist, Inc.
11277 Sunrise Park Drive
Rancho Cordova, CA 95742

SHIPPING

e Orders for in-stock items placed by 4:00pm PST, (7:00pm EST), will ship the same day.

¢ Notifications of backorders are provided at the time of ordering. This provides you the

e opportunity to adjust your order to best accommodate your needs.

e Multiple warehouses available. Most items are in-stock and available for immediate
shipment from our California and Kansas warehouses. We are proud of our 99% fill rate!

e Your main warehouse will be in Lenexa, Kansas. — Three-day shipping!

BEST IN THE INDUSTRY ONLINE ORDERING

Customize our easy online ordering program to meet your specific needs:

e View your agency’s pricing on all items.

e Custom supply lists can be created to maintain continuity and eliminate ordering errors.
User defined fields can be added to make ordering simple.

e Submit orders for authorization to others within your agency. This feature can be used for
order approval or review through the chain of command.

e Create a Master Administrator to manage all users on the account. Master Administrators have
the ability to make changes and/or restrict a user’s ordering capabilities.

e View invoice history, tracking information, backorder status and account activity.

life-assist.com 11277 Sunrise Park Dr, Rancho Cordova, CA95742 9@@-
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Riverside County Fire
16902 Bundy Ave

Riverside, CA 92518

Shawn Bierle (951) 840-8011
shawn.bierle@fire.ca.gov

City of Tucson

255 W Alameda

Tucson, AZ 85726

Joe Gulotta (520) 837-7017
Joe.Gulotta@tucsonaz.gov

Sacramento Metro Fire
3012 Gold Canal

Rancho Cordova, CA 95670
Mark Jones 916-859-4374
Jones.mark@smfd.ca.gov

Houston Fire Department
1205 Dart Street

Houston, TX 77007

Yul Pierce (713) 247-5083
yul.pierce@houstontx.gov

City of Columbus

Division of Fire

4252 Groves Road

Columbus, OH 43232

Scott Ellis (614) 221-3132 Ext 75987
seellis@columbus.gov

Darren Fuller (614) 221-3132 Ext
75961 dsfuller@columbus.gov

**additional references upon request

Visit our website for customer testimonials |https://www.Iife—assist.com/Info/Testimonialsl

life-assist.com 11277 Sunrise Park Dr, Rancho Cordova, CA95742 9@@-
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

OPID: T
DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
05/04/2020

LIFEA-1

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER 916-773-4560

Foothill Valley Insurance
13 Sierragate Plaza Ste.A
Roseville, CA 95678

GONIACT Tyla A Belton

(P,{}g,N,fo’ Ext): 916-773-4560

FAX o). 916-773-4583

(AIC, No):

EMAL__ tyla.b@foothillvalley.com

ADDRESS:

Tyla A Belton
INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #

INSURER A : Admiral Insurance Company 24856
INSURED nsurer g : Berkshire Hathaway Homestate 20044
Life Assist, Inc.
11277 Sunrise Park Drive INSURER C :
Rancho Cordova, CA 95742

INSURER D :

INSURERE :

INSURERF :

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER:

REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

vee oF msuRANCE ai/egeR AR | Rt
A | X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE $ 1,000,000
cLAMSMADE | X | occur CA000002500-19 01/01/2020| 01/01/2021 | BAMGSEIGRENTED o s 100,000
MED EXP (Any one person) $ 5,000
PERSONAL & ADV INJURY | § 1,000,000
EN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 2,000,000
X | poLicy ESr Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG | $ 2,000,000
OTHER: Emp Ben. N 1,000,000
A | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY &g“gﬁ‘l’i‘j&gt?'“@f LMt $ 1,000,000
ANY AUTO CA000002500-19 01/01/2020|01/01/2021 | BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
OWNED - SCHEDULED
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS BODILY INJURY (Per accident)| $
X | HIRED X | NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE
| A | AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY (Per accident) $
$
A UMBRELLA LIAB X | occur EACH OCCURRENCE $ 1,000,000
X | EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE GX000001897-02 01/01/2020| 01/01/2021 | , s5recAaTE $ 1,000,000
DED ‘ ‘ RETENTION $ 3
B |WORKERS COMPENSATION X ‘ PER ‘ OTH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY STATUTE ER
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE LIWC114725 01/01/2020| 01/01/2021| £ | o acciDENT $ 1,000,000
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? N/A 1.000.000
(Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE| $ 099,
If yes, describe under 1.000.000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | $ A

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

RE: For Information Purposes Only

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

FORIN-1

For Information Purposes Only

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD





