HIGH PERFORMANCE STORM DUAL WALL POLYPROPYLENE (PP) PIPE, AASHTO DESIGNATION M330 & ASTM F2881 – MITERED END SECTIONS 4:1 SLOPE					
DESCRIPTION	FST	UNIT F			
15" DIA,	12	\$ NO BID	EA		
18" DIA,	12	\$ NO BID	EA		
34" DIA,	12	\$NO BID	EA		
36" DIA,	6	\$NO BID	EA		
48" DIA,	6	\$NO BID	EA		

Acknowledg	ge Receipt of Addendum(s) (if applicable circle): #1 Yes	s No #2	Yes No	#3 Yes No #4 Yes No
Bidder: _	Dale Pennington	_ Company:	Metal	Culverts, INC
Address: _	2148 Pine Forest Dr. Clearwater, FL 3376	64		
-				
Authorized	Signature: Dale Pennington		Title:	
Clearly Prin	t Signature; Dale Pennington		Title:	Sales Representative
PHONE:	727-531-1431 FAX: 727-531-1433	3	_ DATE:	May 28, 2019
Email Addre	ess: sales@metalculverts.com			

EXHIBIT A

BID FORM

BID NUMBER:

20-42 Annual Purchase of Drainage Infrastructure

BID OPENING DATE:

2:00 pm, Wednesday, June 5, 2019

PLACE OF BID OPENING:

Alachua County Division of Purchasing, 3rd Floor

County Administration Building

12 SE 1st Street

Gainesville, Florida, 32601-6983

VENDOR: Metal Culverts, INC

LOCATION: 2148 Pine Forest Dr., Clearwater FL 33764

I.) CORRUGATED METAL PIPE

CORRUGATED METAL PIPE ALUMINIZED TYPE II MITERED END ANCHORS	SECTION	S 4:1 SLOPE V	WITH
DESCRIPTION	EST QTY	UNIT PR	CICE
15" DIA, GAUGE 16	4	\$ 99.40	EA
18" DIA, GAUGE 16	4	\$ 125.80	EA
24" DIA, GAUGE 16	4	\$ _{187.60}	EA
36" DIA, GAUGE 14	4	\$ 384.65	EA
48" DIA, GAUGE 14	4	\$ 601.15	EA

CORRUGATED METAL ARCH PIPE ALUMINIZED TYPE II MITERED END SECTIONS 4:1 SLOPE WITH ANCHORS					
DESCRIPTION	EST QTY	UNIT PR	CE		
17" DIA x13", GAUGE 16	4	\$ 111.20	EA		
21" DIA x15", GAUGE 16	4	\$ 146.50	EA		
28" DIA x20", GAUGE 16	4	\$ 249.05	EA		
42" DIA x29", GAUGE 14	4	\$ 466.35	EA		
57" DIA x38", GAUGE 12	4	\$1068.75	EA		

CORRUGATED METAL ROUND PIPE ALUMIN	IZED TYPE	II	
DESCRIPTION	EST QTY	UNIT PRI	ICE
15" DIA, GAUGE 16,	300	\$ 10.64	LF
18" DIA, GAUGE 16,	300	\$ 12.64	LF
24" DIA, GAUGE 16,	180	\$ 16.91	LF
36" DIA, GAUGE 14,	60	\$ 30.83	LF
48" DIA, GAUGE 12,	60	\$ 57.10	LF

CORRUGATED METAL ARCH PIPE ALUMINIZ	ED TYPE II		
DESCRIPTION	EST QTY	UNIT P	RICE
17" DIAx13",GAUGE 16,	300	\$ 11.40	LF
21" DIAx15",GAUGE 16,	300	\$ 13.40	LF
28" DIAx20",GAUGE 16,	180	\$ 18.05	LF
42" DIAx29",GAUGE 14,	60	\$ 32.15	LF
57" DIAx38",GAUGE 12,	60	\$ 58.68	LF

CORRUGATED METAL ROUND PIPE BANDS ALUMINIZED TYPE II MINIMUM 12" WIDE				
DESCRIPTION	EST QTY	RICE		
15" DIA, GAUGE 18	3	\$ 15.96	EA	
18" DIA, GAUGE 18	3	\$ 18.96	EA	
24" DIA, GAUGE 18	3	\$ 25.37	EA	
36" DIA, GAUGE 16	3	\$ 46.25	EA	
48" DIA, GAUGE 16	3	\$ 85.65	EA	

CORRUGATED METAL ARCH PIPE BANDS ALUMINIZED TYPE II MINIMUM 12" WIDE					
DESCRIPTION	EST QTY	UNIT PRICE			
17" DIA X 13", GAUGE 18	3	\$ 17.10	EA		
21" DIA X 15", GAUGE 18	3	\$ 28.44	EA		
28" DIA X 20",GAUGE 18	3	\$ 27.08	EA		
42" DIA X 29", GAUGE 16	3	\$ 48.23	EA		
57" DIA X 38", GAUGE 16	3	\$ 88.02	EA		

NEOPRENE GASKETS						
DESCRIPTION	EST QTY	UNIT I	PRICE			
15" DIA, 3/8" x 7" NEOPRENE GASKETS	3	\$ 13.30	EA			
18" DIA, 3/8" x 7" NEOPRENE GASKETS	6	\$ 15.80	EA			
24" DIA, 3/8" x 7" NEOPRENE GASKETS	6	\$ 21.15	EA			
36" DIA, 3/8" x 7" NEOPRENE GASKETS	6	\$ 30.85	EA			
48" DIA, 3/8"x 12" NEOPRENE GASKETS	3	\$ 67.40	EA			

II.) REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE

REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE, ASTM DESIGNAT	ION C76,	CLASS III.	
DESCRIPTION	EST QTY	UNIT PF	UCE
15" DIA,	80	\$ NO BID	LF
18" DIA,	80	\$ NO BID	LF
24" DIA,	80	\$ NO BID	LF
36" DIA,	48	\$ NO BID	LF
48" DIA,	16	\$ NO BID	LF

REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE, HORIZONTAL ELLIPTIC C507, CLASS III	CAL ASTM	1 DESIGNAT	ION
DESCRIPTION	EST QTY	UNIT PF	UCE
12" X 18",	80	\$ NO BID	LF
14" X 23",	80	\$ NO BID	LF
19" X 30",	80	\$ NO BID	LF
29" X 45",	48	\$ NO BID	LF
38" X 60",	16	\$ NO BID	LF

REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE, HORIZONTAL ELI C507, CLASS III MITERED END SECTIONS 4:1 SLO		1 DESIGNAT	TION
DESCRIPTION	EST QTY	UNIT PI	UCE
15" X 18",	10	\$NO BID	EA
14" X 23",	10	\$ NO BID	EA
19" X 30",	8	\$ NO BID	EA
29" X 45",	6	\$ NO BID	EA
38" X 60",	2	\$NO BID	EA

REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE, ASTM DESIGNATION C76, CLASS III. MITERED END SECTIONS 4:1 SLOPE.								
DESCRIPTION	EST QTY	UNIT P	RICE					
15" DIA,	10	\$ NO BID	EA					
18" DIA,	10	\$ NO BID	EA					
24" DIA,	8	\$ NO BID	EA					
36" DIA,	6	\$ NO BID	EA					
48" DIA,	2	\$ NO BID	EA					

III.) HIGH PERFORMANCE STORM DUAL WALL POLYPROPYLENE (PP) PIPE

HIGH PERFORMANCE STORM DUAL WALL POLYPROPYLENE (PP) PIPE, AASHTO DESIGNATION M330 & ASTM F2881							
DESCRIPTION	EST QTY	UNITI	RICE				
15" DIA,	120	\$ NO BID	LF				
18" DIA,	120	\$ NO BID	LF				
34" DIA,	120	\$ NO BID	LF				
36" DIA,	60	\$ NO BID	LF				
48" DIA,	60	\$ NO BID	LF				

Small Business Enterprise (SBE) Program Participation Form

BID NUMBER: 20-42 Annual Purchase of Drainage Infrastructure

OPTION 1

I certify that our Company is an Alachua County Certified Small Business Enterprise (SBE) registered prior to the Bid opening.

Circle One: Yes (If yes, complete and sign the last page of this Exhibit)

No (If No, proceed to Option 2.)

OPTION 2

I certify that our Company will perform ALL work and that no subcontractors will be utilized for this bid.

Circle One:

Yes af yes, complete and sign the last page of this Exhibit)

No (If No, proceed to Option 3.)

BID NUMBER: 20-42 Annual Purchase of Drainage Infrastructure

I as the undersigned Vendor certify that I have completed one of OPTION 1 OPTION 2	the option(s) below <i>(Circle One)</i> : PTION 3 OPTION 4
If you are unable to certify that, you have completed to the best of OPTION 2, OPTION 3 or OPTION 4, CALL (48 hours prior at 352.374.5202, for direction.	
Vendor Name: Metal Culverts, INC	Date
Signature Wild L. Rule	Title
Digitatoro	Titlo

DRUG FREE WORKPLACE

Section 22.09 Competitive Sealed Bidding of the Alachua County Purchasing Code states that in the evaluation of bids, all factors in the bidding process being equal, both as to dollar amount and ability to perform, priority will be given, first, to those vendors certifying a drug-free workplace, secondly, to certified Small Business Enterprise (SBE) bidders.

The undersigned vendor in accordance with §287.087, Florida Statute and Section 22.09 of the Alachua County Purchasing Code hereby certifies that

METAL CULVERTS,	INC.
Name of Business	

Does:

- 1. Publish a statement notifying employees that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing, possession or use of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace and specifying the actions that will be taken against employees for violations of such prohibition.
- 2. Inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business's policy of maintaining a drug-free workplace, any available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee assistance programs, and the penalties that may be imposed upon employees for drug abuse violations.
- 3. Give each employee engaged in providing the commodities or contractual services that are under bid a copy of the statement specified in subsection (1).
- 4. In the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employees that, as a condition of working on the commodities or contractual services that are under bid, the employee will abide by the terms of the statement and will notify the employer of any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo contendere to, any violation of Chapter 1893 or of any controlled substance law of the United States or any state, for a violation occurring in the workplace no later than five (5) days after such conviction.
- 5. Impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or rehabilitation program if such is available in the employee's community, by any employee who is so convicted.
- 6. Make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through implementation of this section.

As the person authorized to sign the statement, I certify that this firm complies fully with the above requirements.

Bu W. Bully Bendul
Bidder's Signature

5/28/19

Date

PUBLIC RECORD DECLARATION OR CLAIM OF EXEMPTION

As a bidder or proposer, any document you submit to Alachua County may be a public record and be open for personal inspection or copying by any person. In Florida 'public records' are defined as all documents, papers, letters, maps, books, tapes, photographs, films, sound recordings, data processing software, or other material, regardless of the physical form, characteristics, or means of transmission, made or received pursuant to law or ordinance or in connection with the transaction of official business by any agency. Section 119.011, F.S. A document is subject to personal inspection and copying unless it falls under one of the public records exemptions created under Florida law. Please designate what portion of your bid or proposal, if any, qualifies to be exempt from inspection and copying:

(Execute either section I. or II, but not both; bidder may not modify language)
I. NO EXEMPTION FROM PUBLIC RECORDS LAW
No part of the bid or proposal submitted is exempt from disclosure under the Florida public records law, Ch. 119, F.S.
Bidder's Signature Date
OR
OK
II. EXEMPTION FROM PUBLIC RECORDS LAW AND AGREEMENT TO INDEMNIFY AND DEFEND ALACHUA COUNTY
The following parts of the bid or proposal submitted are exempt from disclosure under the Florida public records law because: (list exempt parts and legal justification. i.e. trade secret):
By claiming that all or part of the bid or proposal is exempt from the public records law, the undersigned bidder or proposer agrees to protect, defend, indemnify and hold the County, its officers, employees and agents free and harmless from and against any and all claims arising out of a request to inspector copy the bid or proposal. The undersigned bidder or proposer agrees to investigate, handle, respond to, provide defense (including payment of attorney fees, court costs, and expert witness fees and expenses up to and including any appeal) for and defend any such claim at its sole cost and expense through counsel chosen by the County and agrees to be all other costs and expenses related thereto, even if they (claims, etc.) are groundless, false, or fraudulent.
Bidder's Signature Date

ACO	RD

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE(MM/DD/YYYY) 03/30/2019

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER		CONTACT NAME:						
Aon Risk Services Central, Inc Chicago IL Office 200 East Randolph Chicago IL 60601 USA	nc.	PHONE (A/C, No., Ext): (866) 283-7122 FAX (A/C, No.); (800) 363-01					05	
		E-MAIL ADDRESS;						
			INSURER(S) AF	FORDING CO	VERAGE		NAIC#	
INSURED		INSURER A: Zurich American Ins Co					16535	
Metal Culverts, Inc		INSURER B:	American Zur	ich Ins Co)		40142	
711 Heisinger Road Jefferson City MO 65109 USA		INSURER C:						
serverson every me established		INSURER D:						
		INSURER E:						
		INSURER F:						
COVERAGES	CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 57007569188	37		REVISION	NUMBER:			

TH	IS IS	TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES	OF I	NSUR	ANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEE	N ISSUED TO	THE INSURE	D NAMED ABOVE FOR 1	HE POLICY PERIOD
INI	DICA	TED, NOTWITHSTANDING ANY RE	QUIR	EMEN	IT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY	CONTRACT	OR OTHER	OCUMENT WITH RESPE	ECT TO WHICH THIS
CE	RTI	ICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY	PERT	AIN, T	HE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY	THE POLICIE	S DESCRIBE	D HEREIN IS SUBJECT	
	CLU	SIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCI						io. Limits si	nown are as requeste
NSR LTR		TYPE OF INSURANCE	ADDL	SUBR	POLICY NUMBER		(MM/DD/YYYY)		rs
Α	х	COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY	Y		GL0651098820	04/01/2019	04/01/2020	EACH OCCURRENCE	\$1,000,00

INSI	TYPE OF INSURANCE	ADD INS	ILI SUBR DI WVD	POLICY NUMBER	(MM/DD/YYYY)	(MM/DD/YYYY)	LIMITS		S
A			1	GL0651098820	04/01/2019	04/01/2020	EACH OCCURRENCE	-	\$1,000,000
	CLAIMS-MADE X OCCU	R					DAMAGE TO RENTE PREMISES (Ea occur		\$500,000
							MED EXP (Any one p	erson)	\$10,000
-			1				PERSONAL & ADV IN	JURY	\$1,000,000
1	GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER	R:					GENERAL AGGREGA	ATE	\$2,000,000
	X POLICY PRO- JECT LO	>					PRODUCTS - COMP/	OP AGG	\$2,000,000
	OTHER:		ŀ						
Α	AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY	Ý		BAP 6510987-20	04/01/2019	04/01/2020	COMBINED SINGLE (Ea accident)	LIMIT	\$1,000,000
1	X ANY AUTO						BODILY INJURY (Per	r person)	
1	OWNED SCHEDULE	D					BODILY INJURY (Per	accident)	
	AUTOS ONLY AUTOS HIRED AUTOS NON-OWNI ONLY AUTOS ON						PROPERTY DAMAGE (Per accident)	=	
	J J J J J J J J J J J J J J J J J J J	-							
	UMBRELLA LIAB OCCUI	₹					EACH OCCURRENCE	:	
-	EXCESS LIAB CLAIM	S-MADE					AGGREGATE		
1	DED RETENTION								
В	WORKERS COMPENSATION AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY		Y	wC651098620	04/01/2019	04/01/2020	X PER STATUTE	OTH- ER	
	ANY PROPRIETOR / PARTNER / EXECUTIV	E N N					E.L. EACH ACCIDENT		\$500,000
ĺ	OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? (Mandatory in NH)	NIA	`				E.L. DISEASE-EA EM	PLOYEE	\$500,000
	If yes, describe under DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below						E.L. DISEASE-POLIC	Y LIMIT	\$500,000
1									
1	1		Ī	I	l l	i	I		i 15

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

Alachua County Board of County Commissioners, its officials, employees, and volunteers are included as Additional Insured in accordance with the policy provisions of the General Liability and Automobile Liability policies. A Waiver of Subrogation is granted in favor of Certificate Holder in accordance with the policy provisions of the Workers' Compensation policy.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER	CANCELLATION

Alachua County	ے د	Country	Cammi and among	

Including Board of County Commissioners c/o Ebix BPO P.O Box 257, REF #17-3473 REF 17-700509 Portland MI 48875 USA

eHOLIE D	ANV	ΩE	THE	ABOVE	DESCRIBED	POLICIES	BF	CANO

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

Aon Rish Services Central Inc



After printing this label:

1. Use the 'Print' button on this page to print your label to your laser or inkjet printer.

2. Fold the printed page along the horizontal line.

3. Place label in shipping pouch and affix it to your shipment so that the barcode portion of the label can be read and scanned.

Warning: Use only the printed original label for shipping. Using a photocopy of this label for shipping purposes is fraudulent and could result in additional billing charges, along with the cancellation of your FedEx account number.

Use of this system constitutes your agreement to the service conditions in the current FedEx Service Guide, available on fedex.com.FedEx will not be responsible for any claim in excess of \$100 per package, whether the result of loss, damage, delay, non-delivery,misdelivery,or misinformation, unless you declare a higher value, pay an additional charge, document your actual loss and file a timely claim.Limitations found in the current FedEx Service Guide apply. Your right to recover from FedEx for any loss, including intrinsic value of the package, loss of sales, income interest, profit, attorney's fees, costs, and other forms of damage whether direct, incidental,consequential, or special is limited to the greater of \$100 or the authorized declared value. Recovery cannot exceed actual documented loss.Maximum for items of extraordinary value is \$1,000, e.g. jewelry, precious metals, negotiable instruments and other items listed in our ServiceGuide. Written claims must be filed within strict time limits, see current FedEx Service Guide.