BID NUMBER:
BID OPENING DATE:

PLACE OF BID OPENING:

BID FORM

2:00 pm, Wednesday, June 26, 2019

20-50 Annual Course and Fine Aggregate Materials

Alachua County Procurement, Third Floor

County Administration Building 12 SE 1* Street
Gainesville, Florida, 32601-6983

EXHIBIT A

AMOUNTBID | AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID
Coarse Aggregate Per Ton (DELIVERY - (DELIVERY - (DELIVERY - (DELIVERY- | PERTON (Plant

ZONE I) ZONE II) ZONE III) ZONE V) PICK-UP)
Asphalt # 89 (CPS #89), per ton $ 4745 $ 47.45 $ 44.13 $ 44.13 $ 2940
ASTM #67, per ton $ 49.55 $ 49.55 $ 46.23 $ 46.23 $ 31.50
ASTM #57, per ton $ 49.55 $ 4955 S 46.23 $ 46.23 g 31.50
ASTM #78, per ton $ NoBid | $NoBid $ No Bid $ NoBid | s NoBid
ASTM #4, per ton $ 49.55 $ 4955 $ 46.23 $ 46.23 $ 31.50
ASTM #7, per Ton $ 49.55 $ 49.55 $ 46.23 $ 46.23 $ 31.50
RIPRAP Ditch Lining $ 85.52 $ 85.52 $ 84.86 $ 8043 $ 63.00
RIPRAP Bedding Stone $ 79.22 $ 79.22 $ 78.56 $ 74.13 $ 56.70

SUB TOTAL “A” (Eight (8)
above Items)
AMOUNTBID | AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID
Fine Aggregate (DELIVERY- (DELIVERY- (DELIVERY- (DELIVERY- PER TON

ZONEI) ZONE II) ZONE 1iI) ZONE IV) (PICK-UP)
SILICA SAND, per ton $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid $ No Bid ¢ No Bid
Sﬁﬁ,ﬁ”‘i FINES/SCREENINGS, | ¢ 4640 .| s 4640 $ 4308 § 43.08 s 28.35

SUB TOTAL “B”
(Two (2) above Items)
GRAND TOTAL
(Subtotal *A” & “B")
HOURS OF OPERATION: Monday - Friday: 0600 am through 1800  pm
Saturday/Sunday: am through 1800 pm

Acknowledge Receipt of Addendum(s) (if applicable circle): #1 Yes No #2 Yes No #3 Yes No

Bidder:

Green Dream International LLC

Address:

32 W. 8th St. suite no 607 Erie, PA 16501

Company: Green Dream International LLC

Authorized Signature:

Varand Vartanian

Title:

f
Clearly Print Signature: /M

Title:

L
PHONE: 814—616—7800%;\){; 202-204-8444

Clearly Print or Typc Email Address:

DATE: June 26, 2019

info@gdicompany.com

President
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PART D - BIDDERS CHECK LIST

Bidders may use the boxes to the left to check off items when completed.

The checklist is intended as a reminder for certain important items and is not necessarily a complete list of what must be included in
your BID submission.

d Bid Form (Remember to fill this form out completely) THIS FORM MUST BE SIGNED.

L Acknowledge all Addendum(s) issued with this solicitation. A place to check off acknowledgement is on the bid form.

V Submit the appropriate number of copics.

« Fill out all of the exhibits as required, especially Exhibit C, Small Business Enterprise (SBE) Program Participation
Form

{ Include any insurance requirements.
U Include any bid bonds that may be applicable.

‘/ Remember to submit your Bid prior to the submittal deadline. LATE BIDS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED.

J Make sure that your bid package has been clearly marked and sealed. The bid number and name along with the vendor’s
company name should be clearly marked on the outside of the envelope.

‘/ REMINDER: Parking around the County Administration Building, located @ 12 SE 1* Street, can be challenging. Pleasc be
aware that it can be difficult at times to find a place to park. As stated above LATE BIDS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED.

,_J It is the vendor’s responsibility when using courier services, such as Fed Ex, UPS, etc., to make sure that the bid arrives on
time. LATE BIDS WILL NOT BE CONSIDERED.

If you have questions concerning these items or other sections of the bid solicitation please contact the Procurement for
clarification prior to submitting your bid.
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EXHIBIT B

Small Business Enterprise (SBE) Program Participation Form

BID NUMBER: 20-50 Annual Course and Fine Aggregate Materials

OPTION 1

1 certify that our Company is an Alachua County Certified Small Business Enterprise (SBE) registered prior to the Bid opening.

Circle One: Yes (If yes, complete and sign the last page of this Exhibit)

(lf No, proceed to Option 2.)

OPTION 2

I certify that our Company will perform ALL work and that no subcontractors will be utilized for this bid.

Circle One: Yes (If yes, complete and sign the last page of this Exhibit)

(]f No, proceed to Option 3.)

16



EXHIBIT B
BID NUMBER: 20-50 Annual Course and Fine Aggregate Materials
OPTION 3

SBE Participation. I certify that our Company has contacted the Alachua County’s Certified SBEs listed below. I state that the
following information regarding SBE Subcontractors is true and correct o the best of my knowledge and belief.

Alachua County has adopted a 15% SBE participation goal and policies which encourage participation of Small Business Enterprises
(SBE) in the provision of labor, time, supplies, services or construction items of any kind materials.

SBEs arc located in the Alachua County Small Business Enterprise Direclory, available at:
hutp:/smallbusdir.alachuacounty.us/ .

Subcontractor (any business entity holding a subcontract with the prime vendor) scrvices are defined as, “a contract with another
business entity that obtains labor, time, supplies, services or construction items of any kind.”

Vendors submitting bids under this solicitation are 1o identify the intended SBE subcontractors. These SBEs have agreed to perform
the work for the total dollar value and percentage of the bid sct forth below.

If SBE subcontractors are not utilized and listed below or if option 1 or 2 was not chosen, you must proceed to Option 4 and
document your Good Faith Effort,

SBE Name of Contractor SBE Name of Contractor

Address Address

Scope of Work to be Performed Scope of Work 1o be Performed

$ Yo $ Yo
(Est $ Value) (Est % of Total Bid) (Est § Value) (Est % of Total Bid)

SBE Name of Contractor SBE Name of Contractor

Address Address

Scope of Work (o be Performed Scope of Work to be Performed

S % $ Yo
(Est $ Value) (Est % of Total Bid) (Est § Value) (Est % of Total Bid)

SBE Name of Contractor SBE Name ol Contractor

Address Address

Scope of Work (o be Performed Scope of Work to be Performed

$ % $ %
(Est $ Value) (Est % ol Total Bid) (Est $ Value) (Est % of Total Bid)

17
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CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MM/DDIYYYY)
06/14/2019

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A GONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

ﬁg\” Cherilyn Middelthon

PRODUCER
Brown & Brown Insurance Agency of Virginia, Inc. "A’}g"'fo Ext): (703) 361-3191 I m’éM: (703) 361-5182
11220 Asset Loop Suite 304 ;E{mzlkss: cmiddelthon@bbdcmetro.com
INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
Manassas VA 20109 INSURERA: Selective Insurance Company of America 12572
INSURED INSURERB: The Cincinnati Insurance Company
GREEN DREAM INTERNATIONAL, LLC INSURER C :
2331 MILLRD STE 100 INSURER D :
INSURER E :
ALEXANDRIA VA 22314-4687 INSURER F :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: _ CL1810123560 REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR ADDL[SUBR] POLICY EFF_| POLICY EXP
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD | WVD POLICY NUMBER (MMWDD/YYYY) | (MM/DDIYYYY) LIMITS
><| COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE ¢ 1,000,000
DAMAGE TO RENTED
l CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR PREMISES (Ea occurrence) S 500,000
MED EXP (Any one person) S 15,000
A S 2191158 09/28/2018 | 09/28/2019 | personaLsaovmuury | s 1:000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE s 2,000,000
X pouicy s Loc PRODUCTS - COMP/OPAGG | $ 2,000,000
OTHER: $
COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY e s 1,000,000
ANY AUTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
—| owNED SCHEDULED .
A D Y - e S 2191158 09/28/2018 | 09/28/2019 | BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | $
X" HIRED NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE S
| 7S] AuTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY | (Per accident) _
$
X[ umsreLLALIAB | X< occur EACH OCCURRENCE s 2,000,000
A EXCESS LIAB R NiAE S 2191158 09/28/2018 | 09/28/2019 | scorecate s 2,000,000
DED I | retention s 00 s
WORKERS COMPENSATION PER OTH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY XI STATUTE I ER T
B A R e 1 e NIA VAARP307181 1212512018 | 12/25/2019 | ELEACHACCIDENT $ o
{Mandatory in NH) £L Disease - eaempiovee | s 1:000.000
It yes. describe under 1.000.000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT | § V%

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space s required)

Verification of Insurance

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

Green Dream International, LLC
2331 Mill Rd. Ste. 100

Alexandria VA 22314

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

I Shadhen

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD




EXHIBIT D
PUBLIC RECORD DECLARATION OR CLAIM OF EXEMPTION

As a bidder or proposer, any document you submit o Alachua County may bc a public record and be open for personal inspcction or
copying by any person. In Florida ‘public records” are defined as all documents, papers, letters, maps, books, tapes, photographs,
films, sound recordings, data processing software, or other material, regardless of the physical form, characteristics, or means of
transmission, made or received pursuant to law or ordinance or in connection with the transaction of official business by any agency.
Section 119.011(11), F.S. A document is subject (o personal inspection and copying unless it falls under onc of the public rccords
exemptions created under Florida law. Pleasce designate what portion of your bid or proposal, if any, qualifics to be cxempt from
inspection and copying:

(Exccute cither section 1. or I1. but not both: bidder may not modify language)

L. NO EXEMPTION FROM PUBLIC RECORDS LAW

No partof the bid or proposal submitied is exempt, from disclosure under the Florida public records law, Ch. 119, F.S.

f

Varand Vartanian/President (% June 26, 2019

Bidder’s Signature E Datc
“--OR---
I1. EXEMPTION FROM PUBLIC RECORDS LAW AND AGREEMENT TO INDEMNIFY AND DEFEND ALACHUA
COUNTY

The following parts of the bid or proposal submitted are exempt from disclosure under the Florida public records law because: (list
exempt parts and Iegal justification. i.c. trade secrel);

By claiming that all or part of the bid or proposal is exempt from the public records law, (he undersigned bidder or proposer agrecs (o
protect, defend, indemnify and hold the County, its officers, employcees and agents free and harmless from and against any and all
claims arising out of a request to inspector copy the bid or proposal. The undersigned bidder or proposer agrees (o investigate, handle,
respond to, provide defense (including payment of attorney fees, court costs, and expert witness fees and expenses up to and including
any appeal) for and defend any such claim at its sole cost and expense through counsel chosen by the County and agrees to bear all
other costs and cxpenses related therelo, even if they (claims, ctc.) are groundless, false, or fraudulent,

Bidder’s Signature Date
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BID NUMBER: 20-50 Annual Course and Fine Aggregate Materials
OPTION 4

EXHIBIT B

SBE Good Faith Effort. To be considered responsive all Vendors must have SBE Participation or demonstrate a good faith effort to
utilize SBE subcontractors. If option 1, 2 or 3 was not chosen the Vendor must complete the section below substantiating

compliance with good faith effort requircments.

In accordance with Section 22.36, of the Alachua County Purchasing Code, I have solicited and received responses from the following
Alachua County certificd SBE companics. (The SBE vendor’s response MUST be recorded in the section below.)

CCI CABOT CONSTRUCTION, INC

1 | Name of SBE Company: ANGLIN CONSTRUCTION COMPANY Date SBE Contacted
SBE Contact Name:  GARY ANGLIN Phonc:  (352) 376-4089 6 /24 2019
Must be completed by. SBE Response when contacted:

E-Mail Attached
2 | Name of SBE Company: BBI CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT, INC Date SBE Contacted
SBE Contact Name:  JOE BURNS Phone:  (352) 338-2073 6,24 , 2019
Must be completed by. SBE Response when contacted:

E-Mail Attached
3 | Name of SBE Company: Date SBE Contacted

SBE Contact Name: JYOTHI JOSEPH

Phone:

(352) 331-3720

6 /24 s 2019

Must be completed by. SBE Response when contacted:
E-Mail Attached

4 | Name of SBE Company:

HOFFMAN CONSTRUCTION, INC.

Date SBE Contacted

SBE Contact Name:  JOSEPH HOFFMAN Phone:  (352) 494-0229 6 /24 s 2019
Must be completed by. SBE Response when contacted:
E-Mail Attached

5 | Name of SBE Company: TCB SERVICES LLC Date SBE Contacted
SBE Contact Name: CAROL MCCLELLAN Phone:  (352) 463-0788 6/24 / 2019
Must be completed by. SBE Response when contacted:

E-Mail Attached
6 | Name of SBE Company: Date SBE Contacted
SBE Contact Name: Phone: / /
Must be completed by. SBE Response when contacted:
7 | Name of SBE Company: Datc SBE Contacted
SBE Contact Name: Phone: / /

Must be completed by. SBE Response when contacted:

18




EXHIBIT B

BID NUMBER: 20-50 Annual Course and Fine Aggregate Materials

I as the undersigned Vendor certify that I have completed one of the option(s) below (Circle One):

OPTION 1 OPTION 2 . OPTION 3 OPTION 4

Il you are unable to certify that, you have completed to the best of your knowledge and belief OPTION 1, OPTION 2, OPTION 3 or
OPTION 4, Call (48 hours prior to bid opening) the Procurement at 352.374.5202, for direction. ;

Vendor Name: Green Dream International LLC Date June 26, 2019

[

L@

Signature /:M Title President

Printed Name: Varand Vartanian Title President

19



Mark Alexander

BT b XIS

From: Mark Alexander <m.alexander@gdicompany.com>

Sent: Monday, June 24, 2019 7:54 AM

To: ‘gary@anglin.cfcoxmail.com’

Subject: Request for Quote for Hauling Aggregate

Tracking: Recipient Read
‘gary@anglin.cfcoxmail.com’
Anglin Construction Read: 6/24/2019 8:22 AM

Hi Gary,
Can you give me your per ton hauling rate for hauling aggregate from Martin Marietta marine terminal to zones |, II, Ill,
IV in Alachua County?

Regards

Mark Alexander

Account Manager

Green Dream international

32 W. 8th St. suite no 607

Erie, PA 16501

Phone: 814-258-6366

E: m.alexander@gdicompany.com !
www.greendreamgr.com
www.greendreamsupply.com

-
GREEN DREAM




Mark Alexander

From: Mark Alexander <m.alexander@gdicompany.com>
Sent: Monday, June 24, 2019 7:53 AM

To: jjoseph@cabotconstructioninc.com'

Subject: Request for Quote for Hauling Aggregate

Hi lyothi,

Can you give me your per ton hauling rate for hauling aggregate from Martin Marietta marine terminal to zones 1,1, 1,
IV in Alachua County?

Regards

Mark Alexander

Account Manager

Green Dream International

32 W. 8th St. suite no 607

Erie, PA 16501

Phone: 814-258-6366

E: m.alexander@gdicompany.com
www.greendreamgr.com
www.greendreamsupply.com

-_—
GREEN DREAM




Mark Alexander

S TSROy RS
From: Mark Alexander <m.alexander@gdicompany.com>
Sent: Monday, June 24, 2019 7:53 AM
To: ‘joe@bbi-cm.com’
Subject: Request for Quote for Hauling Aggregate
Hi Joe,

Can you give me your per ton hauling rate for hauling aggregate from Martin Marietta marine terminal to zones |, Ii, IlI,
IV in Alachua County?

Regards

Mark Alexander

Account Manager

Green Dream International

32 W. 8th St, suite no 607

Erie, PA 16501

Phone: 814-258-6366

E: m.alexander@gdicompany.com
www.greendreamgr.com
www.greendreamsupply.com

-
GREEN DREAM




Mark Alexander

From: Mark Alexander <m.alexander@gdicompany.com>
Sent: Monday, June 24, 2019 7:53 AM

To: 'hoffmanconst@yahoo.com'

Subject: Request for Quote for Hauling Aggregate

Hi Joseph,

Can you give me your per ton hauling rate for hauling aggregate from Martin Marietta marine terminal to zones 1,10, 1,
IV in Alachua County?

Regards

Mark Alexander

Account Manager

Green Dream International

32 W, 8th St. suite no 607

Erie, PA 16501

Phone: 814-258-6366

E: m.alexander@gdicompany.com
www.greendreamgr.com
www.greendreamsupply.com

-_—
GREEN DREAM




Lll_ark Alexander

=
From: Mark Alexander <m.alexander@gdicompany.com>
Sent: Monday, June 24, 2019 7:53 AM
To: ‘carol@tcbserviceslic.com'
Subject: Request for Quote for Hauling Aggregate
Hi Carol,

Can you give me your per ton hauling rate for hauling aggregate from Martin Marietta marine terminal to zones |, 11, IlI,
IV in Alachua County?

Regards

Mark Alexander

Account Manager

Green Dream International

32 W. 8th St. suite no 607

Erie, PA 16501

Phone: 814-258-6366

E: m.alexander@gdicompany.com
www.greendreamgr.com
www.greendreamsupply.com

-
GREEN DREAM




EXHIBIT C
DRUG FREE WORKPLACE

Section 22.09 Competitive Scaled Bidding of the Alachua County Purchasing Code and Section 41-530 of the City’s Financial Services
Procedures Manual states that in the evaluation of bids, all factors in the bidding process being equal, both as to dollar amount and
ability to perform, priority will be given, first, to those vendors certifying a drug-free workplace, secondly, to certified Small Business
Enterprisce (SBE) bidders.

The undersigned vendor in accordance with Florida Statute 287.087 and Section 22.09 of the Alachua County Purchasing Code hereby
certifies that

Green Dream International LLC
Name of Business

Docs:

1. Publish a statement notifying employces that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing, posscssion, or usc of a
controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace and specilying the actions that will be taken against employces for violations
of such prohibition.

2. Inform cmployces about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business's policy of maintaining a drug-frce workplace,
any available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee assistance programs, and the penalties that may be imposed upon
employees for drug abuse violations,

3. Give cach employce engaged in providing the commodities or contractual services that are under bid a copy of the statement
specified in subscction (1).

4. In the statement specified in subsection (1), notily the employees that, as a condition of working on the commoditics or
contractual services that are under bid, the employee will abide by the terms of the statement and will notify the employer of
any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo contendere to, any violation of Chapter 1893 or of any controlled substance law of
the United States or any state, for a violation occurring in the workplace no later than five (5) days after such conviction.

5. Impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abusc assistance or rehabilitation program if such is
available in the employce's communily, by any employee who is so convicted.

0. Make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through implementation of this section.

As the person authorized to sign the statement, I cerlify that this firm complies fully with the above requirements.

f
Varand V artanian/Presiden(%
Bidder's Signature il
June 26, 2019
Date
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Past Performance

REFERENCES

Company Name:  Florida Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services

Address.  Withlacoochee Forestry Center 1501 BroadSt Brooksville, FL 34601

Contact Name: Melvin Reese Jr.

Alternate Contact Name:

Phone: (352) 797-4124 (352) 442-7891 (Cell)

Email. Melvin.ReeseJr@freshfromflorida.com

Description of Work:  Aggregate for Withlacoochee State Forest

Service Dates: Dates must demonstrate at least one (1) continucus year May 3, 2018 to 21/06/2018

Approximate Contract Value: $ 705,400.00

Company Name: (J.S. Army Contracting Command-Rock Island

Address: Depot Support Branch - CCRC-AA3055 Rodman Avenue, Bldg. 60Rock Island, I1. 61299-8000

Contact Name: Sheila Peters

Alternate Contact Name:

Phone:  Commercial: (309) 782-0703, DSN: 793-0703

Emai: sheila.k.peters2.civ@mail.mil

Description of Work: 10000 ton of Material shall be Type A Base Course

Service Dates: Dales must demonstrate at least one (1) continucus year | Nov 2018 to February9, 2019

Approximate Contract Value: $ 162,400.00

Company Name: pA4819 325TH CONTRACTING SQ

Address: 119 ALABAMA AVE STE 1, AF BPN NO MILSBILLS PROCESSES, TYNDALL AFB, FL 32403 5005

Contact Name:  Chris Pendergrast

Alternate Contact Name: Zachery Pullen, Contracting Officer

Phone:  (850) 283-9625

Email: christopher.pendergrast@us.af.mil

Description of Work: the Crushed Concrete solicitation FA4819-19-Q-3007-A001.

Service Dates: Dales must demonslrate at least one (1) continucus year | 2/27/2019 to Ongoing

Approximate Contract Value: $ 451,840.00




FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF STATE
Division of Corporations

May 9, 2018

CSC

Qualification documents for GREEN DREAM INTERNATIONAL LLC were filed on
May 8, 2018, and assigned document number M18000004443. Please refer to this
number whenever corresponding with this office.

Your limited liability company is authorized to transact business in Florida as of the file
date.

To maintain "active" status with the Division of Corporations, an annual report must be
filed yearly between January 1st and May 1st beginning in the year following the file
date or effective date indicated above. If the annual report is not filed by May 1st, a
$400 late fee will be added.

A Federal Employer Identification Number (FEI/EIN) will be required when this report is
filed. Apply today with the IRS online at:

htips://sa.www4.irs.gov/modiein/individual/index.jsp.
Please notify this office if the limited liability company address changes.

Should you have any questions regarding this matter, please contact this office at the
address given below.

Octavia L Simmons

Regulatory Specialist 11

Registration Section

Division of Corporations Letter Number: 218A00009554

Account number: 120000000195 Amount charged: 125.00

www.sunbiz.org
Division of Corporations - P.O. BOX 6327 -Tallahassee, Florida 32314



APPLICATION BY FOREIGN LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY FOR AUTHORIZATION TO TRANSACT BUSINESS
' IN FLORIDA

IN COMPLIANCE WITH SECTION 6050902, [FLORIDA STATUTES, THE FOLLOWING 1S SUBMITTED TO REGISTER A FOREIGN LIMITED LIABILITY
COMPANY TO TRANSACT BUSINESS INTHE STATE OF FLORIDA:

| Green Dream International LLC
(Namc of Forcign Limited Liability Company; must include “Limited Liability Company,” "L.L.C.,” or "LLC.™)

(If name unavailable, enter alteniate name adopted for the purpose of transacting business in Tlorida. The altemnate name must include *Limited Liability Campany,” “"L.L.C." or “LLC.")

4 Arkansas 2
(Jurisdiction wnder the law of which foreign limited Tiability company is arganized) - (FEI number, if applicable) B
4. fet)
(Date furst transacted business in Florida, if prior (o rewistration.
(Sce scetions 6050904 & 605.0905., F.S. ta detennine penalty liability) - £y
. o . .
5 2331 Mill Rd, STE 100 6. 2331 Mill Rd, Ste 100 Gl e
(Streel Address of Principal Office) (Mailing Address) S C‘,G \,‘- k)
Alexandria,VA,22314 Alexandria, VA, US, 22314 <* he)
:?1_‘.’,
3 (58]

7. Name and street address of Flovida registered agent: (P.O. Box NOT acceptable)

Name: Corporation Service Company

Office Address: 1201 Hays Street

Tallahassee Florida 32301
(City) (Zip code)

Registered agent’s acceptance:

Having been numed us registered agent and to accept service of process for the ubove stated limited liability compuny at the place
designated in this application, I hereby accept the appointment us registered agent and agree to act in this capacity. I further agree
to comply with the provisions of all statutes relative to the proper and L'amplel;' performance of my duties, and I am familiar with

and accept the obligations of my po%&r as rtegiie/i&gent. p E mﬂ
/s yid y Cot

A ond ‘ ) n .
(I{cgiﬂcrct;Fﬂcnl's siguature) CAonl, Vlce FrCSIdent
8. The name, title or capacily and address of the perso@vho has/have gdthority to manage isfarc:
Title or Capacity: Name and Address: itle or Capacity: Name and Address:
President Varand Vartanian
2331 Mill Rd, Ste 100
Alexandria, VA 22314

(Use attachments if nccessary)

9. Attached is a certificate of existence, no more than 90 days old, duly authenticated by the official having custody of records in the
jurisdiction under the law of which it is organized. (If the certificate is in a foreign language, a translation of the certificate under oath

of the translator must be submitted) /J/.
( ';in
” .

Signature of an aullunlimﬁ)gr?tm

10. This document is exccuted in accordance with section 605.0203 (1) (b), Florida Statutes. I am aware that any false information
submitted in a document to the Department of State constitutes a third degree felony as provided for ins.817.155, F.S.

Varand Vartanian

Typed or printed pame of sigues



Arkansas Secretary of State
Mark Martin

State Capitol Building ¢ Little Rock, Arkansas 72201-1094 ¢ 501-682-3409

Certificate of Good Standing

I, Mark Martin, Secretary of State of the State of Arkansas, and as such, keeper of the records
of domestic and foreign corporations, do hereby certify that the records of this office show

GREEN DREAM INTERNATIONAL LLC

authorized (o transact business in the State of Arkansas as a Limited Liability Company, filed
Articles of Organization in this office June 26, 2009.

Our records reflect that said entity, having complied with all statutory requirements in the State
of Arkansas, is qualified to transact business in this State.

In Testimony Whereof, [ have hereunto set my hand
and aftixed my official Seal. Done at my office in the
City of Little Rock, this 4th day of May 2018,

Mark Martin
gﬁﬁf\%tm:ﬂ&m%ﬁlhon’zmion Code: 948a29a0ca3254c

To verify the Authorization Cade, visit sos.arkansas.gov




Selected list of Green Dream International Contracts

Award Date State Contract No. Contract Subject Client Contract Value
4/9/2019 Texas 5166 Aggregate The Lower Colorado River Authority $1,403,619.00
3/14/2019 Florida FWC 18/19-82 Aggregate Florida Fish And Wildlife Conservation Commission $58,164.00
212712019 Florida FA481919PA012 Crushed Concrele Departiment Of Air Force $451,840.00
2/14/2019 Florida FWC 18/19-50 Limerock Florida Fish And Wildlife Conservation Commission $95,000.00
21412019 New York 15BBR0O19PUIN30001 Paving Roadway Department Of Justice $115,5675.20
1/16/2019 Nevada 80DOT-S448/8644 Aggregale State Of Nevada $1,544 594 00
1/14/2019 Florida 33975 Limestone St. Johns River Water Management District $94,500.00
1/1/2019 Florida 19-22 Ready Mix Concrele City Of Oviedo, Seminole County $555.665.00

12/19/2018 Florida 19-TO0033/TPR Stabilizer Hermando County, Florida $198,450.00
1211412018 | South Carolina 43817 MBC Stone Florence County Government $192,479.00
12/11/2018 California 2000001693 Soil Los Angeles Unified School District $178,309.00
11130/2018 Flonda B-6-19-12/Aggregate #57 & Pea Gravel Brevard County, Florida $587,193.00
11/13/2018 California IFB-18015 Road Gravel Orange County, California $489,900.00
11/1/2018 | North Carolina 4800029214 Aggregate North Carolina Department Of Transportation $135,000.00
1012412018 Florida $-4200-G1556 Lime Stone Elofida Department %L‘r“?iggz"um And Consumex $110,430.00
10/22/2018 | North Carolina NE11836651 Sand 1 Asphalt North Carolina Creswell $135,000.00
10/1/2018 Florida PO #5-4200-G1480 Supply(Of Fish Grade Florida Department Of Agncul(ure And Consumer $47,385.00
Limestone Services
9/28/2018 Florida $-4200-G1509 Finish Grade Lime Rock Flandw Bepsriment %L’:‘\g:g‘s‘""re Mg Eonumer $142,970.00
9/26/2018 New York 4000123216 Ballast, Trap Rock MTA Long Island Rail Road $3,740,000.00
9/9/2018 Washington 140P8318P0074 Rip Rap National Park Service, Ashford Washington $103,975.40
9/1/2018 Florida 4500099155 Limerock Brevard County Government Center, Florida $80,953.63
9/1/2018 Kansas W91QF4-16-A-0006 Aggregate MICC Fort Leavenworth, Kansas $146,095.60
71312018 California OP-MT-18-001 Ballast # 3 Sonoma-Marin Area Rail Transit (SMART), California $99.486.56
5/22/2018 North Dakota W901UZ-18-P-5008 Class 5 Aggregale W901uz Uspfo For North Dakota $127,700.00
5/1/2018 Montana PO # 140P1418P0094 Aggregate National Park Service. Glacier NP MT $45,880.00
4117/2018 Texas 199442 Surace |{aKimEn; Denton County, Texas $169,000.00
Aggregate
4/1312018 | North Carolina 0OQT-4800028756 Sand 1-S North Carolina Department Of Transportation $59,850.00
4/13/2018 | North Carolina 4800028755 Aggregate ABC North Carolina Department Of Transportation $157,500.00
4/13/2018 Tennessee 140F0418P0163 Rip Rap And Limestone Fish & Wild Service, Division Of Contracting And GR $23,6596.88
41012018 Wyoming 140L.6218P0037 Agg'egg':afé:‘:g‘g 13, Department Of The Interior $17,994.00
4/5/2018 Tennessee 140F0418P0156 Limestone Depariment Of The Interior $70,789.63
3/30/2018 Florida S-4200-F2616 # 57 And Sand Florida Repadment %Zggg:"“m g Sonmunag §703,400.00
3/23/2018 Michigan 12569R18D0006 Road Repair IDIQ Department Of Agricullure $10,000,000.00
3/19/2018 West Virginia 12343418D0002 Agaregate Department Of Agricullure $39,999.65
3/16/2018 Mississippi 140F0418P0137 Rip Rap And Limeslone Department Of The Interior $49,398.00
2/2212018 Pennsylvania 4300576052 Aggregate DCNR-PA $207,049.50
2/21/2018 lowa W912EK-16-A-0004 Aggregate Department Of Army $14,005.00
2121/2018 Virginia 46367 Stone Department Of Transportation $143,500.00
2/15/2018 Missouri 605SE 18001588 Limestone Department Of Transportation $58,185.00
2115/2018 Oklahoma W52P1J-17-D-3000 Base Course Department Of Army $163,100.00
2/14/2018 | North Carolina 4800028602 Sand Department Of Transportation $117,000.00
2/2i2018 Missouri IFB605SE18001513 Pug Mill Aggregate Department Of Transportation $110,790.00
2/1/12018 Missouri 1516 Pug Mill Aggregate Depariment Of Transportation $448,200.00
1/31/2018 | South Carolina 1747118 W S'°’§°::; Dietic® South Carolina Florence County $283,106.26
113112018 | South Carolina 16-17/18 Ma°ada';‘h3‘s’:ezc°“’s‘h South Carolina Florence County $408,996.00
1/23/12018 North Dakota 18P0020P00001 Eggerts Playground Department Of The Army $58,724.00
1/1/12018 California 140P8418P0013. Aggregate Department Of The Interior $23,902.84
12/29/2017 Mississippi 140F0418Q0011 Crushed Limestone Us Fish & Wildlife Service $24,188.45
1212812017 | South Carolina 103732 M“ada’;,‘hz‘;‘:e1c°“’se‘ Florence County $534,996.00
12/1412017 | North Carolina 4800028458 Aggregale State Of North Carolina $123,750.00
12/14/2017 Oklahoma 56584 Class A Sand State Of Oklahoma $19,950.00
12/4/2017 | North Carolina NC8672 Aggregale State Of North Carolina $11,025.00
12/4/12017 | North Carolina NC8694 Aggregate State Of North Carolina $11,815.00
12/4/2017 | North Carolina NC6041 ABC Aggregate State Of North Carolina $24.500.00
1111712017 | South Carolina 4400017562 Rip Rap, C's":::' R A South Carolina Department of Transportation $163,231.00
10/20/2017 | South Carolina 4400017421 BallasUGranile Slone South Carolina Department of Nalural Resources $39,750.00
10/18/2017 Okiahoma W52P1J-17-D-3000 Aggreqale Department Of The Army $2.937.250.00
9/29/2017 California W91152-17-P-1077 Base Rock & Sand Depariment Of The Army $93,146.00
9/27/12017 Kansas W912DQ17A1015 Gravel Department Of The Army $37,502.62
912712017 Nebraska W912DQ17A1015x Rip Rap Department Of The Army $59,316.40
9/22/2017 Florida F17PX02523 Ditch Lining & Limerock Department Of The Interior $109,951.00
9/21/2017 Indiana F17PX02612 Gravel Big Oaks U.S. Fish & Wildlife Service $25,000.00




9/20/2017 California AG-9ACT7-P-17-0224 Gravel Us Fish & Wildlife Service $37,536.00
9/15/2017 Tennessee F17PX02386 Limestone & Gabjon Depariment Of The Interior $20,943.00
91112017 | North Carolina F17PX02027 i G,?"‘;?"as'“e' and Department Of The Interior $428,075.00
_n~ipRap .
8/31/2017 Washington W9123F-17-A-0007 Gravel, Sand & Rock Department Of The Army §14,950.00
8/28/2017 | South Carolina 4400016975 Granite Stone South Carolina Deparlment of Transportation $12,780.00
8/23/2017 Missouri F17PX01877 Sl (Ds'i')';’:; d";‘ Taligaie U.S. Fish & Wildiife Service $25,000.00
8/23/2017 | South Carolina 4400016967 Cr14 Crusher Run South Carolina General Services $47,275.00
8/18/2017 | South Carolina 4400016940 MLBC South Carolina Department of Transportation $194,700.00
8/14/2017 Washington L16PA00088 Crushed Aggregate Department Of The Interior $19,995.00
818/2017 South Carolina 4600584183 CR14 Crusher Run South Carolina Department of Correction $22.,692.00
6/2312017 Washinglon P16PC00727 Paving In Elwha & Mora Department Of The Interior $29,740.00
6/16/2017 Oregon AG-04N7-C-17-0020 Fish Gravel Department Of Agricullure $44,667.00
6/15/2017 Louisiana F17PX01191 Replace Rock Pile Department Of The Interior $45,270.65
6/15/2017 Mississippi F17PX00140 Red Clay Dirt Department Of The Interior §22,667.00
6/14/2017 |  Wisconsin | W911SA-17-D-1002 CmShegeZ‘:';gl‘é'ave" b Department Of The Army $6,960,308.20
6/2/2017 |  Montana FA462617p0p26 | SUPPIYING Base Course And Department Of Air Force $29,801.00
6/1/2017 Maryland W912K6-17-Q0025 Gravel And Geotexlile National Guard Bureau Of Dept. Of The Army $36,095.34
5/30/2017 Pennsylvania W912KC-17-P-0077 Dark Limestone Department Of The Army $14,316.50
511212017 Pennsylvania 4300544693 Callen Run DSA Slale Of Pennsylvania $99,970.00
411212017 Louisiana F17PX00351 Red Clay Dirt Department Of The Interior $77,200.00
41712017 California ' N00244-17-P-0254 Crushed Gravel Depariment Of The Navy $29,886.90
4/4/2017 Tennessee W912P5-17-P-0047 Supply Of Beach Sand Us Army Corps Of Engineers $26,124.00
31312017 Pennsylvania 4300543889 Top Soil Slate Of Pennsylvania $20,216.25
21912017 West Virginia AG-3434-C-16-0003 Gravel Us Fish & Wildlife Service $1,000,000.00
9/19/2016 Washington P16PC00727 Paving In Elwha & Mora Department Of The Interior $141,263.00
9i/2/2016 Colorado R16PX00867 Aggregate Stockpile Bureau Of Reclamalion $136,000.00
91112016 Kansas W91QF4-16-A-0006 Rock & Ice Control Department Of The Army $665,000.00
8/16/2016 Washington LIGPB00766 Crushed Aggregate Department Of The Interior $18,987.50
7/29/2016 Florida FA4819-16-P-3037 Crushed Concrete Department Of The Air Force $47,470.00
712712016 Oklahoma W44WIM-16-P-0393 Rock Deparlment Of The Army $116,600.00
7/127/2016 Washinglon R16PX00673 Wildcal Riprap Supply Depanliment Of The Interior $11,960.00
7/25/2016 | South Carolina W912QG-16-C-0004 Gravel Department Of The Army $699,815.00
7i15/2016 Arizona P16PX02223 Road Base Depariment Of The Interior $21,585.00
7/6/12016 Ohio W91364-16-P-0119 Gravel Aggregates Department Of The Army $11,728.60
5/11/2016 Pennsylvania 4300505388 Top Soil Pennsylvania Depariment of Transportation $30,640.50
412912016 Washington 310PO1612109 Pit Run Stale Of Washington $22.500.00
4/11/2016 Washington 4600011575 Crushed Aggregale Cily Of Tacoma, Washinglon $196,940.00
41712016 South Carolina W9124C-16-P-0033 Ballast Rocks Department Of The Army $27,000.00
4/1/2016 Arkansas W911RP-16-D-0001 Roadway Materials Department Of The Army $270,752.00
3/30/2016 Washington R16PX00263 Gravel, Sand, Rip-Rap Department Of The Interior $11,120.00
3/9/2016 Washington R16PX00263 Gravel, Sand, Rip-Rap Depariment Of The Interior $14,208.00
212912016 Washington F16PX00463 Rock Delivery Deparlment Of The Interior $21,203.00
2/9/2016 Ohio P16PX00580 D F',::’o'jesc‘;"’a" B Department Of The Interior $21,185.00
215/2016 California F16PX00429 Rooling Replacement Department Of The Interior $29,688.00
21312016 Wisconsin W912ES-16-D-0004 Rock Deparlment Of The Army $321,989.96
12/21/2015 | South Carolina 4400012170 FLBC Limestone Slale Of South Carolina $74,520.00
10/18/2015 Oklahoma W52P1J-15-D-3036 Aggregale Deparlment Of The Army $3,000,000.00
10/15/2015 Arizona 11135-C Aggregale Malerials Maricopa Counly-Arizona $1,063,500.00
9/2212015 Colorado P15PX04247 Crusher Fines Department Of The Interior $39.071.00
9/10/2015 Guam FA5240-15-P-0162 Crushed Stone Deparlment Of The Air Force $45,340.00
8/25/2015 Texas F15PS00955 Limestone Road Base Department Of The Interior $76,844.55
71712015 lllinois W52P1J-16-D-3036 Aggregale US Army Conlracling Command Rock Island $3,33,200.00
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GREEN DREAM

Bui&an? 7!)&% green dreams

June 26, 2019

Alachua County Procurement, 3rd Floor
County Administration Building

12 SE Ist Street

Gainesville, Florida 32601-6983

SUBJECT: 20-50/ Annual Course and Fine Aggregate Materials

Dear Theodore White,

We are plcased to give you our offer for this bid.
Attached you will also find the files below:

1. Bidders Check List

2. Bid Form

3. Exhibit B

4. Small Business Enterprise (SBE)

5. Drug Free Workplace

6. Public Record Declaration or Claim of Exemption
7. Bidder's Questionnaire

8. certificate of Insurance and worker comp

9. Green Dream Registration in Florida

10. List of Contract-Green Dream International

Please also note that Green Dream is registered in SAM.

Should you have further questions, please contact Mark Alexander at telephone number
814-258-6366 or e-mail m.alexander@gdicompany.com.

Best Regards,

Mark Alexander

Account Manager

Green Dream International
Phone: 814-258-6366
Fax: 202-204-8444

California Office Michigan Office Pennsylvania Office Oklahoma Office
5960 South Land Park Dr #514 1098 Ann Arbor Rd West #280 32 W. 8h st. #607 133 24th Ave NW #290
Sacramento, CA 95822 Plymouth, M1 48170 Erie, PA 16501 Norman, OK 73069



Green Dream International
32 W. 8th St. suite no 607
Erie, PA 16501

Tel: 814-616-7800

Alachua County Procurement,

Third Floor County Administration Building
12 SE 1st Street

Gainesville, Florida 32601-6983

Bid Number: 20-50 /Annual Course and Fine Aggregate Materials”
Bid Subject: Annual Course and Fine Aggregate Materials
Closing Date: 2:00 pm, Wednesday, June 26, 2019




