BID Responsiveness and SBE Recap Form

Bid #/ Name: 20-50 Annual Course and Fine Aggregate Materials
BOD: Wednesday, July 3, 2019
Purchasing Agent: TJ White | Via: | |Brian Singleton/Vernon Williams
Local Final Adjusted SBE Participation per EO* Signed Addendum Drug| Public Sub
Vendor Name Vendor Bid Bid Award Bid SBE | SuB GFE Price Preference | Bid Acknowledge | GFE |GMW]| Free | Record | Cont Comments
(Y/N) | Ranking Price ** $ (Y/N) % (Y/N) % $ Form #1 #2 | Form|Form| Form| Exp Form
Green Dream International LLC N #VALUE! see bid form n 0% OPT #4 | 0% $0.00 yes no no y n/a Y n n/a sPl:Jl?r:iqcittzzcord Exp not
Junction City Mining N #VALUE! see bid form n 0% Opt#3 | 0% $0.00 yes no no n/a | n/a y y n/a igoggzcv)g::ggri LRlUidotEes
$0.00 0% $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00

* Per Equal Opportunity Office, is a SBE or a 15% SBE participation goal was met for the County's SBE Program and is awarded a price preference.
** Adjusted Bid Award Price EQUALS the Bid amount MINUS the Price Preference (SBE) amount for the base award consideration

Key: SBE = Small Business Enterprise; SUB = Subcontractor Form; GFE = Good Faith Effort

Did Not Bid on ALL Items

Non-responsive Bid

\\prod-netapp-gm-as-fsas.tops.gdi\insite_data_prod\files\ALAC\Attachments\Oefd22e0-c2fd-41bc-8349-5348da66f90f




20-50 Annual Course and Fine Aggregate Materials

Green Dream International LLC

Junctioni City Mining

AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID AMOUNT BID
Coarse Agg regate Per Ton (DE/I__\:\\A/(;lRJ\,\:TZ%EE ) (DELIVEIFI{)Y -ZONE (DELIVEIIIR;)Y -ZONE (DELIVEI\R;;/ -ZONE Tg'\lfllo(lFJ’ll\alr-::[ E:EKP_ EF;)
Asphalt # 89 (CPS #89), per ton $47.45 $47.45 $44.13 $44.13 $29.40
ASTM #67, per ton $49.55 $49.55 $46.23 $46.23 $31.50
ASTM #57, per ton $49.55 $49.55 $46.23 $46.23 $31.50
ASTM #78, per ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ASTM #4, per ton $49.55 $49.55 $46.23 $46.23 $31.50
ASTM #7, per Ton $49.55 $49.55 $46.23 $46.23 $31.50
RIPRAP Ditch Lining $85.52 $85.52 $84.86 $80.43 $63.00
RIPRAP Bedding Stone $79.22 $79.22 $78.56 $74.13 $56.70
SUB TOTAL “A” (Eight (8
(Eight (8) $410.39 $410.39 $392.47 $383.61 $275.10
above Items)
SubTotal by Zone $1,871.96
Ol Ol (0]
Fine Aggregate et e | OSUVERY 20N | OELVERY-zove | oRLvERY-zove SO0 207
SILICA SAND, per ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GRANITE FINES
46.40 46.40 43.08 43.08 28.35
/SCREENINGS, per ton s ¥ s s s
SUB TOTAL “B $46.40 $46.40 $43.08 $43.08 $28.35
(Two (2) above Items)
SubTotal by Zone $207.31
Grand TOTAL $2,079.27

Key :
Award, Primary

AMOUNT BID | AMOUNT BID | AMOUNT BID | AMOUNT BID AMPCE)ENI:{)ED
(DELIVERY - | (DELIVERY - | (DELIVERY - | (DELIVERY - (Plant PICK-
Coarse Aggregate Per Ton ZONE ) ZONE 1) ZONE I1I) ZONE IV) UP)
Asphalt # 89 (CPS #89), per ton $41.00 $40.00 $39.00 $39.00 $32.00
ASTM #67, per ton $41.00 $40.00 $39.00 $39.00 $32.00
ASTM #57, per ton $41.00 $40.00 $39.00 $39.00 $32.00
ASTM #78, per ton $41.00 $40.00 $39.00 $39.00 $32.00
ASTM #4, per ton $41.00 $40.00 $39.00 $39.00 $32.00
ASTM #7, per Ton $41.00 $40.00 $39.00 $39.00 $32.00
RIPRAP Ditch Lining $80.00 $79.00 $78.00 $78.00 $70.00
RIPRAP Bedding Stone $80.00 $79.00 $78.00 $78.00 $70.00
SUB TOTAL Iﬁ; 'rr(lg)ight (8) above $365.00 $358.00 $351.00 $351.00 $300.00
SubTotal by Zone $1,725.00
AMOUNT BID | AMOUNT BID | AMOUNT BID | AMOUNT BID AMPCE)I;JNI'I)E:D
(DELIVERY - | (DELIVERY - | (DELIVERY - | (DELIVERY - (Plant PICK-
Fine Aggregate ZONE I) ZONE II) ZONE Il1) ZONE IV) UP)
SILICA SAND, per ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GRANITE FINES /SCREENINGS, $41.00 $40.00 $39.00 $39.00 $32.00
per ton
SUB TOTAL "B $41.00 $40.00 $39.00 $39.00 $32.00
(Two (2) above Items)
SubTotal by Zone $191.00
Grand TOTAL $1,916.00




