BID Responsiveness and SBE Recap Form

Bid #/ Name: 20-1 Annual Limerock Hauling Services
BOD: Wednesday, June 26, 2019
Procurement Agent: TJ White | Via: |Brian Singleton/Ramon Gaverette
Local Final Adjusted SBE Participation per EO* Signed Addendum Drug| Public Sub
Vendor Name Vendor Bid Bid Award Bid SBE SUB GFE Price Preference Bid Acknowledge | GFE |GMW)| Free | Record | Cont Comments
(Y/N) | Ranking Price ** $ (Y/N) % (Y/N) % $ Form Form| Form| Form| Exp Form
Preferred Materials, Inc N $0.00 see bid form N 0% OPT #2 | 0% $0.00 yes N/A n/a | n/a Y Y n/a
VE Whitehurst & Sons Inc N $0.00 see bid form N 0% OPT #2 | 0% $0.00 yes N/A n/a | n/a Y Y n/a
$0.00 0% $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00

* Per Equal Opportunity Office, is a SBE or a 15% SBE participation goal was met for the County's SBE Program and is awarded a price preference.
** Adjusted Bid Award Price EQUALS the Bid amount MINUS the Price Preference (SBE) amount for the base award consideration

Key: SBE = Small Business Enterprise; SUB = Subcontractor Form; GFE = Good Faith Effort

Did Not Bid on ALL Items

Non-responsive Bid
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20-1 Annual Limerock Hauling Services

PERFERRED MATERIALS

VE WHITEHURST & SONS INC

Superpave Asphaltic Concrete, Structural Course, Cost ($) per Ton

Superpave Asphaltic Concrete, Structural Course, Cost ($) per Ton

TONS SP-9.5 SP-12.5 TONS SP-9.5 SP-12.5
0-150 $66.00 $66.00 0-150 $72.90 $68.50
151-250 $65.00 $65.00 151-250 $72.90 $68.50
251-500 $65.00 $65.00 251-500 $72.90 $68.50
501-1000 $65.00 $65.00 501-1000 $72.90 $68.50
Over 1001 $65.00 $65.00 Over 1001 $72.90 $68.50
Superpave Asphaltic Concrete, Friction Course, Cost ($) per Ton Superpave Asphaltic Concrete, Friction Course, Cost ($) per Ton
0-150 $90.00 $88.00 0-150 $88.30 $81.00
151-250 $90.00 $88.00 151-250 $88.30 $81.00
251-500 $90.00 $88.00 251-500 $88.30 $81.00
501-1000 $90.00 $88.00 501-1000 $88.30 $81.00
Over 1001 $90.00 $88.00 Over 1001 $88.30 $81.00
Liquid Asphalt, Cost ($) per Gallon Liquid Asphalt, Cost ($) per Gallon

TYPE TYPE
TYPE | NTSS-1HM TYPE | NTSS-1HM
GALLON | TIPERSA | eS| TER | ik | e | | GavLon | TPERSS | TPERS? |TPERS) Acp' | e
Prime Tack Prime Tack

0-500 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID [ NOBID 0-500 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
501-1000 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID [ NOBID 501-1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
1001-2000 NO BID NO BID NOBID [ NOBID | NOBID 1001-2000 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID
Over 2001 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID [ NOBID Over 2001 NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID

Key: Awarded by Line Item (Asphalt Type)

Awarded Prime

Awarded Secondary




