
BID Responsiveness and SBE Recap Form

Bid # / Name: 20-4 Annual Limerock Hauling Services

BOD:

Purchasing Agent: Via: Brian Singleton/Ramon Gaverette

Local Final Adjusted Signed Addendum Drug Public Sub

Vendor Bid Bid Award Bid SBE SUB GFE Bid Acknowledge GFE GMW Free Record Cont

(Y/N) Ranking Price ** $ (Y/N) % (Y/N) % $ Form Form Form Form Exp Form

Coleman Construction, Inc. Y #VALUE! see bid form n 0% OPT #2 0% $0.00 yes NO n/a n/a Y Y n/a

Green Dream International N #VALUE! see bid form n 0% OPT #4 0% $0.00 yes YES n/a n/a Y Y n/a

VE Whitehurst & Sons Inc N #VALUE! see bid form n 0% OPT #2 0% $0.00 yes YES n/a n/a Y Y n/a

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

* Per Equal Opportunity Office, is a SBE or a 15% SBE participation goal was met for the County's SBE Program and is awarded a price preference.

** Adjusted Bid Award Price EQUALS  the Bid amount MINUS the Price Preference (SBE) amount for the base award consideration

Key: SBE = Small Business Enterprise; SUB = Subcontractor Form; GFE = Good Faith Effort

Did Not Bid on ALL Items

Non-responsive Bid

Wednesday, June 26, 2019

TJ White

SBE Participation per EO*

Vendor Name CommentsPrice Preference
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Coleman Const Green Dream VE Whitehurst

MINE-BASE LIMEROCK

ZONE
COST PER 

TON

COST PER 

TON

COST PER 

TON

ZONE I    - WESTERN COUNTY LINE to CR 241 $10.75 $14.00 $11.50

ZONE II   - N.W. 143RD STREET to SR 121 $10.75 $14.72 $12.60

ZONE III  - SR 121 to SR 200 (US 301) $15.00 $15.39 $13.70

ZONE IV  - SR 20 (US 301) to EASTERN COUNTY LINE $15.25 $16.05 $14.00

MINE-BASE LIME ROCK SUBTOTAL $51.75 $60.16 $51.80

MINE-STABILIZING LIMEROCK

ZONE I    - WESTERN COUNTY LINE to CR 241 $10.75 $14.00 $11.50

ZONE II   - N.W. 143RD STREET to SR 121 $10.75 $14.72 $12.60

ZONE III  - SR 121 to SR 200 (US 301) $15.00 $15.39 $13.70

ZONE IV  - SR 20 (US 301) to EASTERN COUNTY LINE $15.25 $16.05 $14.80

MINE-STABILIZING LIMEROCK SUBTOTAL $51.75 $60.16 $52.60

TOP/BIG ROCK LIMEROCK*

ZONE I    - WESTERN COUNTY LINE to CR 241 $11.50 $14.58 no bid

ZONE II   - N.W. 143RD STREET to SR 121 $11.50 $15.26 no bid

ZONE III  - SR 121 to SR 200 (US 301) $15.50 $15.93 no bid

ZONE IV  - SR 20 (US 301) to EASTERN COUNTY LINE $15.75 $16.61 no bid

MINE-STABILIZING LIMEROCK SUBTOTAL $54.25 $62.38 $0.00

GRAND TOTAL $157.75 $182.70 $104.40

Key: Awarded by Line Item Cost per Zone:

Awarded Prime

Awarded Secondary

* NO secondary for Top/Big Rock Limerock


