BID Responsiveness and SBE Recap Form

Bid # / Name: Bid #20-12: Annual Equipment Rental Services
BOD: Wednesday, May 22, 2019
Purchasing Agent: TJ White | Via: |Brian Singleton/Vernon Williams
Local Final Adjusted SBE Participation per EO* Signed Addendum Drug| Public
Vendor Name Vendor Bid Bid Award Bid SBE | SUB | GFE (Y/N)| Price Preference Bid Acknowledge | Free | Record Comments
(Y/N) | Ranking Price ** $ (Y/N) % Opt #2 % $ Form #1 Form| Exp
Sunbelt Rentals, Inc N #VALUE! See Bid Form N 0% Opt #2 0% | #VALUE! Y Y Y Y See Damage waiver Details page 13
United Rentals (North America), Inc. Y #VALUE! See Bid Form N 0% Opt #2 0% | #VALUE! Y N Y Y See Execptions
Ring Power Corporation Y #VALUE! See Bid Form N 0% Opt#2 | 0% | #VALUE! Y Y Y Y ICIS:QRSZFZ::;I/F' modify Indemenification
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00

* Per Equal Opportunity Office, is a SBE or a 15% SBE participation goal was met for the County's SBE Program and is awarded a price preference.
** Adjusted Bid Award Price EQUALS the Bid amount MINUS the Price Preference (SBE) amount for the base award consideration.

Key: SBE = Small Business Enterprise; SUB = Subcontractor Form; GFE = Good Faith Effort

Did Not Bid on ALL Items

Non-responsive Bid
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Bid #20-12: Annual Equipment Rental Services

BID ITEMS Sunbelt Rentals, Inc United Rentals
Damage Mobilization Damage | Mobilization

Per Day Per Week Per Month Waiver Charge Per Day Per Week Per Month Waiver Charge
200 Ton Air Cooled Chiller, List MGF NO BIDME
(Generator Set For Power 2 - 100 foot 6 Inch Flex Hose, 2-6" Bolt Flanges); $1,400.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 15% | $1,200.00 $1,450.00 $2,875.00 $8,550.00 14% TBD
Mgf NO BIDme: _TRANE
See above with Genrator $4,000.00 $9,000.00 $25,000.00 15% $2,400.00
800 Ton Air Cooled Chiller, List MGF NO BIDME
(Generator Set For Power 2 - 75 foot 8 Inch Flex Hose, 2-8” Bolt Flanges); $5,200.00 $12,000.00 $36,000.00 15% $3,600.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $24,000.00 14% TBD
Mgf NO BIDme: TRANE
See above with Genrator $11,200.00 $26,000.00 $76,000.00 15% $9,400.00
4000 Watt Towable Light Tower $79.00 $250.00 $521.00 15% $250.00 $98.00 $242.00 $495.00 14% 95 /95
329D Skid Steer Loader W/Rubber Tracks; or, equivalent $328.00 $915.00 $2,323.00 15% $250.00 $317.00 $895.00 $1,885.00 14% 95/95
Caterpillar 272C Skid Steer Loader $236.00 $668.00 $1,802.00 15% $250.00 $345.00 $975.00 $2,150.00 14% 95/95
2400 Ib Skidsteer Loader with solid tires $265.00 $825.00 $1,650.00 15% $150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID | NOBID
750 Ib Skidsteer Track Loader Walk behind Vermeer S725TX or equivalent $255.00 $795.00 $1,475.00 15% $150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID
Hydraulic hammer/breaker attachment for a skidsteer loader $230.00 $668.00 $1,702.00 15% $150.00 $198.00 $595.00 $1,450.00 14%
Caterpillar 950H Wheel Loader 0 0
(Must have an A/C cab and a 3.5 GYD bucket.): or, equivalent $432.00 $1,591.00 $4,496.00 15% $400.00 $750.00 $1,845.00 $4,800.00 14% 95/95
Air Handler 120 Ton
(Banded Cable 50°, Hose TPU Chiller 6”x50’, Cable Tail #2 Female) $850.00 $1,250.00 $3,750.00 15% $600.00 $500.00 $975.00 $2,995.00 14% TBD
Frontend loader w/ 3 yard bucket $650.00 $1,980.00 $3,895.00 15% $400.00 $1,695.00 $4,250.00 14% 95/95
Caterpillar AP-800D Paver (Must have a power receptacle wiring, auger/feeder
control, oscillating 8” push roller, standard bogie system and a 6” auger pair NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID
extension.)
Caterpillar CB-534D XW Vibratory Compactor Roller; or, equivalent NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $450.00 $1,136.00 $2,575.00 14% 95/95
TRU PAC 915 Roller With 9 Rubber Tires NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID




Bid #20-12: Annual Equipment Rental Services

BID ITEMS Sunbelt Rentals, Inc United Rentals
Damage Mobilization Damage | Mobilization

Per Day Per Week Per Month Waiver Charge Per Day Per Week Per Month Waiver Charge
35-39K HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR w/ THUMB HYD 30,000LB EXCAVATOR $770.00 $2,155.00 $4,785.00 15% $500.00 $704.00 $1,810.00 $4,100.00 14% 95/95
7500 Ib Mini Excavator $225.00 $795.00 $1,495.00 15% $150.00 $280.00 $750.00 $1,695.00 14% 95/95
60 hp Trencher w/ rockwheel $775.00 $2,000.00 $5,000.00 15% $500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID | NOBID
Emulsions Distributor Truck
(with a minimum of 2000 gal tank, spray bar width up to 16 ft) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $367.00 $1,140.00 $2,400.00 14% 95/95
John Deere 672D Motor Grader
(Must have an A/C cab.) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Leeboy Chall Il Broom Tractor
(Must have an A/C cab, brush width 7 ft minimum and a 150 gallon watering $295.00 $1,195.00 $2,355.00 15% $250.00 $425.00 $1,100.00 $2,300.00 14% 95/ 95
tank.)
308E with Fecon Mulching Head NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Weiler W530 Road Widener o NO BID NO BID NOBID [NOBID| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID
(Must have a rear steering and a 2 ft - 3 ft telescoping strike off group.)
Nissan Pneumatic Forklift, PFD50, 4,000 Ib, or equivalent $142.00 $378.00 $1,020.00 15% $250.00 $185.00 $535.00 $1,100.00 14% 95/95
HD Forklift, JCB506, 6000 Ib, All Terrain $248.00 $684.00 $1,813.00 15% $250.00 $370.00 $975.00 $1,825.00 14% 95/95
HD Scissor Lift, JLG, 20” Self Propelled $98.00 $214.00 $471.00 15% $250.00 $135.00 $235.00 $425.00 14% 95/95
Electric Scissor Lift — NO BIDrrow : 24°-26’ $140.00 $275.00 $550.00 15% $150.00 $180.00 $335.00 $595.00 14% 95/95
HD Ditch Witch, RT20, W: 4.5” x D: 36” $249.00 $691.00 $1,930.00 15% $250.00 $200.00 $595.00 $1,190.00 14% 95/95
Boom 125’ Articulating IC 4WD DSL Truck $1,495.00 $3,850.00 $7,150.00 15% $250.00 $1,300.00 $2,995.00 $5,900.00 14% 175/ 175
Arrow Skidsteer/Attachment/Pallet Forks/Stand Model: 503125-4 $32.00 $87.00 $244.00 15% $170.00 $37.00 $110.00 $220.00 14% 65/ 65




Bid #20-12: Annual Equipment Rental Services

BID ITEMS Sunbelt Rentals, Inc United Rentals
Per Day Per Week Per Month 33;?33? Mg‘;ztéon Per Day Per Week Per Month I\D,{}i;?jff Mocbri::rztéon
Diesel powered pump with 8” intake & 8” discharge $560.00 $1,500.00 $4,000.00 15% $750.00 $457.00 $914.00 $2,200.00 14% 250/ 250
20 ft section of 8” suction hose $40.00 $120.00 $300.00 15% $250.00 $65.00 $130.00 $220.00
20 ft section of 10” suction hose $70.00 $150.00 $450.00 15% $250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pressure Washer, gas, 3500 PSI $53.00 $170.00 $472.00 15% $150.00 $85.00 $260.00 $495.00 14% 95/95
Pressure Washer, 50’ hose extension $9.00 $22.00 $39.00 15% $150.00 $16.00 $33.00 $67.00
BOOM 60-64' Telescopic High Lift $142.00 $1,035.00 $1,885.00 15% $150.00 $390.00 $950.00 $1,950.00 14% 95 /95
TOTAL BID (sum of all bid items above) $30,468.00] $74,263.00] $201,573.00 $13,304.00]  $32,100.00|  $79,832.00 $0.00

Awarded by Line Item Cost:
Awarded Prime
No Bid ltems




