BID Responsiveness and SBE Recap Form

Bid #/ Name: 20-42 Annual Purchase of Drainage Infrastructure
BOD: Wednesday, June 5, 2019
Purchasing Agent: TJ White | Via: |Brian Singleton/Vernon Williams
Local Final Adjusted SBE Participation per EO* Signed Addendum Drug| Public Sub
Vendor Name Vendor Bid Bid Award Bid SBE SUB GFE Price Preference Bid Acknowledge | GFE |GMW)| Free | Record | Cont Comments
(Y/N) | Ranking Price ** $ (Y/N) % (Y/N) % $ Form Form| Form| Form| Exp Form
Changes made to BID FORM.
Contech Engineered Soloutions n #VALUE! see bid form n 0% OPT #2 | 0% $0.00 yes n/a n/a | n/a Y Y n/a |Signed both sections of Public
Records Exmept form
See changes to bid package
. . page 3, 5,6 (indmnification),
| 0, 0,
County Materials Corp n #VALUE! see bid form n 0% OPT #2 | 0% $0.00 yes n/a n/a | nla y y n/a and 7. See strike throughs in
insurance
Ferguson Waterworks n #VALUE! see bid form n 0% OPT #2 | 0% $0.00 yes n/a n/a | nla y y n/a Signed both sections of Public
Records Exmept form
Gulf Atlantic Culvert Co., Inc. n #VALUE! see bid form n 0% OPT #2 | 0% $0.00 yes n/a n/a | n/a y y n/a
Metal Culverts, Inc n #VALUE! see bid form n 0% OPT #2 | 0% $0.00 yes n/a nfa | n/a y y n/a
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00
$0.00 $0.00

* Per Equal Opportunity Office, is a SBE or a 15% SBE participation goal was met for the County's SBE Program and is awarded a price preference.
** Adjusted Bid Award Price EQUALS the Bid amount MINUS the Price Preference (SBE) amount for the base award consideration

Key: SBE = Small Business Enterprise; SUB = Subcontractor Form; GFE = Good Faith Effort

Did Not Bid on ALL Items

Non-responsive Bid
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BID: 20-42 Annual Purchase of Drainag

e Infrastructure

Bid Item Er(1:goirr]1fecr2d County Materials Ferguson Water Works GuguAl\t/I:rr;Uc Metal Culverts
CORRUGATED METAL PIPE ALUMINIZED TYPE Il MITERED END SECTIONS 4:1 SLOPE WITH ANCHORS
15" DIA, GAUGE 16 $116.87 no bid $237.00 $100.30 $99.40
18" DIA, GAUGE 16 $163.00 no bid $282.00 $137.78 $125.80
24" DIA, GAUGE 16 $529.70 no bid $390.00 $210.45 $187.60
36" DIA, GAUGE 14 $614.88 no bid $780.00 $539.68 $384.65
48" DIA, GAUGE 14 $1,039.20 no bid $1,025.00 $1,166.24 $601.15
$2,463.65 $0.00 $2,714.00 $2,154.45 $1,398.60
CORRUGATED METAL ARCH PIPE ALUMINIZED TYPE Il Ml].
17" DIA x13", GAUGE 16 $129.86 no bid no bid $115.49 $111.20
21" DIA x15", GAUGE 16 $181.11 no bid no bid $150.98 $146.50
28" DIA x20", GAUGE 16 $288.56 no bid no bid $248.55 $249.05
42" DIA x29", GAUGE 14 $683.20 no bid no bid $590.08 $466.35
57" DIA x38", GAUGE 12 $1,154.66 no bid no bid $1,384.20 $1,068.75
$2,437.39 $0.00 $0.00 $2,489.30 $2,041.85
CORRUGATED METAL ROUND PIPE ALUMINIZED TYPE Il
15” DIA, GAUGE 16, $13.41 no bid $16.05 $11.45 $10.64
18" DIA, GAUGE 16, $16.00 no bid $19.00 $13.41 $12.64
24" DIA, GAUGE 16, $21.37 no bid $25.65 $17.75 $16.91
36" DIA, GAUGE 14, $38.92 no bid $49.60 $34.97 $30.83
48" DIA, GAUGE 12, $51.90 no bid $64.00 $60.98 $57.10
$141.60 $0.00 $174.30 $138.56 $128.12
CORRUGATED METAL ARCH PIPE ALUMINIZED TYPE Il
17" DIAx13",GAUGE 16, $14.90 no bid $17.80 $13.62 $11.40
21" DIAx15",GAUGE 16, $17.78 no bid $21.00 $15.81 $13.40
28" DIAx20",GAUGE 16, $23.45 no bid $28.05 $21.56 $18.05
42" DIAX29",GAUGE 14, $43.24 no bid $54.30 $38.57 $32.15
57" DIAx38",GAUGE 12, $57.67 no bid $70.00 $65.78 $58.68
$157.04 $0.00 $191.15 $155.34 $133.68
CORRUGATED METAL ROUND PIPE BANDS ALUMINIZED TYPE Il MINIMUM 12" WIDE
15" DIA, GAUGE 18 $33.53 no bid $71.80 $28.62 $15.96
18" DIA, GAUGE 18 $40.00 no bid $85.80 $33.53 $18.96
24" DIA, GAUGE 18 $53.43 no bid $114.35 $44.37 $25.37
36" DIA, GAUGE 16 $97.30 no bid $208.20 $87.43 $46.25
48" DIA, GAUGE 16 $129.00 no bid $277.65 $152.45 $85.65
$353.26 $0.00 $757.80 $346.40 $192.19
CORRUGATED METAL ARCH PIPE BANDS ALUMINIZED TYPE Il MINIMUM 12" WIDE
17" DIA X 13", GAUGE 18 $33.53 no bid $71.80 $34.05 $17.10
21" DIA X 15", GAUGE 18 $40.00 no bid $85.80 $39.53 $28.44
28" DIA X 20”,GAUGE 18 $53.43 no bid $114.35 $53.90 $27.08
42" DIA X 29", GAUGE 16 $97.30 no bid $208.20 $96.43 $48.23
57" DIA X 38", GAUGE 16 $129.00 no bid $277.65 $164.45 $88.02
$353.26 $0.00 $757.80 $388.36 $208.87
NEOPRENE GASKETS
15” DIA, 3/8” x 77 NEOPRENE GASKETS $13.41 no bid $23.40 $11.40 $13.30
18" DIA, 3/8” x 7” NEOPRENE GASKETS $16.00 no bid $28.00 $13.32 $15.80
24" DIA, 3/8” x 77 NEOPRENE GASKETS $21.37 no bid $37.25 $17.12 $21.15
36" DIA, 3/8” x 7”7 NEOPRENE GASKETS $38.92 no bid $67.85 $24.92 $30.85
48" DIA, 3/87x 12” NEOPRENE GASKETS $51.90 no bid $90.35 $32.66 $67.40
$141.60 $0.00 $246.85 $99.42 $148.50
REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE, ASTM DESIGNATION C76, CLASS lIII.
15" DIA, no bid $13.28 $16.10 no bid no bid
18" DIA, no bid $18.76 $19.55 no bid no bid
24" DIA, no bid $28.48 $27.85 no bid no bid
36" DIA, no bid $56.52 $54.65 no bid no bid
48" DIA, no bid $89.20 $82.10 no bid no bid
$0.00 $206.24 $200.25 $0.00 $0.00
REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE, HORIZONTAL ELLIPTICAL ASTM DESIGNATION C507, CLASS IlI.
122X 187, no bid $22.36 $29.95 no bid no bid
14> X 23>, no bid $26.62 $32.65 no bid no bid
19” X 307, no bid $43.80 $34.90 no bid no bid
297 X 457, no bid $88.20 $117.15 no bid no bid
38” X 607, no bid $141.20 $195.00 no bid no bid
$0.00 $322.18 $409.65 $0.00 $0.00
REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE, HORIZONTAL ELLIPTICAL ASTM DESIGNATION C507, CLASS Il MITERED END SECTIONS 4:1 SLOPE
15X 187, no bid $300.00 $158.30 no bid no bid
147X 23>, no bid $340.00 $185.70 no bid no bid
19” X 307, no bid $440.00 $242.85 no bid no bid
29” X 457, no bid $1,600.00 $999.50 no bid no bid
38” X 607, no bid $2,400.00 $1,494.00 no bid no bid
$0.00 $5,080.00 $3,080.35 $0.00 $0.00
REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE, ASTM DESIGNATION C76, CLASS Ill. MITERED END SECTIONS 4:1 SLOPE.
15" DIA, no bid $237.60 $271.40 no bid no bid
18" DIA, no bid $289.60 $291.60 no bid no bid
24" DIA, no bid $381.60 $308.30 no bid no bid
36" DIA, no bid $1,296.80 $2,048.20 no bid no bid
48" DIA, no bid $2,006.40 $3,136.00 no bid no bid
Sub TOTAL $0.00 $4,212.00 $6,055.50 $0.00 $0.00
HIGH PERFORMANCE STORM DUAL WALL POLYPROPYLENE (PP) PIPE, AASHTO DESIGNATION M330 & ASTM F2881
15” DIA, no bid no bid $9.71 no bid no bid
18” DIA, no bid no bid $12.81 no bid no bid
34” DIA, no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
36” DIA, no bid no bid $36.81 no bid no bid
48” DIA, no bid no bid $61.96 no bid no bid
SUB Total $0.00 $0.00 $121.29 $0.00 $0.00
HIGH PERFORMANCE STORM DUAL WALL POLYPROPYLENE (PP) PIPE, AASHTO DESIGNATION M330 & ASTM F2881 — MITERED END SECTIONS 4:1 SLOPE
15” DIA, no bid no bid $270.50 no bid no bid
18” DIA, no bid no bid $405.70 no bid no bid
34” DIA, no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
36” DIA, no bid no bid $842.00 no bid no bid
48” DIA, no bid no bid $1,547.00 no bid no bid
Sub TOTAL $0.00 $0.00 $3,065.20 $0.00 $0.00

KEY: Awarded by Section Type (subtotal)
Awarded Prime

Award Secondary




