
Alachua County FY19/20 

Schedule of Fees and 

Charges for Services 

Prepared by: Office of Management and Budget 

Exhibit A



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 1 Effective 10/22/2019 

Table of Contents 
Countywide Services ...................................................................................................................2 

County Manager’s Office ............................................................................................................5  

Animal Services ..........................................................................................................................6 

Court Services .............................................................................................................................9 

Environmental Protection .......................................................................................................... 11 

Disposal and Supply Costs for Conditional Exempt Small Quantity Generator (CESQG) 

Business of Hazardous Wastes: ............................................................................................. 11 

Environmental Review Application Fee: ............................................................................... 13 

Hazardous Materials and Water Quality Programs ................................................................. 13 

Fire: Plan Review and Inspections ............................................................................................. 16 

Fire: Emergency Medical Services ............................................................................................ 19 

Growth Management ................................................................................................................. 25 

Development Review: ........................................................................................................... 25 

Planning and Land Use Fees .................................................................................................. 26 

Building Permitting and Codes Enforcement: ........................................................................ 29 

Tobacco 21 Licensing Fee: .................................................................................................... 33 

Information Services ................................................................................................................. 34 

Organizational Development & Training ................................................................................... 35 

Parks & Conservation Lands ..................................................................................................... 36 

Fairgrounds Facilities Rental (adjacent to the Gainesville airport): ........................................ 36 

Alachua County Agricultural & Equestrian Center Facilities Rental: ..................................... 36 

Freedom Community Center Rental: ..................................................................................... 38 

Poe Springs Park: .................................................................................................................. 38 

Public Works: Development Review & Signs............................................................................ 40 

Fleet Management Fees: ........................................................................................................ 42 

Santa Fe Hills Water System ................................................................................................. 44 

Solid Waste and Resource Recovery ......................................................................................... 45 

Sheriff ....................................................................................................................................... 48 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 2 Effective 10/22/2019 

Countywide Services 

Proprietary Fee: 

 Proprietary fees are based on market value. 

Collection Fee: 

 This is a supplemental fee assessed to accounts placed with a collection agency. The fee 

will be the current contracted collection agency percentage fee of the balance due at the 

time the account is transferred to the collection agency. The collection fee will be 

removed if the account is removed from placement with the collection agency.  

o The fee is the amount charged by the collection agency. 

Computer Replacement: 

 The annual rental rate may be charged to the department at cost. Also, the following 

formula may be applied: 

𝐴𝑛𝑛𝑢𝑎𝑙 𝑅𝑒𝑛𝑡𝑎𝑙 𝑅𝑎𝑡𝑒 =
𝐶𝑜𝑠𝑡 𝑜𝑓 𝐶𝑜𝑚𝑝𝑢𝑡𝑒𝑟 𝐸𝑞𝑢𝑖𝑝𝑚𝑒𝑛𝑡

𝐿𝑖𝑓𝑒 𝐸𝑥𝑝𝑒𝑐𝑡𝑎𝑛𝑐𝑦 𝑖𝑛 𝑌𝑒𝑎𝑟𝑠
  

Conduit Debt: 

 Conduit Debt Review Fee - The review fee is five (5) basis points on the total par amount 

of the bond(s).  

o The minimum fee is $10,000 and the maximum fee is $25,000. 

 Bank Eligible Obligation Issuance Fee - At the beginning of each calendar year, the 

County's Finance Officer or designee shall calculate, based on then-current market rates 

and assuming a $10 million issue of bonds maturing in 10 years. The fee is based on: 

o The difference between interest rates on bank eligible obligations and non-bank 

eligible obligations of the County (the "differential"), AND 

o The net present value (NPV) amount determined by applying said differential 

over a 10 year amortization period. The Bank Eligible Obligation Issuance Fee is 

equal to the NPV differential calculated above. 

Development Review Application Fees: 

 The County Manager may waive development review application fees and charges to not-

for-profit corporations that submit affordable housing projects (See the Alachua County 

Land Development Code for the definition of affordable housing). 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 3 Effective 10/22/2019 

Document/Copying Fees: 

Activities Fee 

 Documents copied by private vendor Sold at per copy cost for 

printing 

 Staff Zoning Reports  $1.00/report 

 Documents Copied onto Media (i.e. Audio or Video 

Cassettes, Compact Disc or Diskettes) 

Cost of media (+) hourly 

rate on employee copying 

files * time required 

 Plain Color Copies:  

o Single Sided $0.15/page single sided 

o Double Sided $0.20/page double sided 

 Color Prints/Copies:  

o Tabloid Size $0.60/side 

o Legal Size $0.40/side 

o Letter Size $0.30/side 

 Plots:  

o Plots with queries $35.00/hour 

o Plots not requiring queries $25.00/plot 

 Wide Format Copies:  

o 24x36 inches $1.00 

o 30x42 inches $1.50 

o >30x42 inches $1.50 + $0.10/linear ft 

 Certified Copies:  

o Preparation of a certified copy of any public 

record 

Additional $1.00/copy 

Note: If total amount for copies is less than $1.00, there will be no charge. 

Activities Fee 

 Special Service Charges as authorized by section 

119.07(1)(b), Florida Statutes, when the nature or 

volume of public records requested to be inspected, 

examined or copied requires extensive use of information 

technology resources or extensive clerical or supervisory 

assistance by County personnel, including the 

requirement to safeguard records during their inspection 

Hourly rate of employee(s) 

providing service 

 Extensive means that the request will take more than 30 

minutes to locate the records, review for confidential 

information and copy, or to observe the inspection of 

records to safeguard them from loss or destruction. 

 

 Copying blueprints Approx.  $4.50 / print 

depending on the outside 

vendor cost 

 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 4 Effective 10/22/2019 

Dishonored Checks: 

 For checks dishonored by the bank, there will be a bank fee (Bank Fee Schedule) and a 

service charge in accordance with the amounts allowed under Florida Statutes at the time 

the check is dishonored. Chapter 68.065 (Actions to Collect Worthless Checks), Chapter 

125.0105 (Service Fee for Dishonored Checks), Chapter 832.07 (Prima Facie Evidence of 

Intent) and Chapter 832.08 (State Attorney Bad Check Diversion Program) all pertain to 

fees on dishonored checks. The amounts as of July 1, 2013 are: 

o $25.00 if the face value of the check does not exceed $50.00, 

o $30.00 if the face value exceeds $50.00 but does not exceed $300.00, 

o $40.00 if the face value exceeds $300.00,  

o or up to 5% of the face amount of the check, whichever is greater. 

 

Vehicle Replacement: 

𝐴𝑛𝑛𝑢𝑎𝑙 𝑅𝑒𝑛𝑡𝑎𝑙 𝑅𝑎𝑡𝑒 = 

 
(𝐶𝑜𝑠𝑡 𝑜𝑓 𝑉𝑒ℎ𝑖𝑐𝑙𝑒 ∗ 10% 𝐼𝑛𝑓𝑙𝑎𝑡𝑖𝑜𝑛𝑎𝑟𝑦 𝐹𝑎𝑐𝑡𝑜𝑟) + 𝐶𝑜𝑠𝑡 𝑜𝑓 𝑉𝑒ℎ𝑖𝑐𝑙𝑒 (𝑖𝑛𝑐𝑙𝑢𝑑𝑖𝑛𝑔 𝑓𝑖𝑛𝑎𝑛𝑐𝑒 𝑐ℎ𝑎𝑟𝑔𝑒𝑠)

𝐿𝑖𝑓𝑒 𝐸𝑥𝑝𝑒𝑐𝑡𝑎𝑛𝑦 𝑖𝑛 𝑌𝑒𝑎𝑟𝑠
 

 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 5 Effective 10/22/2019 

County Manager’s Office 

Rental Rates: 

Activities  Fee 

 Grace Knight Conference Room: Monday–Friday, 8:30AM–

5:00PM 

 

o Hourly Rental Rate (2 hour minimum) $12.00/hour 

 Jack Durrance Commission Chambers: Monday–Friday, 8:30AM-

5:00PM 

 

o Hourly Rental Rate (2 hour minimum) $27.50/hour 

 Josiah T. Walls Conference Room:  

o Hourly Rental Rate (2 hour minimum) $69.50/hour 

 Josiah T. Walls Building Parking Lot  

o Hourly Rental Rate (2 hour minimum) $100.00/hour 

 

To reserve a space with the County Manager’s Office, please call (352) 374-5204 or stop by 

12 SE 1st Street, Gainesville anytime Monday – Friday from 8:30 AM – 5:00 PM 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 6 Effective 10/22/2019 

Animal Services 

Adoption Fees: 

Activities Fees 

 Bird (large – Cockatiel, Parrot, etc.) $10.00 

 Bird (small – Parakeet, Finch, etc.) $5.00 

 Cat (includes intake vaccinations, parasite treatment, FeLV/FIV testing, 

veterinary exam, sterilization, rabies vaccination (>4 mos), microchip, 

and County license/tag) 

$20.00 

 Dog (includes intake vaccinations, parasite treatment, heartworm 

testing, veterinary exam, sterilization, rabies vaccination (>4 mos), 

microchip, and County license/tag) 

$40.00 

 Ferret (includes parasite treatment, veterinary exam, sterilization, rabies 

vaccination (>4 mos), microchip, and County license/tag) 

$10.00 

 Livestock (small – Goat, Pig, etc.) $10.00 

 Reptiles (snake, iguana, etc.) $10.00 

 Pocket Pets (Rabbit, Guinea Pig, Hamster, etc.) $5.00 

 

NOTE: Adoption fees may be decreased or waived by the Animal Services Director during 

special promotions to promote efficient shelter operations, and/or to optimize animal life-saving. 

Reclaim Fees: (Total of all applicable fees listed below) 

Activities Fees 

 Intake vaccinations (mandatory) $10.00 

 Parasite Treatment (mandatory) $10.00 

 Microchip (mandatory if deficient) $10.00 

 Rabies vaccination & county license/tag:  

o Sterilized (mandatory if deficient) $20.00 

o Unsterilized (mandatory if deficient) $50.00 

 Boarding (mandatory for each day after initial day of impoundment) $10.00/day 

 Bite Quarantine (mandatory for each day of impoundment) $15.00/day 

 Emergency medical/veterinary expenses Cost 

incurred 

License Fees: 

Activities Fees 

 Sterilized & microchipped cat, dog, or ferret $10.00/year 

 Unsterilized and/or un-microchipped cat, dog, or ferret $40.00/year 

 Microchip $10.00 

 Rabies Vaccination (Tuesday – Friday, 2 – 5 PM) $10.00 

 Replacement Tag $5.00 

 Discount for licenses/tags sold to veterinarians ($2.00) each 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 7 Effective 10/22/2019 

Miscellaneous Fees: 

Activities Fees 

 Disposal $10.00 

 Euthanasia (owner requested) $30.00 

 Aggressive Dog  

o Initial Registration $400.00 

o Annual Registration $50.00 

 Dangerous Dog  

o Initial Registration $400.00 

o Annual Registration $50.00 

 Irresponsible Pet Owner  

o Initial Registration $400.00 

o Annual Registration $50.00 

 Transportation (Pick-up and/or Delivery) $40.00 

 Trap Rental (live animal)  

o First Week $20.00 

o Additional Weeks $10.00/week 

Surrender Fees: 

Activities Fees 

 Alachua County Resident (or animal found in Alachua County) No charge 

 Out of County Resident – Stray Not Accepted 

 Out of County Resident – Owned Cat or Dog $50.00/animal 

or litter 

Transfer Fees: 

Activities Fees 

 Pre-sterilized (includes intake vaccinations, parasite treatment, testing 

(to the extent possible), rabies vaccination (> 4 mos), and microchip) 

No Charge 

 Sterilized (includes intake vaccinations, parasite treatment, testing, 

veterinary exam, sterilization, rabies vaccination (> 4 mos), microchip, 

and county license/tag) 

Applicable 

Adoption 

Fee for 

Species 

 Any animal on the euthanasia list No Charge 

Diagnostic Tests and/or Procedures: 

Activities Fees 

 Physical Exam (veterinary) $20.00 

 Heartworm testing $10.00 

 Canine Parvovirus testing $10.00 

 Fecal Flotation $10.00 

 FeLV/FIV testing $10.00 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 8 Effective 10/22/2019 

Activities Fees 

 Sutures $10.00 

 Cat Sterilization $75.00 

 Dog Sterilization $95.00 

 Antibiotic and/or pain medications $10.00/each 

 Emergency medical/veterinary expenses Cost incurred 

 Necropsy (forensic) Cost incurred 

 Diagnostic Imaging Cost Incurred 

 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 9 Effective 10/22/2019 

Court Services 

Community Services: 

Activities Fees 

 Program Services Fee – Orientation (one-time fee) $10.00 

 Cost of Supervision – Level 1 (one-time fee) $40.00 

Day Reporting Program: 

Activities Fees 

 Assessment Fee – Individuals required to attend Batterer’s 

Intervention (domestic battery intervention) must have a professional 

assessment completed 

$40.00 

 Indigent participants may perform community service hours in lieu of 

cash payment of all fees at the rate of $10.00 per hour. Program 

Services Fee may include but are not limited to: Batterer’s 

Intervention Program (domestic battery), Life Skills Groups, 

Substance Abuse Prevention/Intervention and Drug and Alcohol 

Testing 

$20.00/week 

 Transdermal Alcohol Device (TAD) $5.00/day 

 Curfew Monitoring $2.00/day 

Drug Court: 

Activities Fees 

 Program Fee In-County – includes supervision, drug and alcohol 

testing, Psychosocial Evaluation, Case Management, and Individual 

and Group Counselling 

$20.00/week 

Metamorphosis: 

Activities Fees 

 Upon entering the working phase of the program 50% of their net income 

Pretrial: 

Activities Fees 

 Electric Monitoring (EM)/Global Positioning System $5.00/day 

 Transdermal Alcohol Device (TAD) $5.00/day 

 Curfew Monitoring $2.00/day 

 Case Management - (MONITORCONNECT) $5.00/month 

 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 10 Effective 10/22/2019 

Probation: 

Activities Fees 

 Cost of supervision – Level II 

o This fee is not automatically assessed and is ordered by 

sentencing Judge as a condition of probation and actual fee 

assed may vary. Indigent probationers may perform 

community service in lieu of cash payments, at an equivalency 

rate of $10.00 for 1 hour of community service 

$50.00/month 

 Curfew Monitoring $2.00/day 

 Case Management - (MONITORCONNECT) $5.00/month 

 Electric Monitoring (EM)/Global Positioning System $5.00/day 

 Transdermal Alcohol Device (TAD) $5.00/day 

Work Release: 

Activities Fees 

 Work Release Inmates 50% of gross pay less taxes 

 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 11 Effective 10/22/2019 

Environmental Protection 

Disposal and Supply Costs for Conditional Exempt Small Quantity Generator 

(CESQG) Business of Hazardous Wastes: 

Note: These fees are the hazardous waste disposal costs for Conditionally Exempt Small Quantity 

Generator (CESQG) businesses and counties with an interlocal agreement with Alachua County. 

The Hazardous Waste Collection Center will accept CESQG waste during normal operational 

hours. The fees are to cover disposal costs, labor and supplies for the proper disposal of hazardous 

wastes generated by CESQG businesses in Alachua County and the HHW counties with an 

interlocal agreement. 

Lot A - Bulk Packs: 

Waste Fees 

 Alkyd Paint $3.70/gal 

 Antifreeze $1.85/gal 

 Corrosive liquids, acids $3.20/gal 

 Corrosive liquids, alkaline $3.10/gal 

 Flammable, combustible liquids $3.70/gal 

 Flammable, liquids (halogenated) $3.85/gal 

 Formalin Solution $13.00/gal 

 Non-hazardous liquids, NON-RCRA $1.95/gal 

 Latex Paint $1.95/gal 

 Pesticides, liquids $13.00/gal 

 Pesticides, solids $3.00/lb 

 Photographic solutions $4.50/gal 

 Sludges, non-hazardous $1.95/gal 

 Sludges, hazardous $13.60/gal 

 Solids, hazardous $1.30/gal 

 Solids, hazardous-55 gallon drum $220.00/drum 

 Solids, hazardous-Cubic yard box $770.00/CYB 

 Wastewaters, non-hazardous $1.95/gal 

 Wastewaters, hazardous $4.50/gal 

 Waste Gasoline $1.05/gal 

 Waste Glycerin $3.85/gal 

 Used oil or other lubricants $1.25/gal 

Lot B – Loose Packs: 

Waste Fees 

 20 lb propane tank $2.90/unit 

 5 gallon pail of oil filters $3.90/unit 

 55 gallon drum of oil filters $22.60/drum 

 55 gallon drum of oil $41.75/drum 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 12 Effective 10/22/2019 

Waste Fees 

 Aerosol cans $1.15/lb 

 Alkyd Paint $7.80/gal or $0.78/lb 

 Batteries, Lithium/mixed button $5.29/lb 

 Batteries, Ni-Cad, wet or dry cell $1.10/lb 

 Capacitors $0.30/lb 

 Computer Monitors, LCD/LED Televisions $0.55/lb 

 Crushed Fluorescent Lamps $200.00/drum 

 Fluorescent lamps Irregular shape (circular) $0.40/unit 

 Fluorescent lamps Compact $0.40/unit 

 Fluorescent lamps less than 4 ft $0.40/unit 

 Fluorescent lamps more than 4 ft $0.40/unit 

 HID, Metal Halide, Mercury Vapor Lamp $1.00/unit 

 Non PCB Ballasts $1.00/unit 

 PCB Ballasts $7.50/unit 

 Products in containers liquids/solids, Hazardous $5.45/gal 

 Products in containers liquids/solids, Non-Hazardous $1.95/gal 

 Rags/Pads, non-hazardous $49.50/drum 

 CRT Televisions, all sizes $0.25/lb 

Lot C – Lab Packs: 

Waste Fees 

 Corrosive liquids, acid or alkaline, toxic $4.90/gal 

 Corrosive liquids, oxidizing $30.00/gal 

 Corrosive solids $0.49/lb 

 Corrosive solids, acid or alkaline, toxic $0.49/lb 

 Cyanides, liquid or solid $53.24/gal or  $5.32/lb 

 Flammable liquids $4.50/gal 

 Flammable solids $1.20/lb 

 Isocyanates, liquid or solid $53.24/gal 

 Mercury debris $1.10/lb 

 Mercury in manufactured containers $4.45/lb 

 Mercury salts $3.90/lb 

 Mercury, elemental $4.45/lb 

 Oxidizers, liquid or solid, toxic $2.95/lb 

 Oxidizing liquids $29.50/lb 

 Oxidizing solids $2.95/lb 

 PCB’s $0.61/lb or $6.10/gal 

 Peroxides, inorganic $29.50/gal 

 Peroxides, organic $25.56/gal 

 Poison liquids $18.81/gal 

 Poison solids $0.85/lb 

 Reactive $5.85/lb 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 13 Effective 10/22/2019 

Lot D – Supplies: 

Waste Fees 

 10’ x 20’ tent rental (including set up and take down) $150.00/day 

 1A2 55 gallon drum $26.35/unit 

 1H2 5 gallon pail $5.50/unit 

 100% Post-consumer Recycled Paint for Purchase $2.00/gal or 

$10.00/5 gal 

pail 

 Disposal of 55 gal drum $10.20/unit 

 Metals analysis for hazardous waste testing $150.00/sample 

 Vermiculite (4 cubic foot bag) $12.20/unit 

Environmental Review Application Fee: 

NOTE: Fees shall double if the activity under review was started or conducted prior to receipt of 

all necessary approvals. 

Activities Fees 

 Review/renewal of Environmental Monitoring Plans $3,700.00 

 Review of Environmental Monitoring Submissions – annual charge $800.00 

 Review/renewal of Environmental Monitoring Plans – minor category 

(determination of “minor” made at the time of application) 

$260.00 

 Review of Environmental Monitoring Submission – minor category – 

annual charge 

$255.00 

Hazardous Materials and Water Quality Programs 

Investigation, Cleanup, and Discharge Response Fees: 

NOTE: Reimbursable costs incurred by Alachua County associated with the response and/or 

cleanup of a hazardous material discharge or investigation of a Water Quality Code (Alachua 

County Land Development Code, Chapter 77) violation shall be charged and billed to the 

responsible party (or their insurance carrier) and shall include, but not be limited to: cost of 

cleanup oversight and site rehabilitation report review; cost of equipment operation and 

maintenance; personnel cost of contracted services; waste transportation and disposal costs; cost 

of materials; laboratory costs; and County's labor costs. County labor costs associated with a 

non-transportation oriented hazardous materials discharge will not be charged to the parties who 

have paid and are not delinquent in paying registration fees associated with the Hazardous 

Materials Management Code (Alachua County Land Development Code, Chapter 353). 

Activities Fees 

 County Labor Cost $60/hour/person 

for staff time 

 Other Reimbursable Costs To be billed at cost 

 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 14 Effective 10/22/2019 

Hazardous Materials: 

 Facility Class  

o AA $60.00 

o A $120.00 

o B $230.00 

o C $610.00 

o D $750.00 

o Tanks $90.00 

NOTE: This is an annual fee. 

NOTE: The Facility Classes are established by criteria in Alachua County Land Development 

Code, Chapter 353 as follows: type of use, anticipated volumes of hazardous materials to be 

stored, the complexity of hazardous materials storage facilities, and the potential for discharge. 

Fees include cost of applicable Hazardous Materials Storage License. 

Activities Fees 

 Late Fee 1 ½ %  per month 

on unpaid balance 

 Above Ground Storage Tanks $75.00/tank 

 Under Ground Storage Tanks $75.00/tank 

Plan Review Fees: 

Plans Fees 

 Installation & Secondary Containment Plans $75.00 

 Closure Plans $150.00 

 Pollution Prevention Plans $150.00 

 Alternate Procedures Plans $75.00 

Water Quality: 

Activities Fees 

 Wastewater Treatment Plant Inspection – Field Services $1,325.00 annually/plant 

 Late Fee 1.5% per month on the 

balance 

Special Sales: 

 Items that promote water conservation such as rain barrels and other waster saving 

devices are sold at the cost plus sales tax. 

Irrigation Efficiency Code Fees: 

Code Fees 

 Residential Approval Fee $50.00 

 Residential County Inspection Fee $85.00 

 Residential County Re-Inspection Fee $50.00 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 15 Effective 10/22/2019 

Code Fees 

 Non-residential Approval Fee $100.00 

 Non-residential County Inspection Fee $170.00 

 Non-residential County Re-Inspection Fee $100.00 

After the Fact Irrigation System Approval Fee: 

 Approval fee for all irrigation systems (residential and non-residential) that are installed 

or significantly modified prior to obtaining approval is $100.00. 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 16 Effective 10/22/2019 

Fire: Plan Review and Inspections 

Fire Prevention Plan Review and Inspections: 

Periodic Fire & Life Safety Inspections per F.S. 633.025(2), 633.081(1) and F.A.C. 69A-60.007(1) 

Inspections Fees 

 All fire inspections performed annually as required or 

periodically for existing buildings unless otherwise 

referenced in this fee schedule 

$70.00 per inspection 

 Apartment Buildings Multi-Story – not to include individual 

apartments unless requested 

$70.00 per building at 

each site 

 Special Request for Inspections after hours, weekend, or 

holidays 

$100/hour 

 Tents and Membrane Structures $70.00/first tent or 

membrane structure; 

$5.00 each additional 

structure 

 Fireworks – Sales or Storage 

o (Permanent Retail or Wholesale Facility) 

$70.00 per inspection 

 Fireworks Display:  

o Site plan review $50.00 

o Inspection $70.00/hour 

o Standby-minimum 2 hour charge $105.00/hour 

 Special Events/Fire Works Sales – includes site plan review 

and inspection 

$105.00 

 Fire Inspection(s) Generated from Complaint (Fee applies 

only if complaint is validated) 

$70 per inspection 

 Re-Inspection Fees:  

o 2nd Failed Inspection of same inspection type Original Inspection Rate 

o 3rd Failed Inspection 1 ½ * Original 

Inspection Rate 

 

New Construction Fees: Plan Review Fee Inspection Fee 

 Fire Marshal Release – minimum fee permit 

unless otherwise stated 

$50.00 per permit $70.00 per 

inspection 

 New Buildings and Building Alterations $20.00/story + 

$0.02/sq foot 

 

o Pre compliance (concealments, etc.)  $20.00/story + 

$0.04/sq foot 

o Fire Marshal Release  $15.00/story + 

$0.03/sq foot 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 17 Effective 10/22/2019 

New Construction Fees: Plan Review Fee Inspection Fee 

 Fire Sprinkler and Standpipe (new) $50.00/riser + 

$30.00/additional 

story+$0.25/head 

 

o Hydro and Rough Pipe  $75.00/riser + 

$30.00/additional 

story+$0.50/head 

o Final  $50.00/riser + 

$35.00/additional 

story+$0.25/head 

 Fire Sprinkler Alteration: 

o Up to and including 49 heads; 

alterations effecting more than 49 

heads are treated as new installations; 

charges are based on riser and number 

of modified heads only. 

$50.00/riser + 

$0.25/head 

 

o Hydro and Rough Pipe  $75.00/riser + 

$30.00/additional 

story+$0.50/head 

o Final  $50.00/riser + 

$35.00/additional 

story+$0.25/head 

 Underground Fire Main 

o Add fee to fire sprinkler if fire 

sprinkler/standpipe permit includes 

underground fire main 

$50.00  

o Burial Depth, Joints, and Flush  $50.00 + 

$0.50/linear foot 

o Hydro and Final  $75.00 

 Fire Alarm 

o New-Including monitoring only 

systems 

$50.00/panel + 

$0.50/additional 

device 

 

o Rough Wire  $50.00/panel + 

$20.00/additional 

story + 

$0.50/additional 

device 

o Final  $50.00/panel + 

$0.50/additional 

device 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 18 Effective 10/22/2019 

New Construction Fees: Plan Review Fee Inspection Fee 

 Fire Alarm Alterations 

o Value up to $5,000.00; system 

alterations exceeding this amount are 

treated as new install; Fire Alarm 

Alteration charges based on Pane + 

number of modified devices only 

$50.00/panel + 

$0.50/additional 

device 

 

o Rough Wire  $50.00/panel + 

$0.50/additional 

device 

o Final  $50.00/panel + 

$0.50/additional 

device 

 Exhaust Hood (each) $50.00/hood $70.00/system 

 Pre-Engineered Suppression System (each) $30.00 + $3.00 / 

gallon of agent 

$70.00/system 

 Pre-Engineered System Alteration $30.00 + $3.00 / 

gallon of agent 

$70.00/system 

 Fire Pump (each) $75.00/pump $180.00/pump 

 Spray Booth $30.00 + 

$0.50/sq ft 

$45.00 + 

$0.50/sq ft 

 Fuel Tanks (Above Ground and Underground) $45.00 + $15.00/ 

additional tank 

 

o Hydro and Suds Test  $45.00 + $15.00/ 

additional tank 

o Burial Depth and Tie Down  $45.00 + $15.00/ 

additional tank 

o Final  $45.00 

 LP Gas $45.00/tank $45.00/tank 

 Gate  $70.00 

 Knox Box (install and key exchange)  $30.00 

 Alternative Water Supply $60.00 $140.00 

 Re-Review Fees – 3rd Review and Each 

Subsequent Review 

1 ½ * Original 

Review Fee 

 

 Re-Inspection Fees   

o 2nd Failed Inspection of Same 

Inspection Type 

 Original 

Inspection Rate 

o 3rd Failed Inspection  1 ½ * Original 

Inspection Rate 

 Overtime – 2 hour minimum $90.00/hour $90.00/hour 

 Permits Charged by the Hour (regular time) $60.00/hour (one 

hour minimum) 

$60.00/hour (one 

hour minimum) 

 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 19 Effective 10/22/2019 

Fire: Emergency Medical Services 

Emergency Medical Services: 

*See Emergency Medical Services Fee Details; Pages 22-23* 

Medical Services Fees 

 Advanced Life Support (ALS) Transport Fee I $625.00 

 Advanced Life Support (ALS) Transport Fee II $885.00 

 Specialty Care Transport (SCT) $1,170.00 

 Basic Life Support Transport Fee $520.00 

 Team/Equipment/Transport Fee  

o Non-Emergency Response $220.00 

o Emergency Response $520.00 

 ALS Treatment Fee/Non-transport $250.00 

 BLS Treatment Fee/Non-transport $180.00 

 Special Event and Standby  

o ALS Unit (includes 2 personnel) $192.00/hour 

o Additional Staffing (Events Requiring Additional 

Personnel) 

$60.00/hour/person 

Supplemental Charges: 

*See Supplemental Charge Fee Details; Page 24* 

Supplemental Charge Fee 

 Trauma Fee $115.00 

 Extrication Fee $156.00 

 Transport Mileage (total) 1-50 miles $15.00/mile 

51+ miles $10.00/mile 

 Special Handling $85.00 per hour per 

crew member 

 Waiting Time with Patient $143.00 for 1st ¼ hour 

$64.00 per ¼ hour 

thereafter 

 Collection Fee Amount charged by 

collection agency 

Supplemental Charges: Certifications 

Note: These are the fees and charges that will be charged to each participant in the following 

classes. ACFR, GFR, Fire Service Network participants, and member of ACFR’s Reserve 

Program are exempt from class fees, but will be charged for the cost of the cards if there is a fee. 

Certification Fees 

 Basic Life Support (CPR)  

o Certification Card $3.00 each 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 20 Effective 10/22/2019 

Certification Fees 

o Heartsaver $15.00/person + 

$15.00/book 

o BLS for Healthcare Providers $45.00/person + 

$15.00/book 

o BLS for Healthcare Providers Recertification $20.00/person 

o Heartsaver First Aid $30.00/person + 

$15.00/book 

 Advanced Cardiac Life Support (ACLS)  

o Certification Card $5.00 each 

o Nurses and Paramedics $75.00/person + 

$30.00/book 

o Physicians/Others $100.00/person + 

$30.00/book 

o ACLS Recertification $75.00/person 

 International Trauma Life Support (ITLS)  

o BTLS Re-Certification $20.00 each 

o Basic and Advanced $100.00/person 

o BTLS Recertification $75.00/person 

 Emergency Vehicle Operations Course (EVOC) $75.00/person 

o Recertification $50.00/person 

 40 Hour First Responder $50.00/person 

o Recertification $20.00/person 

E911 Map Printing Fees: 

Map Printing Fees 

 Laminated 6’ x 6’ 

o This is the fee that will be charged for the printing of wall 

maps only. Customers often meet with or discuss the 

information they wish displayed and the map is produced 

based on customer needs. There is an approximate 10 

working day time period from the day the map is requested 

until the map is ready for pickup. 

$340.00 

 Bound Street Atlas; Color 

o This is the fee that will be charged for the printing of street 

atlas only. The street atlas may not be customized as they are 

produced in batches of twenty and contain the most recent 

changes to any streets and locations with Alachua County. 

$40.00 

 This is the rate that will be charged for creating and printing each 

map, other than the wall map or street atlas. Each fee includes one 

hour of labor. Additional labor is $18.00 per hour 

 

o Up to 11”x17” $18.00 

o Greater than 11”x17” $25.00 

 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 21 Effective 10/22/2019 

Emergency Management Plan Review: 

Per Florida Rule 9G-20.003, F.S. 252 and Agency for Health Care Administration (AHCA) 

Standard 59A-26.023 

Plan Fees 

 Review of emergency plans for health care, hospital, and/or 

group home type facilities for: 

 

o New Plan Review < 16 beds $25.00/hour + 25% 

Administrative Fee 

o New Plan Review > 16 beds $500 

o Existing Plan Review $25.00/hour + 25% 

Administrative Fee 

(maximum fee $250.00) 

Sharps Disposal Program: 

 This program is a community service designed to assist residents with safe and 

environmentally sound method to dispose of sharps (syringes, needles, and lancets). The 

fee is $3.00/box. 

Unmanned Aerial Systems: 

 Reimbursement rate to be determined based on each request. Service may be exempt 

from fees if public safety purpose is determined. Average cost is approximately 

$125.00/hour; however, varies depending on equipment use, staff requirements, etc. 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 22 Effective 10/22/2019 

Emergency Medical Services Fee Details: 

Advanced Life Support (ALS) Transport Fee I: 

This is the base ALS transport fee that will be charged to each patient that is transported by any 

ground or air ambulance and receives any of the listed procedures. This fee is inclusive of, but 

not limited to, any of the following procedures: 

A. Cardiac Monitor 

B. Vascular access (including catheters, saline locks, administration sets, blood draws, and 

all fluids) 

C. Obstetrical Kits 

D. Medications approved by the Department Medical Director and administered to patients 

including, but not limited to, those medications listed in the Department Medical Care 

Protocols Medication List. 

Advanced Life Support (ALS) Transport Fee II: 

This is the base ALS transport fee that will be charged to each patient that is transported by any 

ground or air ambulance and receives at least three administrations of medication(s) by IV 

push/bolus or continuous infusion and/or the provision of at least one of the following ALS 

procedures. This fee is inclusive of, but not limited to, any of the following procedures: 

A. Cardio-pulmonary resuscitation 

B. Defibrillation/cardioversion 

C. Endotracheal/Nasotracheal intubation 

D. Central venous line 

E. Cardiac pacing 

F. Chest decompression 

G. Surgical airway 

H. Intraosseous line 

I. Medications approved by the Department Medical Director and administered to patients 

including, but not limited to, those medications listed in the Department Medical Care 

Protocols Medication List. 

Specialty Care Transport (SCT): 

This is the base SCT transport fee that will be charged to each critically ill or injured patient that 

is transported by ground ambulance. Transport will include an inter-facility transfer of a patient 

with medical conditions beyond the scope of a Florida certified Paramedic and include medically 

necessary supplies and services. This fee is inclusive of transport provided by a critical care 

certified paramedic and is inclusive of, but not limited to, any of the following procedures: 

A. Management of a respiratory ventilator 

B. Management of intravenous (IV) pumps 

C. Management of central venous line 

 

 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 23 Effective 10/22/2019 

Basic Life Support Transport Fee: 

This is the base transport fee that will be charged to each patient requiring transport where no 

ALS procedures are administered. 

Team/Equipment/Transport Fee: 

This is the base transport fee that will be charged for each transport where a patient is not on 

board (i.e.: medical team(s) and/or medical equipment only). 

ALS Treatment Fee/Non-Transport: 

This is the fee that will be charged to each patient that receives any of the following procedures 

and is not transported via ground or air ambulance: 

A. Vascular access (including catheters, saline locks, administration sets, blood draws, and 

all fluids) 

B. Obstetrical Kits 

C. Medications (see Medication List)* 

BLS Treatment Fee/Non-Transport: 

This is the fee that will be charged to each patient that receives treatment where no ALS 

procedures are administered and is not transported via ground or air ambulance: 

A. Sterile bandaging/dressing 

B. Splinting/immobilization 

C. Oxygen Administration 

D. Irrigation with sterile fluid 

Note: Time is calculated from the time of arrival or the request time of arrival (whichever is 

later) through the unit available time as documented by the EMS report. Only time increments 

greater than 7 minutes will be rounded up to the next quarter hour. 

Note: Schedule of fees will be applied to patients receiving any billable EMS services at special 

events. 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 24 Effective 10/22/2019 

Emergency Medical Services: 
**SUPPLEMENTAL CHARGE FEE DETAILS** 

Trauma Fee: 

This is a supplemental fee to be charged to each trauma patient that requires ALS I, II, or BLS 

intervention, full spinal immobilization that includes cervical immobilization device, pediatric 

immobilization device, collar, backboard, and/or straps. 

Extrication Fee: 

This is a supplemental fee to be charged to each trauma patient that requires mechanical 

extrication (excluding hand tools). 

Transport Mileage: Minimum of one mile 

Charge will begin when transporting patient(s) or specialized teams. Mileage charges will be 

equally divided between patients when multiple patients are transported from the same incident 

and in the same unit. 

Special Handling: 

This is a supplemental fee to be charged for unruly patients that require restraints, or if two 

Alachua County Fire Rescue units are required for lifting purposes, or if an additional ACFR 

crew member is required during transport. Only time increments greater than 7 minutes will be 

rounded up to the next quarter hour. 

Waiting Time with Patient: 

This is a supplemental fee to be charged when there is a delay in transferring the patient from the 

care of Alachua County Fire Rescue to the care of the receiving authority. A minimum of fifteen 

(15) minutes waiting time must accrue before charging for the first 1/4 hour period. Thereafter, 

the quarter hour charge applies for time increments greater than 7 minutes, rounded to the next 

1/4 hour. 

Collection Fee: 

This is a supplemental fee assessed to accounts placed with a collection agency. The fee will be 

the current contracted collection agency percentage fee on the amount collected by the collection 

agency. The collection fee will be removed if the account is removed from placement with the 

collection agency.  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 25 Effective 10/22/2019 

Growth Management 

Development Review: Amount Resubmit 

Amount 

Fee / AC 

Over 10* 

 Preliminary Plan $4,000 $970 $40 

 Preliminary Plan over Threshold $5,100 $740 $22 

 Preliminary and Final Development 

Plan (see note 7) 

$3,200 $750 $24 

 Final Plan $5,100 $740 $0 

 Plat Review $1,500 $330 $0 

 Rural Unpaved Subdivision – 

Preliminary Plan and Final Plan 

$1,900 $420 $25 

 Revised Preliminary or Final $2,400 $750 $0 

 Re-Plat $600 $0 $0 

 PD Minor Change $1,100 $0 $0 

 Minor Development Plan $1,600 $0 $0 

 Administrative Plan Review $1,200 $0 $0 

 Ag Ponds over 200 Cubic Yards $1,300 $495 $0 

 Flood Prone Permits and Docks 

over 1,00 square feet 

$1,500 $600 $0 

 Administrative Development Plan 

Approval for Docks 

$600 $0 $0 

 Variance to building setback or 

building height 

$1,300 $0 $0 

 Rural Home Based Business 

Review 

$130 $0 $0 

 Hourly Rate $65 $0 $0 

Note: *Area is computed by rounding up to the nearest full acre. 

1. Fees shall cover expenses of review conducted during the one-year period commencing 

on the date the fee is paid; if plans are submitted for the same project more than one year 

from the date, a new fee shall be required. 

2. A new fee shall be required if a significant change in the scope of the project is made. 

3. Development review fees shall be doubled when on-site work has started prior to final 

approval by the Development Review Committee.   

4. The base fee includes the initial application, one insufficiency report and resubmittal. If 

any additional insufficiency reports are required, the resubmittal fee shall be collected 

with the second resubmittal. 

5. Preliminary plans that are over the threshold are defined in the Unified Land 

Development Code, Section 402.44 

6. Fees are allocated to Growth Management, EPD, Public Safety and Public Works. 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 26 Effective 10/22/2019 

7. After a pre-application review meeting, an application for a combined Preliminary and 

Final Development Plan must first be authorized by Growth Management Director or 

designee. 

8. Staff administrative review, such as for submittals such as minor adjustments for 

approved plans, shall be charged at the hourly rate. 

9. Properties located within the Northeastern and Southeastern Urban Cluster as shown on 

the Alachua County Future Land Use Map shall have application fees for land use, 

zoning, or development review reduced 50 percent. 

Planning and Land Use Fees Amount Fee / AC 

Over 10* 

 Rezoning to “A” to “C-1” District for a single family lot $2,000 $14 

 Rezoning, Special Use Permit, or Special Exception $5,900 $21 

 Special Use Permit for Mining or Excavation and Fill $8,800 **** 

 Special Use Permit and Preliminary Development Plan 

Review  

$7,100 $34 

 Planned Development $7,200 $25 

 Planned Development and Preliminary Development Plan 

Review  

$7,800 $34 

 Major Amendment (PD, SUP, or SE) $4,800 **** 

 Minor Amendment (PD, SUP, or SE) or Temporary Use 

Permit 

$1,900 **** 

 Large Scale Comprehensive Plan Amendment $8,500 $30 

 Small Scale Comprehensive Plan Amendment $7,100 **** 

 Large Scale Comprehensive Plan Amendment & Rezoning $9,000 $30 

 Small Scale Comprehensive Plan Amendment & Rezoning $7,600 **** 

 ULDC Amendment $2,000 

base plus 

hourly 

**** 

 Water Sewer Determination $1,200 **** 

 Property Owner Notification (per 50 letters) $40 **** 

 Hourly Rate (where applicable) $65 **** 

 Proportionate Share Determination Hourly **** 

 Vested Rights Fee Hourly **** 

 Development of Regional Impact (DRI) Review Initial Deposit of $7,500 

 Sector Plans Initial Deposit of $7,500 

 Substantial Deviation Determinations $600.00 

 Review of projects determined to be substantial deviations 

or other amendments to development order 

Initial Deposit of $2,500 

 DRI Annual Report Review Fee $250.00 

 Public Facilities Annual Report Review Fee for DRI 

establishing Special District under Chapter 189, Florida 

Statutes 

$250.00 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 27 Effective 10/22/2019 

Planning and Land Use Fees Amount Fee / AC 

Over 10* 

 Community Development District (CDD) Annual Budget 

Review Fee (for CDD established pursuant to Chapter 190, 

Florida Statutes and associated with a DR 

$500.00 

 Community Development District Review Fee $5,000.00 

Note: *Area is computed by rounding up to the nearest full acre. 

1. In addition to the staff review fee, Tier II and Tier III applications shall be charged 

consultant fees to evaluate RF engineering and prepare Visual Impact Simulations as 

directed by staff. 

2. Comprehensive Plan Amendment: Where an applicant submits a proposal for territory 

other than under his/her direct control, only that area under his/her direct control shall be 

included for the purposes of calculating the fee. Small scale amendments are applications 

which conform to Section 163.3187(1)(c), Florida Statutes. No acreage fee shall be 

assessed for large-scale map amendment applications which request redefinition to the 

Rural/Agriculture land use classification. 

3. Fees are allocated to Growth Management, EPD, Fire and Public Works. 

4. Properties located within the Northeastern and Southeastern Urban Cluster as shown on 

the future Land Use Map shall have application fees for land use, zoning, or development 

review reduced 50 percent. 

5. Requests for Preservation Land use or zoning district designations shall be assessed a fee 

for advertising only, to be determined at the time of the application submittal.  

Planning and Development Fee Policies: 

1. No rezoning or plan amendment request shall be accepted for processing until the 

required application fee, or reduced fee as established by Fee Policy number five, is paid. 

An application fee may be refunded only if the application is withdrawn prior to the 

County incurring direct costs in processing the application (i.e. copying and distributing 

copies to staff, advertising, postage, printing reports, etc.). 

2. In the event that readvertisement of an application due to any delay or postponement 

requested by the applicant, or necessitated by some act or failure to act on the part of the 

applicant, a supplemental fee of $250.00 plus postage costs per advertisement will be 

charged for a Zoning Application and a supplemental fee of $560 per advertisement for a 

Comprehensive Plan Amendment or Zoning Ordinance Amendment Request. This 

supplemental fee is intended to cover additional costs for readvertisement. No additional 

fee shall be charged if the postponement is requested by the County. 

3. In the event the Zoning Administrator determines that the specific purpose of an 

application is to correct an existing situation which has been determined to be, or is 

alleged to be, a violation of a County zoning ordinance provision or regulation, a 

supplemental fee equal to the scheduled application fee shall be charged. This policy 

shall apply whether or not an actual notice of violation has been issued by the 

Department of Growth Management, Office of Codes Enforcement. This supplemental 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 28 Effective 10/22/2019 

fee is intended to cover the additional administrative costs and expenses associated with 

the investigation of the existing situation and the determination of any corrective action 

required. 

4. A separate fee shall be charged for each action requested unless the Director of Growth 

Management determines that the requested action is related to another requested action 

by the applicant and that the request will require no additional staff time (see Fee Policy 

number 5). 

5. The Director of Growth Management may reduce a required application fee where they 

find: (1) that special circumstances, not under the control of the applicant, justify a 

reduction in the fee; and (2) that the actual direct cost to the County for processing the 

application will not exceed the actual fee collected. In no case may a reduced fee be less 

than advertising cost. No request for reduction in the fee shall be considered unless the 

request is received within five working days following the date of the application 

submitted to the Department of Growth Management, Office of Planning and 

Development. 

6. Development of Regional Impact (DRI) Review deposit will be paid at submission of 

Application for Development Approval. Sector Plan deposit will be paid with the 

submittal of the application for a Long Term Master Plan. Substantial deviation or other 

amendments to development order review deposit will be paid upon notification that 

substantial deviation exists or other amendments to development order is required. 

7. All work performed by Alachua county employees, directly and reasonably attributable to 

review of and recommendations relating to a Development of Regional Impact 

application, Sector Plan, or amendment to a Development Order shall be paid by the 

applicant. Fees will be based upon the hourly rate of pay and benefits of each employee 

performing the work multiplied by the number of hours worked, plus 20% indirect cost 

based on the hourly rate of the employee. Any other additional direct costs incurred by 

the County in connection with the review and processing of a DRI or Sector Plan 

application, including but not limited to advertising, public notice, duplication of 

materials, telecommunications, and fees for any outside consultants hired by the County 

when special expertise beyond County staff is deemed necessary, shall be paid by the 

applicant. 

8. The applicant for DRIs, Substantial Deviations to DRIs and Sector Plans will be required 

to pay an additional deposit, as may be required from time to time, when the review 

expenses have exhausted 75% of any paid deposit. Whenever an additional deposit of 

fees is required, such deposit shall be, at a minimum, in the amount of 50% of the initial 

payment set forth herein. Any auditor fees for the establishment and maintenance of this 

account shall be charged to the applicant. 

9. Upon conclusion of any staff review of any DRI or sector plan application and other 

actions required for presentation to the Board of County Commissioners for final action, 

all fees calculated by Alachua County to be due shall be paid in full by the applicant prior 

to submission to the Board of County Commissioners for final Board action. All refunds 

of excess deposit money, after all charges are paid, shall be refunded after final action by 

the Board of County Commissioners. 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 29 Effective 10/22/2019 

10. Community Development District: The $5,000 review fee is for the CDDs of less than 

1,000 acres. The review fee for CDDs of more than 1,000 acres is set by State Statute. 

For all CDDs, advertising and the advertising fee is the responsibility of the Petitioner 

and must be consistent with State Statute requirements. 

Building Permitting and Codes Enforcement: 

Note: All Building Permit Fees are calculated starting with the minimum base permit fee by 

permit type plus a fee determined by the Dollar Value of Construction as calculated below: 

Minimum Base Building Permit Fees: 

 Minimum Base Permit Fee for single family, single family attached, and two family new 

construction; residential additions and alterations; and all other building permits (i.e. re-

roof, mechanical, plumbing, aluminum, accessory buildings, fire sprinkler, fire alarm, 

tents, miscellaneous, etc.) is $90.00 

 Minimum Base Permit fee for multi-family, office, commercial, industrial or any 

construction requiring review and/or inspection by the Fire Marshal and for commercial 

additions and alterations is $180.00 

Dollar Value of Construction Fee Calculations: 

 The permit fee for all new construction and additions shall be calculated based on the 

Building Valuation Data (BVD) table published in the ICC Building Safety Journal or the 

stated contract price, whichever is greater. The BVD table is published in February and 

August each year. 

www.iccsafe.org/codes-tech-support/codes/code-development-process/building-

valuation-data/ 

 Based on the resulting building valuation or contract price, the permit fee is as follows: 

 

Dollar Value of Construction from – to:  

o $0 - $100,000 Add $3.25/thousand 

o $100,001 - $1,000,000 Add $1.75/thousand 

o $1,000,001 – and up Add $0.90/thousand 

Notes: Any person who commences any work on a building, structure, electrical, gas, 

mechanical or plumbing system before obtaining the building official's approval or the necessary 

permits shall be subject to a penalty of 100 percent of the usual fee in addition to the required 

permit fees (Section 109.4 Florida Building Code - Section 553.73 Florida Statutes). This 

includes moving on a mobile home prior to obtaining a permit. All permits must be posted on the 

job site during all progress of the work.  SPACE ABOVE - Somewhere? 

Properties with a homestead exemption and with a Total Just Value of less than $50,000 as 

determined by the Alachua County Property Appraiser within the last year shall have building 

permit fees reduced 50 percent. 

http://www.iccsafe.org/codes-tech-support/codes/code-development-process/building-valuation-data/
http://www.iccsafe.org/codes-tech-support/codes/code-development-process/building-valuation-data/


Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 30 Effective 10/22/2019 

Building permit applicants electing to use a private provider for building permit plan review shall 

be charged at 50% of the normal plan review fee. Applicants electing to use a private provider 

for building inspections shall be charged at 50% of the normal building permit fee. Applicants 

using a private provider for both plan review and inspections are eligible for the 50% reduction 

on both the plan review fee and the permit fee. 

5% credit to all future collections until appropriate reduced levels of revenues is achieved 

Refund, Extension, and Expiration Policy: 

 Building Permit (Applicant Requested) refunds where project is not started will be 

charged a processing fee is $70.00 

 Extensions of Building Permits approved by the Building Official for permits that have 

not expired is $70.00 

Note: No refunds shall be issued on expired permits. Expired building permits that have not 

received a final inspection or certificate of occupancy as required by the Florida Building Code 

shall be required to obtain a new building permit at full cost. 

Plan Review Examination Fees: 

Plan Review Fees 

 When plan review is required based on requirements of the Florida 

Building Code, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of 

submitting plans and building permit application. Such plan review 

fee is in addition to the building permit fee and Fire Marshal 

Review Fee. If the building permit application is withdrawn after 

the plans are reviewed the plan review fee is not refundable. 

20% of Building 

Permit Fee 

 Plan Re-stamping or Re-certification Fee $70.00 base plus 

hourly 

 Hourly $65.00 

Note: *Hourly rate calculated by rounding up to the nearest full hour. 

Fire Prevention Plan Review and Inspection Fees: 

 Refer to the Public Safety Department portion of the Fee Schedule for a complete list of 

the fees and charges provided by the Fire Prevention Division of the Public Safety 

Department 

State of Florida Surcharges: 

 Surcharge 

 Florida Building Commission Surcharge - 

Submitted to the Florida  Department of 

Community Affairs 

1.0 percent of all base building permit 

fees; minimum surcharge collection 

$2.00 per Florida Statute 553.721 

 Building Code Administrators and 

Inspectors Fund Surcharge - Submitted to 

the Florida Department of Business and 

Professional Regulation 

1.5 percent of all base building permit 

fees; minimum surcharge collection 

$2.00 per Florida Statute 468.631 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 31 Effective 10/22/2019 

Flat Rate Building Permit Fees: 

Building Permit Fees 

 Manufactured or Mobile Home $155.00 

 Move On Structure $170.00 

 Modular Structure (Per Building Section)4 $240.00 

 Swimming pool (in ground) $290.00 

 Swimming pool (above ground) $155.00 

 Power for New or Replacement Well $155.00 

 Res Mechanical Alt/Repair $85.00 

 Roof: New Residential $165.00 

 Roof: Repair Residential $165.00 

 Roof: New Commercial $200.00 

 Roof: Repair Commercial $200.00 

 Any Demolition $155.00 

Notes: 

1. Permit fees listed above include minimum required inspections. Additional inspection fee 

may apply. 

2. Properties with a homestead exemption and with a Total Just Value of less than $50,000, 

as determined by the Alachua County Property Appraiser within the last year, shall have 

building permit fees reduced 50 percent. 

3. 5% credit to all future collections until appropriate reduced level of revenues is achieved 

4. This applies only to Modular Structures approved by the Florida Department of 

Economic Opportunity. This permit fee includes base permit fee plus on–site inspections; 

temporary pole, foundation, plumbing, and final. 

Inspection and Certification Fees: 

Inspection or Certification Fees 

 Building Inspections (not included in permit) $70.00 

 Building Inspection – Overtime Rate for Special Emergency Requests 

for Inspections after hours, on weekends and holidays (2 hour 

minimum) 

$105.00/hour 

 Re-inspection fee (to be paid prior to requesting next inspection after 

failed inspection). All disapproved inspections shall require a 

mandatory re-inspection fee 

$70.00 

 Certification, Renewal, or Copy of Certificate of Occupancy $70.00 

 Zoning Certification and Review $70.00 

 Curb Cut/Driveway Application Processing and Inspection $26.00 

 Requested building inspections exceeding the standard number of 

inspections paid for in the original building permit will be charged an 

additional inspection fee per inspection 

$70.00 

 Request for Information on code violations and expired permits in 

written format, one parcel with 4 or fewer addresses 

$170.00 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 32 Effective 10/22/2019 

Note: The Standard Number of Building Inspections allowed for a building permit can be 

calculated by taking the Calculated Dollar Value of Construction Fee minus the Minimum Base 

Permit Fee and dividing by $70.00. New Single Family Development will be provided twelve 

(12) standard inspections as required by the Florida Building Code.  

Note: Information request for 5 or more addresses per parcel, each address must pay an 

additional $5 per address. 

Permitting By Fax – Processing Fees: 

Fax Fees 

 Local Fax Call $5.00 

 Long Distance Fax Call $10.00 

Contractor License Fees: 

Note: Licenses require bi-annual renewal. The license fee is doubled if the license is on the 

involuntary inactive list. 

License Fees 

 License Record Management Fee (one-time fee for record 

management of license, insurance, and workers' compensation for 

state certified contractors 

$50.00 

 General Contractor $70.00 

 Building Contractor $70.00 

 Residential Contractor $70.00 

 Plumbing Contractor $70.00 

 Electrical Contractor $70.00 

 Sheet Metal Contractor $70.00 

 Journeyman Electrician $50.00 

 Journeyman Plumber $50.00 

 Inactive License $30.00 

 Roofing Contractor $70.00 

 Commercial Pool Contractor $70.00 

 Residential Pool Contractor $70.00 

 Aluminum Specialty $50.00 

 Swimming Pool/Spa Servicing $70.00 

 Reciprocity Letter $20.00 

Administrative Permit Fees: 

Permit Fees 

 Administrative Temporary Use Permit for outdoor promotional sales, 

special event sales and the sale of seasonal or temporary goods and 

commodities 

$65.00 

 Fireworks Display Permit $65.00 

 Noise Ordinance Waiver or Special Permit $65.00 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 33 Effective 10/22/2019 

Permit Fees 

 Administrative Temporary Use Permit for filming and media 

production 

$65.00 

 Extension of Administrative Temporary Use Permit for filming and 

media production 

$35.00 

 Administrative Home Based Business Permit (requires renewal every 

two years) 

$65.00 

 Mobile Farmers Market $65.00 

 Mobile Food Sales Permit $65.00 

Excavation and Landfill Annual Inspection: 

Permit Fees 

 Active Excavation and Landfill Special Use Permit for Construction 

and Demolition Debris or Excavation 

$1,626.00 

 Active Excavation and Landfill Special Use Permit-Clean Fill Only $813.00 

 Inactive Excavation and Landfill Special Use Permit $350.00 

Tree Removal Permit Fee: 

Tree Removal Fee 

 Per application at time of submission $90.00 

Development Review Committee: 

Review Committee Fee 

 Hear and decide appeals of decisions of the Development Review 

Committee; the Zoning Administrator on sign permit applications; and 

hear and decide other land use cases as directed by the County 

Commission - Hearing Officer 

$1,000.00/day 

Note: Building Permit Fees shall be submitted at the time of building permit application. No 

Building Permit Applications will be accepted without the required permit fee. All Public, 

Private, and Governmental Entities shall be required to pay building permit fees. 

Tobacco 21 Licensing Fee: 

Tobacco License Fee 

 Annual Fee $230.00 

 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 34 Effective 10/22/2019 

Information Services 

Telecommunications: 

 Telephone, voice mail, conference manager, automated attendant, and internet services 

are $18.00 per month. 

Technician Service Charge: 

Technician Service Fees 

 Normal business hours – 8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m./Monday – Friday, 

minimum one (1) hour charge 

$36.00/hour 

 Non-business hours – evening, weekends and holidays, minimum two 

(2) hour charge 

$54.00/hour 

Long Distance Rates Restricted to Quest: (Rates subject to change) 

Long Distance Fees 

 Current In-State and Out-of-State $0.027/minute 

 F.C.C/P.S.C Regulated Charges – Local directory assistance/call plus 

– long distance directory assistance 

F.C.C/P.S.C 

Approved 

Rate 

 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 35 Effective 10/22/2019 

Organizational Development & Training 

 If the County opts to charge a fee for a training course, ODT will develop a budget for 

the course and the requesting department will authorize the curriculum and budget in 

advance. 

 The budget will reflect the preparation and class time of County personnel, the cost of 

materials and related expenses (e.g., copying, facilities, etc.), and the cost of non-County 

personnel. 

 For internal training, the County will allocate the costs to County departments in lieu of 

transferring funds to recover the training costs. 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 36 Effective 10/22/2019 

Parks & Conservation Lands 

Fairgrounds Facilities Rental (adjacent to the Gainesville airport): 

Facilities Rental Fees 

 Grounds, Pole Barns, and Parking Lot – Regular Rate September 1 – May 31 

o Weekday Rate $500.00 per day 

o Weekend Rate $700.00 per day 

 Grounds, Pole Barns, and Parking Lot – Summer Rate June 1 – August 31 

o Weekday Rate $300.00 per day 

o Weekend Rate $400.00 per day 

 Parking Lot Only 

o Weekday Rate $250.00 per day 

o Weekend Rate $500.00 per day 

 Security Deposit (Per Event)  

o Class I $1,000 per event 

o Class II $2,500 per event 

o Class III $5,000 per event 

 Electrical Hook-Up Fees  

o Fairgrounds Midway $15.00 per day per 

panel 

o Fairgrounds Pole Barns $15.00 per day per 

pole barn 

o Fairgrounds Midway 50 amp X 240 volt $50.00 per day 

 Concession Stands/Food Trucks/Catering Fees $25.00 per event 

for each concession 

stand, food truck, or 

catered event 

 Fence Panel Rental $10.00 per panel 

per rental event 

Fees for Alachua County Youth Fair and Livestock Show, Inc. shall be waived. 

Sales Tax will be charged for all rentals 

Alachua County Agricultural & Equestrian Center Facilities Rental: 

Facilities Rental Fees 

(1) Basic Amenities: Trash Receptacles, Bathrooms, Bathroom 

Serviced, Trash Removal, all restroom inventory 

$25 per show day 

(2) Covered Arena for Equestrian Events: includes lights, PA 

system, clubhouse, use of arena as of 12 noon the day 

before show, footing prep, and 2 drags/show day 

$400 per weekday; 

$600 per weekend day 

(3) Covered Arena for Non-Equestrian Events: rodeos, 

concerts, circus, festivals, political events (spectators, etc.) 

$1,500 per day 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 37 Effective 10/22/2019 

Facilities Rental Fees 

(4) Outdoor Complex: Includes PA system, use of uncovered 

arena as of 12 noon the day before show, footing prep, and 

2 drags/show day 

$200 per day 

(5) Custom Ring Preparation: arena prep beyond standard 

footing preparation (i.e. stock panels, extra sand, etc.) 

To Be Determined 

(6) Extra Drags: provided by facility equipment and staff $30 per extra drag 

(7) Dressage Set Up: standard 20m x 60m with letters, markers, 

and judges box setup and use 

$100 per ring per event 

(8) Jump Course and Trail Course: does not include decoration Set-Up Fee: $150 

Rental Fee: $150 per day 

(9) Stall Rental: Stalls are charged on a per day (12 PM – 10 

AM) basis. Each additional day over 2 add $12 per day. 

$20 per stall per day 

(10) Ship In Fee: For horses not using a stall $15 per horse per day 

(11) Shavings: 2 bag minimum per stall, and must be purchased 

from facility. Competitors may bring their own additional 

bedding. 

Market price per bag 

(12) Camper Hookups: hook-up includes water and electric. $30 per night plus 

sales/bed tax 

(13) Vendors: vendor must comply with FL Fire and Health 

Regulations. Must supply insurance certificate. 

$35 per day per vendor 

(14) Clubhouse Rental: includes kitchen area and bathrooms $150 per weekday 

$275 per Saturday 

$200 per Sunday 

(15) Schooling Fees: must be scheduled through office $15 per horse per day on 

flat 

$25 per horse per day 

jumps when available 

(16) Clinic Covered Arena Fee: Includes PA system, clubhouse 

(if available) footing prep and 2 drags per day 

$400 per day 

(17) Non-Refundable Facility Deposits: per contract with a 

maximum of $1,000 per year for producers with multiple 

events 

25% of items 2,3,4,5, 

16,7 and 8 

(18) Incentive/Appreciation Discount. All new show organizers 

/producers will receive a one-time appreciation discount 

(not per event, but once only). Does not apply to schooling 

or clubhouse rentals 

10% discount on total bill 

before tax, and only 

applies to new contracts. 

(19) Security Deposit (per event):  

o Class I $1,000 per event 

o Class II $2,500 per event 

o Class III $5,000 per event 

(20) Electrical Hook-Up Fees  

o Midway $15 per day per panel 

o Pole Barns $15 per day per pole barn 

o Midway 50 amp x 240 volt $50 per day 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 38 Effective 10/22/2019 

Alachua County Agricultural & Equestrian Center Facilities Rental: (Continued) 

Special requests and fees not identified in this fee schedule are at the discretion of the County 

Manager, or designee.   

Fees for Alachua County Youth Fair and Livestock Show, Inc. shall be waived. 

All rentals are subject to appropriate sales tax. 

Freedom Community Center Rental: 

Community Center Fees 

 Daily Rental Rate 8:00 AM – 10:00 PM (Entire Facility Only) 

o Weekday Rate $150.00 per day 

o Saturday Rate $350.00 per day 

o Sunday Rate $250.00 per day 

o Concession Area $75.00 per day 

o Refundable Damage/Cleaning/Security Deposit $200 

 Fees for Alachua County Government shall be waived 

 Concession stand must be rented in conjunction with the Freedom Community Center 

 Set-up and take-down time to be included in the rental period 

 Sales Tax will be charged for all rentals 

Poe Springs Park: 

Parking Fees 

 Parking Fee $5.00 per day per vehicle 

Poe Springs Lodge Rental: 

 Daily Rental Rate 9:00 AM – 6:00 PM (Entire Facility Only) 

o Weekend rate (up to 4 hours) $100.00 per day 

o Weekend rate (from 4 hours to full day) $200.00 per day 

o Weekday rate (up to 4 hours) $50.00 per day 

o Weekday rate (from 4 hours to full day) $100.00 per day 

o Deposit (required with any reservation) $100.00 

 Fees for Alachua County Government shall be waived 

 Set-up and take-down time to be included in the rental period 

 Sales Tax will be charged for all rentals 

Clean-Up/Damage Repair by Parks Personnel: Hourly Rate Fee $30.00 

Other Charges: 

Rental Fees 

 Pavilion Rental (Small) $25.00 per day 

 Pavilion Rental (Large) $50.00 per day 

 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 39 Effective 10/22/2019 

Gatornationals Camping: 

Camping Fees 

 Gatornationals Camping  

o Regular Campsite $40.00 per day 

o Water Campsite $45.00 per day 

o RV Campsite $50.00 per day 

o Tow Vehicle $40.00 per event 

 Additional Services  

o Firewood $25.00 per bundle 

o Ice $5.00 per bag 

o Shower $5.00 per use 

Timber Sales: 

 Sale of Timer is based on the Market Price as determined by competitive bid  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 40 Effective 10/22/2019 

Public Works: Development Review & Signs 

Driveway Inspection Fees: 

Inspection Fees 

 Class I (Rural) $150.00 

 Class I (Urban without sidewalk) $135.00 

 Class I with sidewalk $145.00 

 Class I (Review of Existing Driveway) $40.00 

 Class II $210.00 

 Class III $300.00 

 Class III with Auxiliary Lanes $1,530.00 

 Class IV $300.00 

 Class IV with Auxiliary Lanes $1,500.00 

Final Site Inspection Fees: 

Inspection Fees 

 Multi-family residential, office, rural / agricultural 

subdivision, commercial and industrial (appropriate 

driveway fee additional) 

$165.00 + 

$10.00/parking space 

 Sites without stormwater management improvements or 

paved parking, fish ponds and flood-prone area permits 

$100.00 

 Review of plans revision or re-inspection (per instance) $305.00 

Flood Zone Request - Written: $120.00 

Record Plat Review Fee: $250.00 

Right-of-Way Utilization Inspection Fees: 

Inspection Fees 

 Above Ground $175.00 

 Underground (Length of construction in feet):  

o 1-700 $175.00 

o 701-1,400 $230.00 

o 1,401-2,100 $285.00 

o 2,101-2,800 $340.00 

o 2,801-3,500 $395.00 

o 3,501-4,200 $450.00 

o 4,201-4,900 $505.00 

o 4,901-5,600 $560.00 

o 5,601-6,300 $615.00 

o 6,301-7,000 $670.00 

o 7,001-7,700 $725.00 

o 7,701-8,400 $780.00 

o 8,401-9,100 $845.00 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 41 Effective 10/22/2019 

Inspection Fees 

o 9,101-9,800 $890.00 

o Over 9,800 $950.00 

Subdivision Inspection Fee: 

Inspection Fee 

 Paving and drainage inspection (appropriate 

driveway fee additional) 

$1,430.00 +  

$100 / 100 linear feet of roadway 

Traffic Sign Fees: 

Note: A fee will be charged to developers of new subdivisions for the installation of new traffic 

signs. The same fees will apply to requests from individuals or homeowners associations for 

installation of signs on roads not maintained by Alachua County. The fee covers plan review, site 

inspection, sign materials, sign preparation and clerical activities associated with the installation. 

Signs on the County, State or City street system will be installed by the County and there will be 

an installation charge. Signs will not be installed on private roads. 

Sign Fees 

 Street name signs (each plate) $13.00/square foot 

 Regulatory/traffic signs (Standard) $8.00/square foot 

 Special Request Signs (Special Orders) $11.00/square foot 

 Channel iron posts 6 foot $6.00 each 

 Channel iron posts 10 foot $16.00 each 

 Channel iron posts 12 foot $20.00 each 

 Street sign posts 12 foot w/ pyramid cap $25.00 each 

 Street sign posts 14 foot w/ pyramid cap $28.00 each 

 Installation $50.00 each 

Note: The fee payment is required prior to installation of signs. For new subdivisions the fee 

payment is due upon issuance of a construction permit. 

Sign Fee 

 Vehicle Markings per sq. ft $6.00 

Vacating Plat and Road Fees: 

Note: Filing fees for vacating plats and roads do not include the cost of legally required 

advertising. Petitioners will be charged for the County's actual advertising cost, on a case-by-

case basis, in addition to filing fees. 

Activities Fees 

 Filing fee for vacating plats or portions thereof $645.00 

 Filing fee for vacating streets, roadways, etc. or portion thereof $645.00 

 Filing fee for vacating unopened streets, roadways, etc. or 

portion thereof 

$345.00 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 42 Effective 10/22/2019 

Surveying Services: 

Surveyor Fees 

 Sr. Survey Technician $60.00 

 Survey Technician $50.00 

 Survey Aide $40.00 

 County Surveyor $60.00 

Engineering Services: 

Engineer Fee 

 Engineering Technician $45.00 

 Sr. Engineering Technician $60.00 

 Sr. Construction Inspector $60.00 

 Construction Inspector $50.00 

 Construction Inspector Superintendent $75.00 

 Civil Engineer I $60.00 

 Civil Engineer II $70.00 

 Civil Engineer III $80.00 

 Development Program Manager $90.00 

 County Engineer $85.00 

Note: Hourly Rate Fees will be based upon the hourly rate of pay and benefits of each employee 

performing the work multiplied by the number of hours worked based on the hourly rate of the 

employee.  Any other additional direct costs, including travel reimbursement at the rate currently 

approved by the Internal Revenue Service, that are incurred by the County in connection with the 

provision of Surveying or Engineering Services shall also be borne by the applicant. Upon 

request, estimates will be provided prior to the provision of services. 

Assessment Fees 

 Special Assessment Districts – Resident Petition $350.00 

 Special Assessment Districts – Property Owner Interest Poll $345.00 

 Special Assessment Districts – Notice of Intent Hearing $360.00 

 Special Assessment Districts – Adoption Hearing $315.00 

Fleet Management Fees: 

Note: Fleet Management is an internal service fund that is fully supported by revenues derived 

from labor charges and from service charges on parts and fuels. The listed hourly rates shall 

apply to normal working hours. Work required outside normal hours will be charged at 1.40 

times these rates. 

Labor Rates: 

Activities Fees 

 In Shop $63.00/hour 

 Road Call $78.00/hour 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 43 Effective 10/22/2019 

Activities Fees 

 External Customer $68.00/hour 

 Fuel $0.09/gallon 

 Parts, Supplies, & Materials 38%* 

 Commercial Services 10%* 

*Note: Administrative Charge above the cost of the item as calculated by the Fleet Management 

Faster System 

Activities Fees 

 Pooled Vehicle Rental $6.00/hour 

 Rental of Skid Steer with non-powered attachments $26.50/hour 

 Rental of powered attachments for Skid Steer  

(Example: Stump Grinder, Brush Grinder, tree Spade, Trencher) 

Additional 

$27.50/hour (not 

per attachment) 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 44 Effective 10/22/2019 

Santa Fe Hills Water System 

Deposits: 

Deposits Amount 

 All existing customer deposits assumed by Alachua County as a result 

of the receivership shall be deemed sufficient unless and until account 

becomes outstanding and service has been disconnected due to 

nonpayment. All customer deposits shall be held for the duration of 

service and applied to the customer's final bill and any resulting excess 

balance shall be refunded. 

$50.00 

Water Charges: 

Charges Fee 

 Minimum Water Service Charge $13.47 

o Applies to all active customer accounts  

o Accounts exceeding 3,000 gallons within a billing cycle will 

incur additional charges 

 

 Additional Water Consumption Charges $2.59/1,000 gal 

o Applies to usage exceeding allowance in the minimum service  

o Charge prorated  

Street Light Charge: 

Activities Fee 

 Applies to only one customer account by original agreement with 

previous ownership 

$6.50/month 

Service Re-Connection Charge: 

Activities Fee 

 Water Meter Installation Charge (new installations) $780.00 

 Applies to accounts that have been disconnected due to non-payment 

and is payable prior to re-connection in addition to payment of any 

outstanding balance 

$25.00 

Note: Any existing account with a deposit that is less than $50 shall be increased to $50 and 

payable prior to re-connection of service. 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 45 Effective 10/22/2019 

Solid Waste and Resource Recovery 

Commercial and Non-Residential Solid Waste Permits: 

Activity Fee 

 Original Application Fee $70.00 

 Annual Renewal Fee $35.00 

Curbside Waste Collection: 

Activity Fee 

 Official bags for excess garbage, package of 5 $11.25 plus tax/pkg 

 Increase in garbage cart size $15.00 plus any applicable refuse fees 

 More than one cart exchange per fiscal year 

(each additional instance) 

$15.00 plus any applicable refuse fees 

 Special pick up of illegally prepared garbage and 

trash after notice to property 

$75.00/incident plus actual disposal 

cost and any additional collection costs 

Rural Collection Centers: 

Activity Fee 

 Out of County Residential User Permit Annual Rural Collection Assessment 

prorated by quarter purchased 

Transfer Station: 

Note: For Vehicles Crossing Solid Waste Management Facility Scales a $23.66 per ton 

surcharge shall be added to the listed fees for materials from non-assessed municipalities. 

Brush and Land Clearing Debris: 

Activity Fee 

 Fee per ton $48.08 

 Fee per cubic yard $11.00 

 Governmental Yard Waste $30.00/ton 

Note: $2.00 minimum charge 

Commercial Collection Service Franchise: 

Activity Fee 

 Application – Container Provision only (rental of containers) $100.00 

 Application – Solid Waste collection and disposal services $250.00 

 Commercial Franchise Fee (due 30 days after end of month) 10% of gross 

revenues 

 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 46 Effective 10/22/2019 

Garbage (Class I and Class III): 

Activity Fee 

 Fee per ton $48.08 

 Fee per compacted cubic yard $20.00 

 Fee per loose cubic yard $11.00 

 Commercial Contract Garbage $48.08/ton 

Note: $2.00 minimum charge 

Illegal Dump Site Material: 

Activity Fee 

 Fee per ton $48.08 

 Fee per compacted cubic yard $20.00 

 Fee per loose cubic yard $11.00 

Public Weighing:  $5.00 

Activity Fee 

 Contaminated or Mixed Loads containing prohibited items $100.00/incident 

Recycling Services: 

Activity Fee 

 Processing Fee for source 

separated dual stream recyclables 

Blended Average from all tons sold in current 

month from Material Recovery Facility: 

$50-59.99 = $50/ton 

$60-$69.99 = $40/ton 

$70-$99.99 = $35/ton 

$100-$119.99 = $30/ton 

$120-$129.99 = $25/ton 

$130-$139.99 = $15/ton 

$140-$149.99 = $0/ton 

$150-$169.99 = ($10/ton) 

$170-$189.99 = ($20/ton) 

$190< = ($35/ton) 

 Revenue Sharing  Volume/ Market Based, Less Moisture/ 

Contamination Adjustment, if Applicable 

Recovered Materials Collector: 

Activity Fee 

 Application $50.00 

 Annual Renewal $50.00 

 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 47 Effective 10/22/2019 

Special Handling Waste: 

Activity Fee 

 Fee per ton $200.00 

 Fee per cubic yard $52.00 

 Minimum fee per item $85.00 

Tires - Whole: 

Activity Fee 

 Fee per ton $140.00 

 Fee per cubic yard $50.00 

 Auto or light truck only in mixed loads or less than 3 without wheels $3.00/tire 

 Truck (17” inch or more) only in mixed loads or less than 3 without 

wheels 

$4.00/tire 

 Off road tires (loader and tractor): Fee per ton $275.00/ton 

Note: For Vehicles Crossing Solid Waste Management Facility Scales a $23.66 per ton 

surcharge shall be added to the listed fees for materials from non-assessed municipalities. 

White Goods/Scrap Metal: 

Activity Fee 

 Containing refrigerants whether Freon has been removed or not (per unit) $25.00 

 Other metals and white goods not including refrigerants (per ton) $48.08 

Special Conditions: 

 Refuse resulting from cleanups of neighborhoods throughout the County may be disposed 

of at the transfer station on a non-fee basis provided that authorization from the Alachua 

County Public Works Department is obtained prior to any disposal activities. 

 In the event the scales are out of service, the previous average weights of the trucks will 

be used to calculate the fees. If average weights are not available, the fees will be 

calculated by cubic yards for all materials. 

 No burn barrels with material are allowed in the transfer station. 

Special Event: 

 Waste Alternatives will sell to the public items which promote the Embrace Zero Waste 

philosophy of waste reduction, recycling and resource conservation for less than market 

price. These items will include, but not be limited to, Earth Machine backyard 

composters and cistern rain barrels. Units will be picked up by the public at various 

locations. Items will be available on a first-come, first-served basis for a limited time. 

 

  



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 48 Effective 10/22/2019 

Sheriff 

Records: 

Service Fee 

 Fingerprints $10.00 each 

 Background Checks $6.00 each 

 Request for Public Records Cost to Produce 

Civil Enforceable Process: 

Service Fee 

 Certified Mail to All Parties $6.80 each 

 Standby Deputy $53.50/hour 

 Inventory Fee After First Hour $53.50/hour 

 Writ of Replevin/Possession/Any Other Enforceable Writ $90.00 each 

Advance Cost Deposit: 

Service Fee 

 Vehicle, boats, etc., required towing and storage $1,500.00 each 

 Motorcycles or any item requiring covered storage $1,500.00 each 

 Real Property $1,000.00 each 

 Business (may vary) $1,500.00 each 

Jail: 

Service Fee 

 Clinic Visit – Routine Sick Call, Doctor/ARNP, Dental Visit $5.00 each 

 Medications – New Prescription $5.00 each 

 Medications – Prescription Renewal $5.00 each 

 Laboratory Services – Lab Test $5.00 each 

 Clinic Procedures – X-ray, EKG, Weight Check, Blood Pressure, 

Accucheck/other than diabetic 

$5.00 each 

 Work Release Meals $1.32 each 

 Inmate Transportation for Elective Medical Treatment $80.00 each 

 Inmate Subsistence Fee $4.00/day 

 Inmate Uniform/Linen Fee $20.00 each 

Inmate Secure Transportation to Funerals: 

Service Fee 

 Processing $54.00 each 

 Deputy $53.50 / hour 

 Mileage IRS Standard 

Mileage Rate 



Schedule of Fees and Charges for Services 

FY 20 Fee Schedule - Amended 49 Effective 10/22/2019 

 


	Structure Bookmarks
	Figure




