EXHIBIT A

BID FORM
BID NUMBER: 20-11 Annual Purchase of Fire Rescue Uniforms
BID OPENING DATE: 2:00 pm, Wednesday, September 25,2019
BID OPENING ADDRESS Alachua County Procurement, 3'4 Floor

County Administration Building
12 SE 1% Street
Gainesville Florida 32601-6983

INSTRUCTIONS FOR PRICE SHEET COMPLETION: Vendors must type their bids into the Excel
document, print a hard copy, sign it, and submit both the Excel copy (saved on flash drive or CD) AND
the hard copy with their bid submittal,

Failure to provide the
VENDOR NAME: Dana Safety Supply information requested below

may result in rejection of bid.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addendum(s) (if applicable circle):

#1 Yes | No #2 Yes  No #3 Yes  No #4 Yes  No
Amsnsm——

Bidder:Tom Gorman Company: Dana Safety Supply

Address: 1855 Cassat Avenue: Jacksonville kL 32210

Authorized Signature: A’)VI ./ /Wﬁb@/ Title: Bids Specialist

Clearly Print Name: Jop(athan Sizemore

Phone: 904-388-7006 Fax: 813-348-0450 Date:23-September-2019

Email Address; tgorman@danasafetysupply.com
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— FIRE RESCUE UNIFORM PRICE SHEET
" ACFR UNIFORM BID ITEMS

SHIRTS

Description

Galls Part #

MFG Part #

Estimated
Quantities

Cost

Flying Cross Long Sleeve Poly Cotton Men's Shirt With
Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left Sleeve
(WHITE) PartB
Specifications Section 14.24

SHO18

45

No Bid

Flying Cross Short Sleeve Poly Cotton Men's Shirt With
Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left Sleeve
(WHITE) PartB
Specifications Section 14.24

SH020

85R54

90

No Bid

Flying Cross Short Sleeve Poly Cotton Women's Shirt With
Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left Sleeve
(WHITE) Part B
Specifications Section 14.24

SHO47

176R54

12

No Bid

Flying Cross Long Sleeve Poly Cotton Women's Shirt With
Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left Sleeve (WHITE)
Part B Specifications Section 14.24

SHO48

126R54

No Bid

Flying Cross Short Sleeve Polyester Men's Command Shirt
With Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left Sleeve
(WHITE) PartB
Specifications Section 14.11

SHO70

85R78

45

No Bid

Flying Cross Long Sleeve Polyester Men's Command Shirt
With Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left Sleeve
(WHITE, NAVY) Part B
Specifications Section 14.11

SHO71

34W78Z

40

No Bid

Flying Cross Short Sleeve Polyesier Women's Command
Shirt With Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left
Sleeve (WHITE) Part B Specifications
Section 14.11

SH119

176R78

No Bid

Flying Cross Long Sleeve Polyester Women's Command Shirt
With Alachua County Fire Rescue Emblem on Left Sleeve
(WHITE, NAVY) Part B
Specifications Section 14.11

SH121

126R78

No Bid

8000 Gildan-DryBelnd 50 Cotton/50 Poly T-Shirt. NAVY. ACFR
Logo on front- ACFR Lettering on back , Sizes: Sm,Med, Lg, XL,
2xl, 3XL Part B Specifications
Section 14.14

Gildan 8000

600

No Bid

Propper Uniform 100% Cotton Polo Men's Shirt. Mic tabs on
both shoulders and pen pocket on left sleeve. White. ACFR
Logo on front, Job title on front, employee name on front-
ACFR Lettering on back, Sizes: Sm,Med, Lg, XL, 2xI, BXL

Part B Specifications Section 14.13

SH3313

F5806

20

No Bid

Propper Uniform 100% Cotton Polo Women's Shirt. Mic tabs
on both shoulders and pen pocket on left sleeve. White. ACFR
Logo on front, Joh title on front, employee name on front-
ACFR Lettering on back, Sizes: Sm,Med, Lg, XL, 2xl, 3XL

Part B Specifications Section 14.13

SH3314

F5807

20

No Bid




Propper Men's Ice Performance Polo, 94% polyester, 6%
spandex- Short Sleeve. Hidden buttons under collar for
professional look. Two-channel pen pockets on the left
sleeve. Longer tail in back to keep shirt tucked in.

Mic clips on both shoulders and sunglass clip under placket.
ACFR Logo on front, employee name on front- ACFR Lettering
on back, Sizes: Sm,Med, Lg, XL, 2x|,3XL  PartB8
Specifications Section 14.12

ST136

F5341

60

No Bid

Propper Women's Ice Performance Polo, 94% polyester, 6%
spandex - Short Sleeve. Hidden buttons under collar for
professional look. Two-channel pen pockets on the left
sleeve. Longer tail in back to keep shirt tucked in.

Mic clips on both shoulders and sunglass clip under placket.
ACFR Logo on front, employee name on front- ACFR Lettering
on back, Sizes: Sm,Med, Lg, XL, 2x|, 3XL  PartB
Specifications Section 14.12

ST284

F5327

20

No Bid

Trousers

Description

Galls Part #

MFG Part #

Estimated
Quantities

Cost

Flying Cross Men's VISA System 3 Polyester Trousers (NAVY)
Part B Specifications Section 14.25

TR121

382

50

No Bid

Flying Cross Polyester Women's Pants (NAVY) Part

B Specifications Section 14.25

TRO83

3960

10

No Bid

Flying Cross Men's Polyester Cotton Trousers with Flex
Waistband (NAVY)
B Specifications Section 14.4

Part

TJ262

F138200

80

No Bid

Flying Cross Women's Poly Cotton Pants (NAVY)
Part B Specifications Section 14.4

TR651

47400W

40

No Bid

Flying Cross Men's Polyester Gabardine Pants (BLACK) Part

B Specifications Section 14.25

TR082

40

No Bid

Flying Cross Polyester Women's Pants (BLACK)
Part B Specifications Section 14.25

TRO83

3960

10

No Bid

Uniform Accessories

Description

Galls Part #

MFG Part #

Estimated
Quantities

Cost

BELT, BLACK 1" Off Duty Belt Part

B Specifications Section 14.7

ZU939

ZU939

50

No Bid

PATCH -AC5519257 EMERGENCY MEDICAL TECHNICIAN
FLORIDA
Part B Specifications Section 14.11.1

EC2190

04CNO3CC0S

200

1.31

PATCH- AC5519257 PARAMEDIC FLORIDA CIR ROY/LTGL
Part B Specifications Section 14.11.1

EC2189

04CM09DDO06

200

1.31

PATCH- AC5519257 ALACHUA CO FIRE RESCUE ROY/LT
Part B Specifications Section 14.11.1

EC2188

04CLOSEEQ6

500

PATCH- AC5519257 ALACHUA COUNTY FIRE RESCUE MEDICAL
DIRECTOR Part B
Specifications Section 14.11.1

EN16444

04DN11CCO1

No Bid

Tie -Galls Clip-On Tie (NAVY)
Part B Specifications Section 14.10

UA494

UA494

50

No Bid




Patch'- 4" x 1.5" Crescent Rocker "Honor" Navy/Gold,

Quantities

downward curve 50
Part B Specifications Section 14.10, Figure 1 Attachement 1 1.26
Patch - 4" x 1.5" Crescent Rocker "Guard" Navy/Gold, upward
curve PartB 50
Specifications Section 14.10, Figure 1
Attachement 1 1.26
Patch - 4" x 1.5" Crescent Rocker "Critical Care" Navy/Gold,
upward curve Part B 50
Specifications Section 14.10, Figure 1
Attachment 1 1.26
Collar Brass
. . Estimated
Description Galls Part # | MFG Part # | o .niivies | COSt
Blackinton Single Bugle Pin (GOLD) Lieutenant Part
B Specifications Section 14.23.10 CBOS6 A2309 80 11.42
Blackinton Double Bugle Pin (GOLD) Captain Part
CB2 2909-2 12
B Specifications Section 14.23.10 >7 A 11.42
Blackinton ?Fro?sed Bug!es Pin (GOLD) District Chief CBOS8 A2908 24
Part B Specifications Section 14.23.10 11.42
Blacklrft‘on 3 Crossedﬁ Bugles Pin (GOLD) Assistant Chief Part CBO59 A2907 12
B Specifications Section 14.23.11 11.81
Blacki - -
Iackerthn 4 Crossed- Bugles Pin (GOLD) Deputy Chief Part CBOGO A2906 4
B Specifications Section 14.23.11 11.81
Blackinton 5 Crossed Bugles Pin (GOLD) Chief Part
CBO A2905 4
B Specifications Section 14.23.11 61 11.81
Smith & Warren Custom Collar Pins 4 Letters 3/8" (Sold in CB120 10
Pairs) ACFR (GOLD) ATTACHMENT 2
19.82
Dress Coat Collar Brass
. . Estimated
Description Galls Part # | MFG Part # | o .nuees | COSt
Blackinton (15/76™) Single Bugle Dress Coat Pin (GOLD)
Lieutenant Part B ZA2046 2876 GPD A2876 40
Specifications Section 14.23.10 7.21
Blackinton (15/16™) Double Bugles Dress Coat Pin (GOLD)
Captain PartB ZA2450 2 GLDD A2875 12
Specifications Section 14.23.10 7.21
Blackinton (15/16™) 2 Crossed Bugies Dress Coat Pin
(GOLD) District Chief Part ZA2242 2874 GP A2874 24
B Specifications Section 14.23.10 7.21
ackinton rossed Bugles Dress Coat Pin ‘
(GOLD) Assistant Chief Part ZA2047 2873 GPD A2873 12
B Specifications Section 14.23.11 7.21
Blackinton (15/16™) 4 Crossed Bugles Dress Coat Pin
(GOLD) Deputy Chief Part B CB197 GP A2872 4
Specifications Section 14.23.11 7.21
Blackinton (15/16") 5 Crossed Bugles Dress Coat Pin
(GOLD) Chief PartB ZA3214 GLD A2871 4
Specifications Section 14.23.11 7.21
Oversized Dress Coat Badges
. . Estimated
Description Galls Part # | MFG Part # Cost




Badge Style # B96 Karat Klad-

SARETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS-

LINE 2 - DISTRICT CHIEF-

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE-

LINE 4 - (White center 2 crossed RAISED Gold bugles)-
LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

Part B Specifications Section 14.21

BCO52 GP

B96 Karat Klad

82.2

Badge Style # B96 Karat Klad-

SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS-

LINE 2 - ASSISTANT CHIEF-

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE-

LINE 4 - (White center 3 crossed RAISED Gold bugles)-
LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

Part B Specifications Section 14.21

BCO52 GP

B96 Karat Klad

82.2

Badge Style # B96 Karat Klad-

SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS-

LINE 2 - DEPUTY CHIEF-

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE-

LINE 4 - (White center 4 crossed RAISED Gold bugles)-
LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

Part B Specifications Section 14.21

BCO52 GP

B96 Karat Klad

82.2

Badge Style # B96 Karat Klad-

SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS-

LINE 2 - FIRE CHIEF-

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE-

LINE 4 - (White center 5 crossed RAISED Gold bugles)-
LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

Part B Specifications Section 14.21

BCO52 GP

B96 Karat Klad

82.2

Badge Style # B96-RHO GLO

SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS
LINE 2 - RECRUITMENT OFFICER

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 -A-3028 (RHO GLO-RED)

LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

Part B Specifications Section 14.21

BCO52 GP

B96-RHO GLO

56.4

Badge Style # B96 RHO GLO

SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS

LINE 2 - CHAPLAIN

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - A 2437 WHITE CROSS, NAVY BLUE background
{chaplain)

LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

Part B Specifications Section 14.21

BCO52 GP

B96-RHO GLO

56.4

Badge Style # B96 Karat Klad

SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS
LINE 2 - HONOR GUARD

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - A3028 BG RED

LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

Part B Specifications Section 14.21

BCO52 GP

B96 Karat Klad

10

82.2

Badges

Description

Galls Part #

MFG Part #

Estimated
Quantities

Cost




Badge Style # VHB-B575-RHO GLO-FITS ALL * BADGE
SARETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS

LINE 2 - DRIVER

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - Blue Star of Life

LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

B Specifications Section 14.22

Part

BC198 RG

B575-RHO GLO

10

49.54

VHB-B575-RHO GLO-FITS ALL ¥ BADGE
SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS
LINE 2 - RECRUITMENT OFFICER

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 -A-3028 (RHO GLO-RED)

LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

B Specifications Section 14.22

Part

BC198 RG

B575 RHO GLO

49.54

Badge Style # B575 RHO GLO

SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS

LINE 2 - CHAPLAIN

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - A 2437 WHITE CROSS, NAVY BLUE background
(chaplain)

LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

B Specifications Section 14.22

Part

BC198 RG

B575 RHO GLO

49.54

Badge Style # VHB-B575-RHO GLO-FITS ALL * BADGE
SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS

LINE 2 - FIREFIGHTER

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - A-3028

LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

Part B Specifications Section 14.22

BC198 RG

B575 RHO GLO

50

49.54

Badge Style # VHB-B575-RHO GLO-FITS ALL * BADGE
SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS

LINE 2 - DRIVER OPERATOR

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - A-3028

LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

B Specifications Section 14.22

Part

BC198 RG

B575 RHO GLO

10

49.54

Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE
SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS
LINE 2 - WAREHOUSE MANAGER

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - STATE OF FLORIDA SEAL

LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

B Specifications Section 14.22

Part

BC198 KK

B575-KK

74.11

Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE
SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS
LINE 2 - PROGRAM MANAGER

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - STATE OF FLORIDA SEAL

LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

B Specifications Section 14.20

Part

BC198 KK

B575-KK

74.11

Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE
SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS
LINE 2 - EMS LIEUTENANT

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - Blue Star of Life (A4247 FC)

LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

B Specifications Section 14.20

Part

BC198 KK

B575-KK

12

74.11




Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE
SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS
LINE 2 - LIEUTENANT

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - RED Center (RAISED, ONE SINGLE BUGLE)
LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

Part B Specifications Section 14.20

BC198 KK

B575-KK

30

74.11

Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE

SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS

LINE 2 - CAPTAIN

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - A-2997 White Center (RAISED, Two side by side
BUGLES)

LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part
B Specifications Section 14.20

BC198 KK

B575-KK

74.11

VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE

SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS

LINE 2 - DISTRICT CHIEF

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - A-2994 White Center (RAISED, Two crossed
BUGLES)

LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part
B Specifications Section 14.20

BC198 KK

B575-KK

74.11

Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE

SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS

LINE 2 - ASSISTANT CHIEF

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - White Center (RAISED, THREE GOLD crossed BUGLES)
LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part
B Specifications Section 14.20

BC198 KK

B575-KK

74.11

Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE

SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS

LINE 2 - DEPUTY CHIEF

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - White Center {RAISED, FOUR GOLD crossed BUGLES)
LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA Part
B Specifications Section 14.22

BC198 KK

B575-KK

74.11

Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE

SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS

LINE 2 - CHIEF

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - White Center {RAISED, FIVE GOLD crossed BUGLES)
LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

Part B Specifications Section 14.20

BC198 KK

B575-KK

74.11

Badge Style # VHB-B575-KK-FITS ALL * BADGE
SAFETY CATCH, DURA, BLACK BLOCK LETTERS

LINE 2 - MEDICAL DIRECTOR

LINE 3 - FIRE RESCUE

LINE 4 - A4256 FC (Physician Symbol-white on blue)
LINE 5 - ALACHUA CO. FLORIDA

Part B Specifications Section 14.20

BC198 KK

B575-KK

74.11

NOMEX SHIRTS




L — Estimated
; Description Galls Part # | MFG Part # | quanueies | COSt
Flying Cross Men's Nomex lllA Short-Sleeve Shirt- (MENS)
Part B Specifications Section 14.1.15 SR558 9800 275 No Bid
Flying Cross Women's Nomex illA Short-Sleeve Shirt
Part B Specifications Section 14.1.15 SR560 9810 40 No Bid
NOMEX PANTS
e s Estimated
Description Galls Part # | MFG Part # | o .nuties |  COSt
Flying Cross Men's Nomex lllA Trousers Part
B Specifications Section 14.1.3 TR619 98200 200 Iy Bid
Flying Cross Women's Nomex llIA Pants
Part B Specifications Section 14.1.3 TR620 98250 40 No Bid
NOMEX ACCESSORIES
e s Estimated
Description Galls Part # | MFG Part # | o .nuees |  COSt
1IN SINGLE NOMEX NAMESTRIP NON-APPLIED (NAVY w/
white or gold lettering) Part UAG12N 400
B Specifications Section 14.1.2 No Bid
1x1 inch nomex collar patches with gold bugle Part
B Specifications Section 14.1.2 EG0712 AC5519257 100 No Bid
ix1 |.nf:h n-omex co!lar patches with white D/O PartB EG0713 AC5519257 50 .
Specifications Section 14.1.2 No Bid
RAINWEAR, SAFETY VEST AND FLOATATION DEVICES
s _as Estimated
Description MTS Part # | MFG Part # | o oieies | COSt
RAINCOAT-LIME PU/ANSI CL 3 RAINCOAT 49" 3M REFLECTIVE
{ACFR IN LARGE GORILLA GRIP LETTERS ON BACK) A-493 50
Part B Specifications Section 14.19 48.46
Safety Vest)-AVLM99 {MTS1} -ANSI/LM-CHEV-VEST 2" BLAZE
ORANGE REFLECTIVE MIC TABS BOTH SIDES- (ORANGE
REFLECTIVE 3 X 6 PANEL ON BACK A.C.F.R. BLACK INK, J-AVLM99 J-AVLM9% 50
MICROPHONE TAB ON EACH SIDE ON FRONT) Part B
Specifications Section 14.16 23.59
Stearn'.s !42(-? Search {-\nd Rescue Life Vest Part 1426 STEARNS 1426 12 .
B Specifications Section 14.6 No Bid
WINTER COAT
SAFETY
o _as Estimated
Description SMART Part | MFG Part # | o .ouieies |  COSt
#
Occunomix Class 3 Hi Vis Yellow 3-in-1 Black Bottom Bomber
Jacket LUX-ETJBJR ( 3x3 ACFR IN LARGE GORILLA GRIP O-LUX-ETIBIR O-LUX-ETIBIR 50
LETTERS ON BACK) PartB
Specifications Section 14.16 37.52

WILDLAND PANT AND JACKET




A e s PLEXUS Part Estimated
Description 4 MFG Part # | quontties|  COSt
Overpants, , 6 oz Nomex with brass fly zipper, 2" scotchlight
trim. @ Cargo Pockets, 2 hip pockets, waistband closure
w/snap hook. Take-up leg at bottom, waistband closure w/ PA125648 PA12-5648 50
heavy snap hook. TOPPS BRAND Part B Specifications
Section 14.2 No Bid
Jacket (shirt) 6 oz Nomex, Long Style, yellow w/silver 2" trim.
Radio pocket on left front w/ flap. Bellowed breast pocket w/
flap. 2 bellowed lower pockets w/ fl.ap. Hook & loop closure 1K125648 IK12-5648 50
on sleeve cuff. Large collar, throat piece, hook & loop closure.
TOPPS BRAND Part B Specifications
Section 14.3 No Bid
Propper® Wildland Overpant, Waist Sizes: Small thru 3XL and
Length Options of Regular and Long. PartB F5299 50
Specifications Section 14.5 No Bid
Propper® Wildland Overshirt, Sizes: Smail thru 3XL and
Length Options of Regular and Long. Part F5307 50
B Specifications Section 14.6 No Bid
. . Estimated
Description GALLS Part #| MFG Part # | g ancties|  COSt
DE
LU.)fE S?BA MASIf BAG (BLACK) PartB FE674 SHG135 50
Specifications Section 14.8 No Bid
Lightning X Premium Firefighter Fireman XL Step-In Turnout
Fire Bu-nker Duty Gear Bag w/ Shoulder Strap & Front LXEB20-R 6
Operations Pockets - Red Part B
Specifications Section 14.9 No Bid
. . Estimated
Description GALLS Part #| MFG Part # | quaneries| COSt
Nameplate, SILVER, Black Lettering, Line # 1 employee first
initial and last name. Line # 2 Rank/Position. Clutch back
NTO35 SIL PLSH CB 60
attachment. Size: Length 2 3/8" x Height 1/2". Part B
Specifications Section 14.26 7.95
Nameplate, Gold, Black Lettering, Line # 1 employee first
initial and last name. Line # 2 Rank/Position, Clutch back
NTO035 GLD PLSH CB 30
attachment. Size: Length 2 3/8" x Height 1/2".
Part B Specifications Section 14.26 7.95

o £ £
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ATTENTION:

VENDOR
SHOULD
COMPLETE AND
SIGN EXHIBIT B

TO BE
CONSIDERED
RESPONSIVE




EXHIBIT B

Small Business Enterprise (SBE) Program Participation Form

BID NUMBER: 20-11: Annual Purchase of Fire Rescue Uniforms

OPTION 1

I certify that our Company is an Alachua County Certified Small Business Enterprise (SBE) registered prior
to the Bid opening. :

Circle One:

Yes (If yes, complete and sign the last page of this Exhibit)

If No, proceed to Option 2).

OPTION 2

1 certify that our Company will perform ALL work and that no subcontractors will be utilized for this bid.

Circle One:
@lf yes, complete and sign the last page of this Exhibit)

No (If No, proceed to Option 3.)
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EXHIBIT B
BID NUMBER: 20-11: Annual Purchase of Fire Rescue Uniforms

OPTION 3

SBE Participation. I certify that our Company has contacted the Alachua County’s Certified SBEs listed

below. I state that the following information regarding SBE Subcontractors is true and correct to the best of my
knowledge and belief.

Alachua County has adopted a 15% SBE participation goal and policies which encourage participation of Small
Business Enterprises (SBE) in the provision of labor, time, supplies, services or construction items of any kind
materials.

SBE:s are located in the Alachua County Small Business Enterprise Directory.

Subcontractor (any business entity holding a subcontract with the prime vendor) services are defined as, “a

contract with another business entity that obtains labor, time, supplies, services or construction items of any
kind.”

Vendors submitting bids under this solicitation are to identify the intended SBE subcontractors. These SBEs
have agreed to perform the work for the total dollar value and percentage of the bid set forth below.

If SBE subcontractors are not utilized and listed below, or if option 1 or 2 was not chosen, you must proceed
to Option 4 and document your Good Faith Effort. ‘

SBE Name of Contractor: \

Address: \ \

Scope of Work to be Performed: \ \

Total § Value: $ "\ \ % ofiTotal BID/RFR; %

SBE Name of Contra k \ \

Address: \ \ \ \\ \\

Scope of Work to be Petformed: A \ \ \\\ /)Y ’’’’’

Total $ Value: $ \ % of Tqtal BIDYRFP: \ %
SBE Name of Contractorx ‘ \ \\

Address: \ v\ \ \% \

Scope of Work to be Perfm\?\ed: \

Total $ Value: $ % of Total BID/RFP: %
SBE Name of Contractor:

Address: \

Scope of Work to be Performed:

Total $ Value: $ % of Total BID/RFP: %
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EXHIBIT B

BID NUMBER: 20-11 Annual Purchase of Fire Rescue Uniforms

OPTION 4

SBE Good Faith Effort, To be considered responsive all Vendors should have SBE Participation or
demonstrate a good faith effort to utilize SBE subcontractors. If option 1, 2 or 3 was not chosen the Vendor
should complete the section below substantiating compliance with good faith effort requirements.

In accordance with Section 22.36, of the Alachua County Procurement Code, I have solicited and received
responses from the following Alachua County certified SBE companies. (The SBE vendor’s response should be
recorded in the section below.)

Name of SBE Company: \
Date SBE Contacted: \
SBE Contact Name and Phone #:

Must be completed by. SBE Response when contact

AK
Name of SBE Company: / \ -

Date SBE Contacted: /
SBE Contact Name and Phone #: \\

Must be completed by. SBE @then cﬁac’ced \ /\

Name of SBE Company: \\ \

Date SBE Contacted: \ \

SBE Contact Name and Phone #: \ \ \ \

Must be completed by. SBE Respqnse when &ntacs \ \ \

Name of SBE Company:

Date SBE Contacted: ' "

SBE Contact Name and Phone #: \ \
Must be completed by. SBE Response\when contacted: \

Name of SBE Company:
Date SBE Contacted:
SBE Contact Name and Phone #:

Must be completed by. SBE Response when contacted:
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EXHIBIT B

BID NUMBER: 20-11: Annual Purchase of Fire Rescue Uniforms

1 as the undersigned Vendor certify that I have completed one of the option(s) below (Circle One):

OPTION 1 OPTION 2 OPTION 3 OPTION 4

If you are unable to certify that, you have completed to the best of your knowledge and belief OPTION 1,
OPTION 2, OPTION 3 or OPTION 4, CALL (48 hours prior to bid opening) Procurement at
352.374.5202, for direction.

Vendor Name: Dana Safety Supply Date: 23-September-2019

Signature: W\Qx{\ 8 /%mwub Title: Bids Specialist

Printed Name: Jonathan Sizemore
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EXHIBIT C

DRUG FREE WORKPLACE

Section 22.09 Competitive Sealed Bidding of the Alachua County Procurement Code states that in the
evaluation of bids, all factors in the bidding process being equal, both as to dollar amount and ability to
perform, priority will be given, first, to those vendors certifying a drug-free workplace, secondly, to certified
Small Business Enterprise (SBE) bidders.

The undersigned vendor in accordance with §287.087, Florida Statute and Section 22.09 of the Alachua County
Procurement Code hereby certifies that

Dana Safety Supply

Name of Business

Publish a statement notifying employees that the unlawful manufacture, distribution, dispensing,
possession or use of a controlled substance is prohibited in the workplace and specifying the actions that
will be taken against employees for violations of such prohibition.

Inform employees about the dangers of drug abuse in the workplace, the business's policy of
maintaining a drug-free workplace, any available drug counseling, rehabilitation, and employee
assistance programs, and the penalties that may be imposed upon employees for drug abuse violations.

Give each employee engaged in providing the commodities or contractual services that are under bid a
copy of the statement specified in subsection (1).

In the statement specified in subsection (1), notify the employees that, as a condition of working on the
commodities or contractual services that are under bid, the employee will abide by the terms of the
statement and will notify the employer of any conviction of, or plea of guilty or nolo contendere to, any
violation of Chapter 1893 or of any controlled substance law of the United States or any state, for a
violation occurring in the workplace no later than five (5) days after such conviction.

Impose a sanction on, or require the satisfactory participation in a drug abuse assistance or rehabilitation
program if such is available in the employee's community, by any employee who is so convicted.

Make a good faith effort to continue to maintain a drug-free workplace through implementation of this
section,

As the person authorized to sign the statement, I certify that this firm complies fully with the above

%M 1equ1rements

B}édel s Signature

23-September-2019

36




EXHIBIT D

PUBLIC RECORD DECLARATION OR CLAIM OF EXEMPTION

As a bidder or proposer, any document you submit to Alachua County may be a public record and be open for
personal inspection or copying by any person. In Florida ‘public records” are defined as all documents, papers,
letters, maps, books, tapes, photographs, films, sound recordings, data processing software, or other material,
regardless of the physical form, characteristics, or means of transmission, made or received pursuant to law or
ordinance or in connection with the transaction of official business by any agency. Section 119.011, F.S. A
document is subject to personal inspection and copying unless it falls under one of the public records
exemptions created under Florida law. Please designate what portion of your bid or proposal, if any, qualifies to
be exempt from inspection and copying:

(Execute either section I. or I, but not both; bidder may not modify language)

L NO EXEMPTION FROM PUBLIC RECORDS LAW

No part of the bid or proposal submitted is exempt from disclosure under the Florida public records law, Ch.
119, F.S.

Bidder’s Signature: %@M\L\\OA 9 !7%7’:0%/ Date: 23-September-2019

---OR---

IL EXEMPTION FROM PUBLIC RECORDS LAW AND AGREEMENT TO INDEMNIFY AND
DEFEND ALACHUA COUNTY

The following parts of the bid or proposal submitted are exempt from disclosure under the Florida public
records law because: (list exempt pal“7 and legal justification. i.e. trade secret):

)\ /]
ST

By claiming that all or part of tlZe bid or proposal is exempt from the public records law, the undersigned bidder
or proposer agrees to protect, defend, indemnify and hold the County, its officers, employees and agents free
and harmless from and against any and all claims arising out of a request to inspector copy the bid or proposal.
The undersigned bidder or proposer agrees to investigate, handle, respond to, provide defense (including
payment of attorney fees, court costs, and expert witness fees and expenses up to and including any appeal) for
and defend any such claim at its sole cost and expense through counsel chosen by the County and agrees to bear
all other costs and expenses related thereto, even if they (claims, etc.) are groundless, false, or fraudulent.

Bidder’s Signature: Date:
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IAN R

(813) 348-48656

DANA SAFETY SUPPLY
2310-AWEST OSBORNE AVE
TAMPA FL 33614

SHIP TO:

COUNTY ADMIN BUILDING
ALACHUA COUNTY PROCUREMENT
3RD FLOOR

12 SE1ST STREET

GAINESVILLE FL 32601

—

REF 1:Bid 20-11
REF 2:Ann Purchase of Fire Uniforms
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TRACKING #: 1Z 725 E34 01 5810 5815

BILLING: P/P

Fold here and place in label pouch
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