BID: 20-42 Annual Purchase of Drainage Infrastructure

Bid Item		Contech Engineered	County Materials	Ferguson Water Works	Gulf Atlantic Culvert	Metal Culverts
CORRUGATED METAL PIPE ALUMINIZED TYPE II MIT 15" DIA. GAUGE 16	ERE	D END SECTIONS 2 \$116.87	1:1 SLOPE WITH AN	\$237.00	\$100.30	\$99.40
18" DIA, GAUGE 16		\$163.00	no bid	\$282.00	\$137.78	\$125.80
24" DIA, GAUGE 16		\$529.70	no bid	\$390.00	\$210.45	\$187.60
36" DIA, GAUGE 14		\$614.88	no bid	\$780.00	\$539.68	\$384.65
48" DIA, GAUGE 14		\$1,039.20	no bid	\$1,025.00	\$1,166.24	\$601.15
CORDUCATED METAL ARCHIDIDE ALLIMINIZED TUDI		\$2,463.65	\$0.00	\$2,714.00	\$2,154.45	\$1,398.60
CORRUGATED METAL ARCH PIPE ALUMINIZED TYPI 17" DIA x13", GAUGE 16	S II N		no bid	no bid	0445.40	0111.00
		\$129.86			\$115.49	\$111.20
21" DIA x15", GAUGE 16		\$181.11	no bid	no bid	\$150.98	\$146.50
28" DIA x20", GAUGE 16		\$288.56	no bid	no bid	\$248.55	\$249.05
42" DIA x29", GAUGE 14		\$683.20	no bid	no bid	\$590.08	\$466.35
57" DIA x38", GAUGE 12		\$1,154.66	no bid	no bid	\$1,384.20	\$1,068.75
		\$2,437.39	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$2,489.30	\$2,041.85
CORRUGATED METAL ROUND PIPE ALUMINIZED TY	PE II	¢12.41	no hid	\$16.0E	¢11.45	\$10.64
15" DIA, GAUGE 16, 18" DIA, GAUGE 16,		\$13.41 \$16.00	no bid no bid	\$16.05 \$19.00	\$11.45 \$13.41	\$10.64 \$12.64
24" DIA, GAUGE 16,		\$21.37	no bid	\$25.65	\$17.75	\$16.91
36" DIA, GAUGE 14,		\$38.92	no bid	\$49.60	\$34.97	\$30.83
48" DIA, GAUGE 12,		\$51.90	no bid	\$64.00	\$60.98	\$57.10
		\$141.60	\$0.00	\$174.30	\$138.56	\$128.12
CORRUGATED METAL ARCH PIPE ALUMINIZED TYPI	ΞH	\$14.90	no bid	\$17.80	\$13.62	\$11.40
17" DIAx13",GAUGE 16, 21" DIAx15",GAUGE 16,		\$17.78	no bid	\$17.80	\$15.81	\$13.40
28" DIAx20",GAUGE 16,		\$23.45	no bid	\$28.05	\$21.56	\$18.05
42" DIAx29",GAUGE 14,		\$43.24	no bid	\$54.30	\$38.57	\$32.15
57" DIAx38",GAUGE 12,		\$57.67	no bid	\$70.00	\$65.78	\$58.68
CORDUCATED METAL DOUND DIDE DANCE AND ALLE	755	\$157.04	\$0.00	\$191.15	\$155.34	\$133.68
CORRUGATED METAL ROUND PIPE BANDS ALUMINI 15" DIA, GAUGE 18	ZED	TYPE II MINIMUM \$33.53	no bid	\$71.80	\$28.62	\$15.96
18" DIA, GAUGE 18		\$40.00	no bid	\$85.80	\$33.53	\$18.96
24" DIA, GAUGE 18		\$53.43	no bid	\$114.35	\$44.37	\$25.37
36" DIA, GAUGE 16		\$97.30	no bid	\$208.20	\$87.43	\$46.25
48" DIA, GAUGE 16		\$129.00	no bid	\$277.65	\$152.45	\$85.65
CORRUCATED METAL ARCHIDIDE DANING ALLIBERTATION	ED 7	\$353.26	\$0.00	\$757.80	\$346.40	\$192.19
CORRUGATED METAL ARCH PIPE BANDS ALUMINIZ 17" DIA X 13", GAUGE 18	ED I		no bid	#74.00	004.05	047.40
		\$33.53		\$71.80	\$34.05	\$17.10
21" DIA X 15", GAUGE 18		\$40.00	no bid	\$85.80	\$39.53	\$28.44
28" DIA X 20",GAUGE 18		\$53.43	no bid	\$114.35	\$53.90	\$27.08
42" DIA X 29", GAUGE 16		\$97.30	no bid	\$208.20	\$96.43	\$48.23
57" DIA X 38", GAUGE 16		\$129.00	no bid	\$277.65	\$164.45	\$88.02
		\$353.26	\$0.00	\$757.80	\$388.36	\$208.87
NEOPRENE GASKETS						
15" DIA, 3/8" x 7" NEOPRENE GASKETS		\$13.41	no bid	\$23.40	\$11.40	\$13.30
18" DIA, 3/8" x 7" NEOPRENE GASKETS		\$16.00	no bid	\$28.00	\$13.32	\$15.80
24" DIA, 3/8" x 7" NEOPRENE GASKETS			no bid			
,		\$21.37		\$37.25	\$17.12	\$21.15
36" DIA, 3/8" x 7" NEOPRENE GASKETS		\$38.92	no bid	\$67.85	\$24.92	\$30.85
48" DIA, 3/8"x 12" NEOPRENE GASKETS		\$51.90	no bid	\$90.35	\$32.66	\$67.40
			40.00			
DEDIFORCED CONCRETE CHI VERT DIRE ACTIVIDENT	TATA	\$141.60	\$0.00	\$246.85	\$99.42	\$148.50
REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE, ASTM DESIGN 15" DIA,	JNA	no bid	\$13.28	\$16.10	no bid	no bid
18" DIA,		no bid	\$18.76	\$19.55	no bid	no bid
24" DIA,		no bid	\$28.48	\$27.85	no bid	no bid
36" DIA,		no bid	\$56.52	\$54.65	no bid	no bid
48" DIA,		no bid	\$89.20	\$82.10	no bid	no bid
REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE, HORIZONTA	IE	\$0.00	\$206.24	\$200.25	\$0.00	\$0.00
12" X 18".	L E	no bid	\$22.36	, CLASS III. \$29.95	no bid	no bid
14" X 23",		no bid	\$26.62	\$32.65	no bid	no bid
19" X 30",		no bid	\$43.80	\$34.90	no bid	no bid
29" X 45",		no bid	\$88.20	\$117.15 \$105.00	no bid	no bid
38" X 60",		no bid \$0.00	\$141.20 \$322.18	\$195.00 \$409.65	no bid \$0.00	no bid \$0.00
DENVISOR CERT CONTROL						
REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE, HORIZONTA	L E					
15" X 18",		no bid	\$300.00	\$158.30	no bid	no bid
14" X 23", 19" X 30",		no bid no bid	\$340.00 \$440.00	\$185.70 \$242.85	no bid no bid	no bid no bid
19" X 30", 29" X 45",		no bid	\$1,600.00	\$242.85	no bid	no bid
38" X 60",		no bid	\$2,400.00	\$1,494.00	no bid	no bid
		\$0.00	\$5,080.00	\$3,080.35	\$0.00	\$0.00
REINFORCED CONCRETE CULVERT PIPE, ASTM DESIG	GNA					
15" DIA,		no bid	\$237.60	\$271.40 \$291.60	no bid	no bid
18" DIA, 24" DIA,		no bid no bid	\$289.60 \$381.60	\$291.60 \$308.30	no bid no bid	no bid no bid
36" DIA,		no bid	\$1,296.80	\$2,048.20	no bid	no bid
48" DIA,		no bid	\$2,006.40	\$3,136.00	no bid	no bid
Sub TOTAL		\$0.00	\$4,212.00	\$6,055.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
HIGH PERFORMANCE STORM DUAL WALL POLYPROI 15" DIA,	YLI	ENE (PP) PIPE, AAS no bid	SHTO DESIGNATION no bid	N M330 & ASTM F2881 \$9.71	no bid	no bid
15" DIA, 18" DIA,		no bid	no bid	\$9.71 \$12.81	no bid	no bid
34" DIA,		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
36" DIA,		no bid	no bid	\$36.81	no bid	no bid
48" DIA,		no bid	no bid	\$61.96	no bid	no bid
SUB Total		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$121.29	\$0.00	\$0.00
HIGH PERFORMANCE STORM DUAL WALL POLYPROI	ovi i	ENE (DD) DIDE AAC	HTO DESIGNATION	N M330 & ACTM E2001 NATT	ERED END SECTION	NS 4:1 SLODE
15" DIA.	1 Ll	no bid	no bid	N M330 & AS1M F2881 – M11 \$270.50	no bid	no bid
18" DIA,		no bid	no bid	\$405.70	no bid	no bid
34" DIA,		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
36" DIA, 48" DIA.		no bid no bid	no bid no bid	\$842.00 \$1,547.00	no bid no bid	no bid no bid
Sub TOTAL		*0.00	0.00	\$1,547.00 \$3.065.20	no bid 0.00	*0.00
OUD TOTAL		ψ0.00	Ψ0.00	ψ0,000.20	Ψ0.00	ψ0.00
		ADD/I	Deleted Items			

ADD/Deleted Items										
HIGH PERFORMANCE STORM DUAL WALL POLYPROPYLENE (PP) PIPE, AASHTO DESIGNATION M330 & ASTM F2881										
60" DIA,				\$105.00						